
1 
 

 

CONNECTICUT STATE FIRE SAFETY CODE 

Part I—Administrative 

Sec. 100 Title and applicability. 
 
Sec. 100.1 The Connecticut State Fire Safety Code and the adopted standards, as amended, 
shall be known as the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code, hereinafter referred to as “the code” 
or “this code”. 
 
Sec. 100.2 If a section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this code is, for any reason, 
held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of 
this code. 

 
Sec. 100.3 In the event any part or provision of this code is held to be illegal or void, this shall not 
have the effect of making void or illegal any of the other parts or provisions of this code that are 
determined to be legal, and it shall be presumed that this code would have been adopted without 
such illegal or void parts or provisions. 

 
Sec. 100.4 Nothing in this code shall be construed to prohibit a better type of building construction, 
an additional means of egress, or an otherwise safer condition than that specified by the minimum 
requirements of this code.      
 
Sec. 100.5 The provisions of the code shall only apply to detached private dwellings occupied by 
one or two families and townhouses with respect to smoke alarms and carbon monoxide detectors 
as specified in the Connecticut State Building Code and subject to the specific inspection criteria 
for smoke detection and warning equipment of section 29-305 of the Connecticut General 
Statutes. 
 
Sec. 100.6 Buildings designed, constructed and occupied in accordance with the provisions of 
the 2015 International Residential Code portion of the Connecticut State Building Code, including 
tents and membrane structures, shall be deemed single-family dwellings for the application of this 
code and section 29-305 of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
Sec. 100.7 The Connecticut State Fire Safety Code shall not apply to portable grandstands or 
bleachers providing seating for fewer than 100 persons located outside of a building. 
 
Sec. 100.8 The Connecticut State Fire Safety Code shall not apply to any federal agency 
performing construction or operating on federally owned land or on leased land totally under the 
control of the federal government. 
 
Sec. 100.9 Public service companies. This code shall not apply to the installation, alteration or 
repair of generation, transmission, distribution, metering or other related equipment that is under 
the ownership or control of a public service company as defined in section 16-1 of the Connecticut 



2 
 

General Statutes. 
 
Sec. 100.10 The Connecticut State Fire Safety Code shall be administered as provided in chapter 
541 of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
Sec. 102 Adopted standard. 
 
Sec. 102.1 Part III – New construction, renovation, or change of use and new buildings.  
For those for which a permit was issued on or after January 1, 2006.   The following standard 
is hereby adopted as amended in this code as Part III of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code: 
 

International Fire Code® of the International Code Council, Inc., 2021 edition, except as 
amended, altered or deleted and by the addition of certain provisions as indicated in this 
code. 

 
The International Fire Code® is available from the International Code 
Council, Inc., 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-
5795; 1-888-422-7233; www.iccsafe.org. 

 
Sec. 102.2 Existing buildings/occupancies for which a permit was issued before January 
1, 2006.  The following standard is hereby adopted as amended herein as Part IV of the 
Connecticut State Fire Safety Code, except as amended, altered or deleted and by the addition 
of certain provisions as indicated in this code: 
 

NFPA 101, Life Safety Code®, 2021 edition, with annexes promulgated by 
the National Fire Protection Association. 

 
NFPA standards are available from the National Fire Protection 
Association, One Batterymarch Park, Quincy, MA  02269-9101; 1-800-344-
3555; www.nfpa.org. 

 
Sec. 102.3 Connecticut amendment conventions. The model codes adopted in Sections 102.1 
and 102.2 are amended to meet the needs of the state of Connecticut as identified by the following 
conventions: 
 
(a) A section or subsection in the Connecticut Amendments preceded by “Amd” indicates the 

substitution of the provision. 

(b) A section or subsection in the Connecticut Amendments preceded by “Del” indicates the 
deletion of the provision. 

(c) A section or subsection in the Connecticut Amendments preceded by “Add” indicates the 
addition of the provision. 

 
Sec. 103 Authority having jurisdiction. 
(a) For the purposes of the standards adopted by reference by this code, the authority having 

jurisdiction (AHJ) shall mean the State Fire Marshal regarding the proper administration, 
application, interpretation and modification of the requirements contained within the 
Connecticut State Fire Safety Code. 
 



3 
 

(b) The local fire marshal shall make the initial determination concerning compliance with the 
Connecticut State Fire Safety Code, except as expressly provided in the wording of a 
section or in subsection (c) of this section. A decision of a local fire marshal may be 
appealed to the Codes and Standards Committee as provided in subsection (d) of this 
section. 

 
(c) The State Fire Marshal shall make the determination concerning compliance with the 

Connecticut State Fire Safety Code on state-owned property. 
 
(d) A decision of the local fire marshal or State Fire Marshal may be appealed to the Codes 

and Standards Committee in accordance with section 29-309 of the Connecticut General 
Statutes. 

 
Sec. 104 Plan submittal and review. 
Detailed plans and specifications for new structures and additions, renovations or alterations to 
existing structures shall be submitted by the applicant to the local fire marshal having jurisdiction 
to demonstrate compliance with section 29-263 of the Connecticut General Statutes and this 
code. 
 
Sec. 105 Building permit approval. 
The local fire marshal shall provide to the local building official certification in writing prior to the 
issuance of a building permit that the construction documents for any building, structure or use 
subject to the requirements of this code are in substantial compliance with the requirements of 
this code. Because of the 30-day time limit imposed by section 29-263 of the Connecticut General 
Statutes, the fire marshal shall notify the building official whether there is substantial compliance 
within that time period. 
 
Sec. 106 Variations or exemptions. 
In accordance with section 29-296 of the Connecticut General Statutes, the State Fire Marshal 
may modify the requirements of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code where the State Fire 
Marshal deems that strict compliance would entail practical difficulty or unnecessary hardship, or 
is otherwise adjudged unwarranted, provided any such variation or exemption or approved 
equivalent or alternative compliance shall, in the opinion of the State Fire Marshal, secure the 
public safety. 
 
Sec. 107 Inspections. 

(a) Each local fire marshal, the State Fire Marshal and their respective designees shall 
conduct inspections as prescribed in section 29-305 of the Connecticut General Statutes 
of buildings and facilities regulated by the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code within their 
jurisdictions. 

(b) Each local fire marshal, the State Fire Marshal and their respective designees may 
conduct inspections as often as may be necessary during the construction of new 
buildings, structures or additions, and during the course of renovations, alterations or 
modernizations for the purpose of satisfying themselves that all work is in accordance with 
the approved plans, specifications and this code. 

(c) The minimum requirements for the frequency of inspections as prescribed in section 29-
305 of the Connecticut General Statutes shall be as follows: (Note: the definitions for the 
classification of the occupancies is found in Part III, Section 202 of this code.)   



4 
 

1. Annual inspections for the occupancy classifications all R Residential, A-1, A-2, E, H-1, 
I-1, M selling consumer fireworks (1.4G), H-3 containing consumer fireworks (1.4G).   

2. Inspections every two years for the occupancy classifications A-3, H-2, I-2, I-3, I-4, B-
Medical, B-College. 

3. Inspections every three years for the occupancy classifications B, H-3, M, S-1, A-4, A-
5. 

4. Inspections every four years for the occupancy classifications F-1, F-2, H-4, H-5, S-2, 
U. 

 
Sec. 108 Acceptance of building official reports. 
The State Fire Marshal or local fire marshal may accept the reports of the building official 
concerning a code compliance review or inspection in lieu of conducting the review or inspection 
himself or herself. 
 
Sec. 109 Certificate of occupancy approval. 
The local fire marshal shall provide to the local building official certification in writing that prior to 
the occupancy of any building, structure or use subject to the requirements of this code, such 
building, structure or use is in substantial compliance with the requirements of this code. 
 
Sec. 110 Application. 

(a) Part I of this code shall apply to all occupancies and uses located within a building or 
structure. 

(b) For building permit applications made on or after the effective date of this code, Part III of 
this code shall apply to: 

(1) The design and construction of new buildings, structures or portions thereof,  

(2) Buildings, structures or portions thereof undergoing repairs, alterations and 
additions,  

(3) Buildings, structures or portions thereof undergoing a change of occupancy or use 
as specified in “Changes of Occupancy or Use” in Part I of this code, and 

(4) For existing occupancies subject to an abatement order for violations of Part IV of 
this code, only new fire protection systems, and electrical and mechanical system 
work. 

(c) Part III of this code shall be applicable to buildings, structures or portions thereof for which 
application for a building permit was made on or after January 1, 2006.  For those 
buildings, structures, or portions thereof which are under the purview of an edition of the 
Connecticut State Fire Safety Code promulgated on or after January 1, 2006, which 
contains requirements that are different than those of this code, the requirements of the 
previous edition of the code shall prevail unless one of the provisions   of this section 
applies. 

(d) Part IV of this code shall only apply to occupancies and uses located within buildings and 
structures or portions thereof that existed prior to January 1, 2006.  

 
Sec. 111 Changes of occupancy or use. 
In any building, structure or portion thereof, whether or not a physical alteration is needed, a 
change made in the use or occupancy that would place the building or structure in a different 



5 
 

division of the same group or occupancy or in a different group of occupancies shall not be 
permitted unless the structure, building or portion thereof conforms with the requirements of this 
code that apply to new construction for the proposed new use. A change of tenants or ownership 
shall not be construed to be a change of occupancy classification where the nature of use and 
assigned occupancy classification remain the same. 

 
Sec. 112 Abatement of hazards; penalty. 
(a) The local fire marshal for the fire marshal’s respective jurisdiction or the State Fire Marshal 
shall order conditions contrary to the provisions of this code to be remedied in accordance with 
Section 29-291c of the Connecticut General Statutes.  An order to vacate all or part of a building 
may be issued by a local fire marshal or local police officer in accordance with section 29-306 of 
the Connecticut General Statues when there exists in a building a risk of death or injury from (1) 
blocked, insufficient or impeded egress, (2) failure to maintain or the shutting off of any fire 
protection or fire warning system required by the Fire Safety Code or State Fire Prevention Code, 
(3) the storage of any flammable or explosive material without a permit or in quantities in excess 
of any allowable limits pursuant to a permit, (4) the use of any firework or pyrotechnic device 
without a permit, or (5) exceeding the occupancy limit established by the State Fire Marshal or a 
local fire marshal.  The penalty for the failure to remedy or abate such hazards shall be as 
prescribed in section 29-291c of the Connecticut General Statutes.    

(b) Pursuant to section 29-291c of the Connecticut General Statutes, Section 113 of this code 
lists those sections of this code for which a citation may be issued. 
 
 
Sec. 113 Enforcement by Citation 

 
(Add) 113.1 Enforcement by citation.  The following chapters or sections of this code may be 
enforced through the use of the citation process pursuant to section 29-291c of the Connecticut 
General Statutes. 
 
Chapter/Section Subject Matter 
Part III - Section 105 
Part IV - see CSFPC, 
Section 1.12 
 

Operating without a permit required by local ordinance 

Part III - Section 806.1 
Part IV - Section 
10.3.9.2.1 
 

Provisions for cut Christmas trees 
 

Part III - Section 901.6 
Part IV - Sections 9.6 and 
9.11 

Failure to maintain or the shutting off of any fire protection or fire 
warning system required by the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code 

Part III - Section 1003.6 
Part IV - Section 7.1.10 
 

Blocked, insufficient or impeded egress 

Part III - Section 3301 
Part IV - Section 4.6.10 

Safeguards during building construction, alteration, and demolition 
operations 
 

Part III - Section 1004.9 
Part IV - Section 13.7.9.3 

Exceeding the established occupancy limit- assembly occupancies 



6 
 

 

Part III - Section 5609.1 
Part IV - Section 
37.4.5.3.1 
 

Storage and display of sparklers and fountains 
 

Part III - Chapter 35 
Part IV - see CSFPC, 
Chapter 41 
 

Hot work operations  
 

Part III - Section 607.3  
Part IV - Section 9.2.3 

Procedures for use and maintenance of commercial cooking 
equipment 
 

Part III - Section 308.2, 
see also CSFPC Sections 
20.1.5.3 and 65.4 
Part IV - Section 13.7.3, 
see also CSFPC Sections 
20.1.5.3 and 65.4 
 

Flame effects before an audience 

Part III - Chapter 56 
Part IV - Section 
37.4.5.3.1 
 

Sale, handling, and storage of fireworks, sparklers, and fountains  
 

Part III - N/A 
Part IV - see CSFPC, 
Section 69.3.13.1 
 

Patio heaters 
 

Part III - Section 6106  
Part IV - see CSFPC, 
Section 69.4.1.3 
 

Filling a liquified petroleum (LP) container without the permission of 
the owner 

 
 
  



7 
 

 

Part II—Reserved 

 
 

  



8 
 

 

PART III  CONNECTICUT STATE FIRE SAFETY CODE 
 

 

Amendments to the 2021 International Fire Code 
 
 

PART 1 
GENERAL PROVISIONS 

 
 

C H A P T E R  1  

SCOPE & ADMINISTRATION 
 

SECTION 101 
SCOPE & GENERAL REQUIREMENTS 

 
(Amd) 101.1 Title.  Part III of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code and the adopted 
standards, as amended, shall be known as Part III of the Connecticut State Fire Safety 
Code, hereinafter referred to as “the code” or “this code”. 
                                                                 
(Add) 101.1.1 Adopted standard. The following standard, including selected 
appendices, is hereby adopted as amended herein as Part III of the Connecticut State 
Fire Safety Code:   
 

International Fire Code® of the International Code Council, Inc., 2021 edition 
except as amended, altered or deleted and by the addition of certain provisions as 
indicated in this code. 
 
The following appendices are adopted as part of this code: Appendices D, H, I, 
and N, as amended.  
 
The following appendices are permitted to be used as guidance: Appendices B, E, 
F, G, and J, as amended. 
 
International Fire Code® is available from the International Code Council, Inc., 
4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795; 1-888-422-7233; 
www.iccsafe.org.  

 
(Add) 101.1.1.1 Classification of occupancy and use. Both the fire code official and the 
building code official shall jointly determine the classification of occupancy and use.  The 
provisions for the classification of occupancy and use are found in Chapter 13, 
Occupancy Classification and Use.    
 



9 
 

(Add) 101.1.2 Connecticut amendment conventions.  The model codes adopted in 
102.1 and 102.2 are amended to meet the needs of the state of Connecticut as identified 
by the following conventions: 

(a) A section or subsection in the Connecticut Amendments preceded by “Amd” 
indicates the substitution of the provision. 

(b) A section or subsection in the Connecticut Amendments preceded by “Del” 
indicates the deletion of the provision. 

(c) A section or subsection in the Connecticut Amendments preceded by “Add” 
indicates the addition of the provision. 

 
(Add) 101.1.3 Nothing in this code shall be construed to prohibit a better type of building 
construction, an additional means of egress, or an otherwise safer condition than that 
specified by the minimum requirements of this code.     
 
(Del) 101.2 Scope. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 101.3 Purpose. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 101.4 Severability. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 101.5 Validity. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
 

SECTION 102 
APPLICABILITY 

 
(Amd) 102.1 Application. This part of the code shall apply to all buildings, structures, or 
portions thereof, facilities or processes, for which application for an initial building permit 
was made on or after January 1, 2006, as outlined below, except as specifically provided 
for in the wording of a section.     
 
(a) For initial building permit applications made on or after the effective date of this code, 

this code shall apply to: 

(1) The design and construction of new buildings, structures, facilities or 
portions thereof. 

(2) Buildings, structures, or portions thereof; or conditions undergoing repairs, 
alterations, and additions. 

(3) Buildings, structures, or portions thereof; undergoing a change of 
occupancy or use as specified in “Change of occupancy or use” in 102.3 of 
this code. 

(4) Except as expressly provided for in the wording of a section, it shall also be 
applicable to facilities or conditions for which application for the initial 
building permit was made on or after January 1, 2006. 

(5) For existing occupancies subject to an abatement order for violations of Part 



10 
 

IV of this code or the Connecticut State Fire Prevention Code, only new fire 
protection systems, and electrical and mechanical system work. 

(e) For those buildings, structures, facilities, or portions thereof, that are under the 
purview of an edition of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code promulgated on or 
after December 31, 2005 but before the adoption of this code subject to 
requirements that are different than those of this code, the requirements of the 
previous edition of the code shall prevail.  

Notes:  
 
Pursuant to section 29-291a of the Connecticut General 
Statutes, the Connecticut State Fire Prevention Code 
shall be applicable for oil burners, flammable and 
combustible liquids, gas equipment and piping, liquefied 
gas and liquefied natural gas, hazardous chemicals, 
and processes and activities that occur in the building 
or structure that are not used to support the building 
components services or systems 
 
Part IV of this code shall apply to buildings, structures, 
facilities, or portions thereof, or conditions that existed 
prior to January 1, 2006. 

                                                                                         
(Add) 102.1.1 Alternative compliance.  Any existing building or portion thereof, 
structure, evaluated and determined by the fire marshal in conjunction with the building 
official to be in compliance with the 2021 International Existing Building Code portion of 
the Connecticut State Building Code, shall be deemed to be in compliance with this code.  
For buildings or structures constructed under an original application of permit prior to 
January 1, 2006, those portions of an existing building or structure not affected by 
alteration, addition, or change of occupancy shall comply with Part IV of this code. For 
buildings or structures constructed under an application of permit on or after to January 
1, 2006, those portions of the building or structure not affected by alteration, addition, or 
change of occupancy shall comply with the applicable requirements of the Connecticut 
State Fire Safety Code under which it was constructed.  Regardless of any wording in the 
2021 International Existing Building Code portion of the Connecticut State Building Code, 
the means of egress in existing buildings shall meet the requirements of the Part IV of 
this code for the proposed occupancy.   
                                                                                                                               
(Add) 102.1.1.1 Emergency responder communication coverage in existing 
buildings. Regardless of any wording in the 2021 International Existing Building Code 
portion of the Connecticut State Building Code, emergency responder communication 
coverage in existing buildings shall meet the requirements of this section. Existing 
buildings other than Group R-3, that do not have approved in-building, two-way 
emergency response communication coverage for emergency responders in the building 
based on existing coverage levels of the public safety communication systems, shall be 
equipped with such coverage according to one of the following: 



11 
 

1. Where an existing wired communication system cannot be repaired or is being 
replaced, or where not approved in accordance with Section 510.1, Exception 1. 

2. Within a time frame established by the authority having jurisdiction. 

Exception: Where it is determined by the fire code official that the in-
building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system 
is not needed. 

 
(Add) 102.1.2 Grandstands and bleachers.  The Connecticut State Fire Safety Code 
shall not apply to portable grandstands or bleachers providing seating for fewer than 100 
persons located outside of a building.       
 
(Add) 102.1.3 Federal agency.  The Connecticut State Fire Safety Code shall not apply 
to any federal agency performing construction or operating on federally owned land or on 
leased land totally under the control of the federal government. 
 
(Amd) 102.1.4 Public service companies.   This code shall not apply to the installation, 
alteration or repair of generation, transmission, distribution, metering or other related 
equipment that is under the ownership or control of a public service company as defined 
in section 16-1 of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
                                                                                                                             
(Add) 102.2 Administrative, operational and maintenance provisions.  The 
administrative, operational and maintenance provisions of this code shall be administered 
as provided in chapter 541 of the Connecticut General Statutes and shall apply to 
buildings, structures, facilities, or portions thereof and conditions arising after January 1, 
2006. 
 
(Amd) 102.3 Change of use or occupancy.  A change of occupancy shall not be made 
unless the use or occupancy is made to comply with the requirements of this code and 
the 2021 International Building Code portion of the Connecticut State Building Code.  A 
change of tenants or ownership shall not be construed to be a change of occupancy 
classification where the nature of the use and assigned occupancy classification remain 
the same. 
 
(Amd) 102.5 Application of residential code.  Where structures are designed, 
constructed, and occupied in accordance with the 2021 International Residential Code 
portion of the Connecticut State Building Code the provisions of this code shall only apply 
to detached private dwellings occupied by one or two families and townhouses with 
respect to smoke alarms and carbon monoxide detectors as specified in the Connecticut 
State Building Code and subject to the specific inspection criteria for smoke detection and 
warning equipment of section 29-305 of the Connecticut General Statutes. Tents and 
membrane structures erected on such sites shall not be regulated by the Connecticut 
State Fire Safety Code. 
 
(Del) 102.6 Historic buildings. Delete section.  
 
(Del) 102.8 Subjects not regulated by this code. Delete section. 



12 
 

 
(Amd) 102.9 Matters not provided for. See section 29-306 of the Connecticut General 
Statutes. 
 
(Add) 102.13 Building Code. Any references within the body of this code to the 
International Building Code shall be considered references to the 2021 edition of the 
International Building Code portion of the Connecticut State Building Code. 
 
(Add) 102.14 Gas. The International Fuel Gas Code is not adopted by this code. Any 
references to the International Fuel Gas Code within the body of this code shall be 
considered references to requirements of NFPA 54, National Fuel Gas Code; NFPA 2, 
Hydrogen Technologies Code; and NFPA 58, Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code.   
 
(Add) 102.15 Electrical. Any references within the body of this code to the National 
Electrical Code shall be considered references to the 2020 edition of NFPA 70, National 
Electrical Code portion of the Connecticut State Building Code.  
 
(Add) 102.16 Mechanical Code. Any references within the body of this code to the 
International Mechanical Code shall be considered references to the 2021 edition of the 
International Mechanical Code portion of the Connecticut State Building Code. 
 
 

PART 2 
ADMINISTRATION and ENFORCEMENT 

 
 

(Del) SECTION 103 
CODE COMPLIANCE AGENCY 

 
Delete section in its entirety 

 
 

SECTION 104 
DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE FIRE CODE OFFICIAL (FIRE MARSHAL) 

 
 
(Amd) 104.1 Authority having jurisdiction. 
 

(a)  For the purposes of this code and the standards adopted by reference in this 
code, the authority having jurisdiction shall mean the State Fire Marshal regarding 
the proper administration, application, interpretation and modification of the 
requirements contained within this code. 

(b)  The local fire marshal shall make the initial determination concerning 
compliance with this code, except as expressly provided in the wording of a section 
or in subsection (c) of this section.  A decision of a local fire marshal may be 
appealed to the State Fire Marshal as provided in subsection (d) of this section. 



13 
 

(c)  The State Fire Marshal shall make determinations concerning compliance with 
this code on state-owned property.                 

(d)  A decision of the local fire marshal or State Fire Marshal may be appealed to 
the Codes and Standards Committee in accordance with section 29-309 of the 
Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
Note: The terms “fire code official” and “fire marshal” shall have the same meaning.   

 
(Amd) 104.2 Applications and permits.  The fire code official is authorized to receive 
applications, review construction documents and issue permits for operations regulated 
by this code, inspect premises for which such construction documents were prepared for, 
and enforce compliance with the provisions of this code.   
 
(Add) 104.2.1 Plan submittal and review. Detailed plans and specifications for new 
buildings, structures and additions, renovations or alterations to existing structures, 
equipment, and systems regulated by this code shall be submitted by the applicant to the 
local fire marshal having jurisdiction or the State Fire Marshal as applicable to 
demonstrate compliance with section 29-263 of the Connecticut General Statutes and 
this code. Pursuant to the requirements of section 29-263 of the Connecticut General 
Statutes, such documents shall be accompanied by evidence of licensure.  
 
(Add) 104.2.1.1 Information on construction documents.  Construction documents 
shall be drawn to scale on suitable material.  Electronic media documents may be 
submitted where approved by the fire code official.  Construction documents shall be of 
sufficient clarity to indicate the location, nature and extent of the work proposed and show 
in detail that such work will conform to the provisions of this code and relevant laws, 
ordinances, rules, and regulations as determined by the fire code official.      
 
(Add) 104.2.1.2 Amended construction documents.  Work shall be completed in 
accordance with the approved construction documents, and any changes made during 
construction that are not in compliance with the approved construction documents shall 
be resubmitted for approval as an amended set of construction documents. 
 
(Add) 104.2.1.3 Means of egress.  The construction documents shall show in sufficient 
detail the location, construction, size, and character of all portions of the means of egress 
including the path of the exit discharge to the public way in compliance with the provisions 
of this code.  In other than occupancies in Groups R-2, R-3, and I-1, the construction 
documents shall designate the number of occupants to be accommodated on every floor, 
and in all rooms and spaces. For those occupancies utilizing the Small I-2 provisions, the 
construction documents shall designate the locations of the client areas and beds. 
 
(Add) 104.2.1.4 Fire protection system shop drawings. Shop drawings for the fire 
protection system(s) shall be submitted to indicate compliance with this code, and 
applicable referenced standards and the construction documents, and shall be approved 
prior to the start of installation. Shop drawings shall contain all information as required by 
the referenced installation standards in Chapter 80.   



14 
 

 
(Add) 104.2.1.5 Fire sprinkler system shop drawings. Shop drawings for fire sprinkler 
system(s) shall be submitted to indicate conformance with this code and the construction 
documents and shall be approved prior to the start of system installation.  Shop drawings 
shall contain all information as required by the referenced installation standards in 
Chapter 80. Pursuant to section 29-263a of the Connecticut General Statutes, such 
documents shall be accompanied by evidence of licensure as a fire sprinkler system 
layout technician in accordance with section 20-304a of the Connecticut General 
Statutes, or a professional engineer licensed in accordance with chapter 391 of the 
Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Add) 104.2.1.6 Fire alarm system shop drawings.  Shop drawings for fire alarm 
system(s) shall be submitted to indicate conformance with this code and the construction 
documents and shall be approved prior to the start of system installation.  Shop drawings 
shall contain all information as required by the referenced installation standards in 
Chapter 80.  Pursuant to section 29-263a of the Connecticut General Statutes, such 
documents shall be accompanied by evidence of licensure, if applicable, in accordance 
with section 20-304a of the Connecticut General Statutes, as a professional engineer 
licensed in accordance with chapter 391 of the Connecticut General Statutes.  
 
(Add) 104.2.1.7 Examination of documents.  The fire code official shall examine or 
cause to be examined the accompanying construction documents and shall ascertain by 
such examination whether the work indicated and described is in accordance with the 
requirements of this code. 
 
(Add) 104.2.1.8 Approved documents.  Construction documents approved by the fire 
code official are approved with the intent that such construction documents comply in all 
respects with this code.  Review and approval by the fire code official shall not relieve the 
applicant of the responsibility of compliance with this code. 
                                                                
(Add) 104.2.1.9 Building permit approval.  The local fire marshal shall provide to the 
local building official certification in writing prior to the issuance of a building permit that 
the construction documents for any building, structure or use subject to the requirements 
of this code are in substantial compliance with the requirements of this code.  Because of 
the 30-day time limit imposed by section 29-263 of the Connecticut General Statutes, the 
local fire marshal shall notify the building official whether there is substantial compliance 
within that time period. 
 
(Add) 104.2.2 Changes of occupancy or use. In any building, structure, or portion 
thereof, whether or not a physical alteration is needed, a change made in the use or 
occupancy that would place the building or structure in a different division of the same 
group or occupancy or in a different group of occupancies shall not be permitted unless 
the structure, building or portion thereof conforms with the requirements of this code that 
apply to new construction for the proposed new use. A change of tenants or ownership 
shall not be construed to be a change of occupancy classification where the nature of use 
and assigned occupancy classification remain the same. 



15 
 

 
(Amd) 104.3 Inspections and right of entry. See section 29-305 of the Connecticut 
General Statutes. 
 
(Del) 104.3.1 Warrant. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 104.6 Official records. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Add) 104.6 Official records. See section 29-305 of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Del) 104.7 Liability. Delete section in its entirety.   
 
(Amd) 104.9 Modifications, variations, or exemptions.  In accordance with section 29-
296 of the Connecticut General Statutes, the State Fire Marshal may modify the 
requirements of the Connecticut State Fire Safety Code where the State Fire Marshal 
deems strict compliance would entail practical difficulty or unnecessary hardship, or is 
otherwise adjudged unwarranted, provided any such variation or exemption or approved 
equivalent or alternative compliance shall, in the opinion of the State Fire Marshal, secure 
the public safety. 
 
(Del) 104.11 Fire investigations. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 104.11 Authority at fires and other emergencies. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
 

SECTION 105 
PERMITS 

 
 
(Amd) 105.1 General. A municipality or fire district, by ordinance, may establish 
requirements and a fee schedule for construction document review, permits, certificates, 
notices, approvals, and orders pertaining to fire control and fire hazards pursuant to 
Section 105 of this code. The local fire marshal shall issue such permits, certificates, 
notices, approvals and orders. Permits shall be issued in accordance with Sections 
105.1.1 to 105.7.25 inclusive. 
 
(Amd) 105.1.1 Permits required. A property owner or the owner’s authorized agent who 
intends to conduct an operation or business regulated by this code, shall first make 
application to the local fire marshal and obtain the required permit. 
 
(Amd) 105.1.2 Types of permits. The permits prescribed in Section 105.1.1 shall be 
operational permits. An operational permit allows the applicant to have an occupancy or 
conduct an operation or business for which a permit is required by Section 105.6 for 
either: 

a) A prescribed period as specified by the local fire marshal, or 



16 
 

b) Until such permit is renewed or revoked. 
 
(Del) 105.1.4 Emergency repairs. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 105.1.5 Repairs.  Delete section. 
 
(Del) 105.1.6 Annual permit.  Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 105.2.3 Time limitation of application. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 105.2.4 Action on application. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 105.3 Conditions of a permit. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Amd) 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 to 105.5.52, 
inclusive, where specified by ordinance. 
 
(Amd) 105.5.16 Explosives.  See sections 29-343 to 29-355a, inclusive, of the 
Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Amd) 105.5.34 Open burning. See section 23-48 of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Amd) 105.5.42 Pyrotechnic special effects material.  See sections 29-356 to 29-366, 
inclusive, of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Add) 105.5.53 Additional operational permits. In addition to the requirements of 
Sections 105.5.2 to 105.5.52, inclusive, permits to operate an occupancy for a use for a 
building shall be required.  
 
 (Del) 105.6 Required construction permits. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 107.3 Permit valuation. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 107.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Delete section.  
 
(Del) 107.5 Related fees. Delete section.  
 
(Amd) 108.1 Inspection authority. Each local fire marshal, the State Fire Marshal, or 
their respective designees, shall conduct inspections as prescribed in section 29-305 of 
the Connecticut General Statutes, of buildings and facilities regulated by this code within 
their jurisdictions. Each local fire marshal, the State Fire Marshal, or their respective 
designees, may conduct inspections as often as may be necessary during the 
construction of new buildings, structures or additions, or processes, and during the course 
of renovations, alterations or modernizations for the purpose of satisfying themselves that 
all work is in accordance with the approved plans, specifications and this code. 



17 
 

 
(Amd) 108.2 Inspections.  

(a) Each local fire marshal, the State Fire Marshal, or their respective designees, shall 
conduct inspections as prescribed in section 29-305 of the Connecticut General 
Statutes, of buildings and facilities regulated by the Connecticut State Fire Safety 
Code within their jurisdictions. 

(b) Each local fire marshal, the State Fire Marshal, or their respective designees, may 
conduct inspections as often as may be necessary during the construction of new 
buildings, structures or additions, and during the course of renovations, alterations 
or modernizations for the purpose of satisfying themselves that all work is in 
accordance with the approved plans, specifications and this code. 

(c) The minimum requirements for the frequency of inspections as prescribed in 
section 29-305 of the Connecticut General Statutes shall be as follows:  

(1)  Annual inspections for the occupancy classifications all R Residential, A-1, A-
2, E, H-1, I-1, I-2 including small I-2, M selling consumer fireworks [sparklers 
and fountains] (1.4G), H-3 containing consumer fireworks [sparklers and 
fountains] (1.4G).   

(2) Inspections every two years for the occupancy classifications A-3, H-2, I-3, I-4, 
B-Medical, B-College, Ambulatory Health Care. 

(3) Inspections every three years for occupancy classifications B, H-3, M, S-1, A-
4, A-5. 

(4) Inspections every four years for the occupancy classifications F-1, F-2, H-4, H-
5, S-2, U. 

 
(Amd) 108.3 Concealed work. It shall be the duty of the permit applicant, or the 
applicant’s authorized agent, to cause the work to remain visible and able to be accessed 
for inspection purposes. Where any installation subject to inspection prior to use is 
covered or concealed without having first been inspected, the fire code official shall have 
the authority to require that such work be made visible and able to be accessed for 
inspection. Neither the fire code official nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense 
entailed in the removal or replacement of any material required to allow inspection.      

 

(Add) 108.5 Acceptance of building official reports. The State Fire Marshal or local 
fire marshal may accept the reports of the building official concerning a code compliance 
review or inspection in lieu of conducting the review or inspection himself or herself. 
 
(Add) 108.6 Certificate of occupancy approval. The local fire marshal shall provide to 
the local building official certification in writing that prior to the occupancy of any building, 
structure or use subject to the requirements of this code, such building, structure or use 
is in substantial compliance with the requirements of this code. 
 
(Add) 108.6.1 Notification of inspection results. Notification as to the passage or 
failure, in whole or in part, of any required inspection shall be made in writing by the fire 
code official or his/her duly authorized representative and shall be left at the job site, 
electronically sent, or delivered to the building permit holder or their authorized agent.   It 



18 
 

shall be the duty of the building permit holder to ascertain the results of the required 
inspection.   
 
 

SECTION 109 
MAINTENANCE 

 
(Add) 109.5.1 Order to vacate. An order to vacate all or part of a building may be issued 
by a local fire marshal or local police officer in accordance with section 29-306 of the 
Connecticut General Statutes, when there exists in a building a risk of death or injury from 
(1) blocked, insufficient or impeded egress, (2) failure to maintain or the shutting off of 
any fire protection or fire warning system required by the Fire Safety Code or State Fire 
Prevention Code, (3) the storage of any flammable or explosive material without a permit 
or in quantities in excess of any allowable limits pursuant to a permit, (4) the use of any 
firework or pyrotechnic device without a permit, or (5) exceeding the occupancy limit 
established by the State Fire Marshal or a local fire marshal. The penalty for the failure to 
remedy or abate such hazards shall be as described in section and 29-291c of the 
Connecticut General Statutes as appropriate. 
 
(Add) 109.6.1 Order to vacate. An order to vacate all or part of a building may be issued 
by a local fire marshal or local police officer in accordance with section 29-306 of the 
Connecticut General Statutes, when there exists in a building a risk of death or injury from 
(1) blocked, insufficient or impeded egress, (2) failure to maintain or the shutting off of 
any fire protection or fire warning system required by the Fire Safety Code or State Fire 
Prevention Code, (3) the storage of any flammable or explosive material without a permit 
or in quantities in excess of any allowable limits pursuant to a permit, (4) the use of any 
firework or pyrotechnic device without a permit, or (5) exceeding the occupancy limit 
established by the State Fire Marshal or a local fire marshal.  The penalty for the failure 
to remedy or abate such hazards shall be as described in section 29-291c of the 
Connecticut General Statutes as appropriate.   
 
 

(Del) SECTION 110 
SERVICE UTILITIES 

 
(Del) 110.1 Authority to disconnect service utilities. Delete section.  
 
 

SECTION 111 
(Amd) APPEAL OF THE DECISION OF THE LOCAL OR STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 
(Amd) 111.1 Appeal of the decision of the local or state fire marshal.  A decision of 
the local fire marshal or State Fire Marshal may be appealed to the Codes and Standards 
Committee in accordance with section 29-309 of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Del) 111.2 Limitations on authority. Delete section. 



19 
 

 
(Del) 111.3 Qualifications. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 111.4 Administration. Delete section.   
 

SECTION 112 
(Amd) ABATEMENT OF FIRE HAZARDS 

 
 
(Amd) 112.1 Abatement of fire hazards. The local fire marshal for a jurisdiction or the 
State Fire Marshal shall order conditions contrary to the provisions of this code to be 
remedied in accordance with section 29-306 of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Add) 112.1.1 Unauthorized tampering. Signs, tags or seals posted or affixed by the fire 
code official shall not be mutilated, destroyed or tampered with, or removed, without 
authorization from the fire code official. 
 
(Del) 112.2 Owner/occupant responsibility. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 112.3 Notice of violation. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 112.4 Violation penalties. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
 

(Del) SECTION 113 
STOP WORK ORDER 

 
(Del) 113.1 Authority. Delete section.  
 
(Del) 113.2 Issuance. Delete section.  
 
(Del) 113.3 Emergencies. Delete section.  
 
 

SECTION 114 
UNSAFE STRUCTURES OR EQUIPMENT 

 
(Amd) 114.1 General. See sections 7-313e and 29-306 of the Connecticut General 
Statutes. 
 
(Del) 114.1.1 Unsafe conditions. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 114.1.2 Structural hazards. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 114.2 Evacuation. Delete section. 
 



20 
 

(Del) 114.3 Record. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 114.4 Notice. Delete section. 
 
(Del) 114.5 Method of service. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 114.6 Restoration or abatement. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 114.7 Summary abatement. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
 
 

(Add) SECTION 115 
OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION AND USE 

 
(Add) 115.1 Occupancy classification and use.  The requirements of Chapter 3 of the 
2021 International Building Code portion of the 2022 Connecticut State Building Code 
shall also be considered requirements of this code and known as the 2021 International 
Building Code, Chapter 3 portion of the 2022 Connecticut State Fire Safety Code.    
 

 
 

(Add) SECTION 116 
SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED UPON OCCUPANCY AND USE 

 
(Add) 116.1 Special detailed requirements based upon occupancy and use.  The 
requirements of Chapter 4 of the 2021 International Building Code portion of the 2022 
Connecticut State Building Code shall also be considered requirements of this code and 
known as the 2021 International Building Code, Chapter 4 portion of the 2022 Connecticut 
State Fire Safety Code.    
 
 

(Add) SECTION 117  
GROUP R-1 BED AND BREAKFAST ESTABLISHMENTS  

 
(Add) 117.1 Kitchens in Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments. Kitchens in 
Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments shall be separated by ½-hour rated fire 
separation assemblies.  

Exceptions: 
1. If the kitchen is protected by a limited area sprinkler system. 

2. If the kitchen is equipped with a listed residential range top extinguisher unit or 
an approved commercial kitchen hood with a listed, approved automatic fire 
suppression system. 

3. The structural members supporting the rated assemblies shall not be required 
to be fire-resistance rated. 



21 
 

 
(Add) 117.2 Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments. The height limitation for 
existing unsprinklered buildings of Type VB construction undergoing a change of 
occupancy from detached one- and two-family dwellings to Group R-1 bed and breakfast 
establishments shall be increased by 5 feet (1524 mm) from the value in Table 504.3 of 
the 2021 International Building Code portion of the Connecticut State Building Code and 
one story from the value in Table 504.4 of the 2021 International Building Code portion of 
the Connecticut State Building Code where 1-hour fire-resistance rated assemblies are 
constructed between the second and third floors. The structural members supporting the 
rated assemblies shall not be required to be fire-resistance rated. 
 
 

 
(Add) SECTION 118  
INCIDENTAL USES  

 
(Add) 118.1 Incidental uses.  The requirements of Section 509 of the 2021 International 
Building Code portion of the 2022 Connecticut State Building Code shall also be 
considered requirements of this code and known as the 2021 International Building Code, 
Section 509 portion of the 2022 Connecticut State Fire Safety Code.    
 

Exception: Incidental uses within and serving a dwelling unit are not required to 
comply with this section. 

 
 

(Add) SECTION 119 
MIXED USE AND OCCUPANCY 

 
(Add) 119.1 Mixed Used and Occupancy.  The requirements of Section 508 of the 2021 
International Building Code portion of the 2022 Connecticut State Building Code, except 
as noted below, shall also be considered requirements of this code and known as the 
2021 International Building Code, Section 508 portion of the 2022 Connecticut State Fire 
Safety Code.    
 
 Exceptions: 

1. Sections 508.5.9 and 508.5.11 addressing Accessibility and Plumbing Facilities 
respectively, are not adopted as part of the 2022 Connecticut State Fire Safety 
Code.   
 
2. Any references to allowable building height, allowable building area, or the 
number of stories allowed in a building in Section 508 are not adopted as part of 
the 2022 Connecticut State Fire Safety Code, and shall be determined by the 
building official. 

 
 



22 
 

 

C H A P T E R  2  

DEFINITIONS 
 
(Add) APPROVED AGENCY. An established and recognized agency regularly engaged 
in conducting tests or furnishing inspection services or furnishing product certification, 
where such agency has been approved by the fire code official. Building officials licensed 
in accordance with the provisions of section 29-262 of the Connecticut General Statutes 
and employed by the jurisdiction in which the building or structure is being constructed, 
shall be considered an approved agency for the portions of this code also regulated by 
the Connecticut State Building Code. Pursuant to subsection (e)(1) of section 29-276b of 
the Connecticut General Statutes, approved agencies conducting tests or furnishings 
inspection services of soils or concrete must maintain accreditation by the National 
Voluntary Laboratory Accreditation Program of the National Institute of Standards and 
Technology.   
 
(Amd) BUILDING. Any structure used or intended for supporting or sheltering any use or 
occupancy. For application of this code, each portion of a building that is completely 
separated from other portions by fire walls designed and constructed in accordance with 
the Connecticut State Building Code and has been approved by the building official shall 
be considered a separate building. 
 
(Add) BULK MERCHANDISING RETAIL BUILDING. A retail building exceeding 12,000 
square feet (1,115 m2) in area in which the sales area includes the storage of combustible 
materials on pallets, in solid piles, or in racks in excess of 12 feet (3,658 mm) in storage 
height. 
 
(Amd) EXISTING. Buildings, facilities or conditions that were already in existence, 
constructed or officially authorized prior to the adoption of this code. For the purposes of 
Chapter 11 of this code, existing shall be defined as a building, structure or condition for 
which a building permit was applied for on or after January 1, 2006, and prior to the 
adoption of this code, and which has not undergone any alterations, renovations, or 
changes of use.   
 
(Amd) FIRE CODE OFFICIAL. The local fire marshal or State Fire Marshal charged with 
the enforcement of this code, or his or her duly authorized representative. 
 
(Amd) FIREWORKS. Fireworks has the same meaning as provided in section 29-356 of 
the Connecticut General Statutes and includes any device that meets the definition of 
1.3G fireworks and 1.4G fireworks, but excludes sparklers and fountains, as defined in 
section 29-356 of the Connecticut General Statutes.  

 



23 
 

Fireworks, 1.3G. Large fireworks devices, which are explosive materials, intended 
for use in fireworks displays and designed to produce audible or visible effects by 
combustion, deflagration or detonation. Such 1.3G fireworks include, but are not 
limited to, firecrackers containing more than 130 milligrams (2 grains) of explosive 
composition, aerial shells containing more than 40 grams of pyrotechnic 
composition and other display pieces which exceed the limits for classification as 
1.4G fireworks. Such 1.3G fireworks are also identified as Fireworks, UN0335 
pursuant to 49.CFR 172.101. 

 

Fireworks, 1.4G. Small fireworks devices containing restricted amounts of 
pyrotechnic composition designed primarily to produce visible or audible effects by 
combustion or deflagration which comply with the construction, chemical 
composition and labeling requirements for Fireworks, UN0336 pursuant to CFR 
172.101 and those set forth in 16 CFR Parts 1500 and 1507. 

 

Sparklers and Fountains. See definition under Sparklers and Fountains.   

 
 
OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATIONS:   
 
(Amd) FOSTER CARE FACILITIES. Facilities that provide foster care to more than three 
children, 3 years of age or younger. 
 
(Add) NIGHT CLUB/DISCOTHEQUE/DANCE HALL.  A commercial establishment that 
is open at night, has music, dancing, or a show, for a fee, and may serve alcoholic drinks 
and food. 
 
(Add) GROUP B COLLEGE OCCUPANCIES.  A building, structure, or portion thereof 
that is of a Group B Business occupancy classification and associated with a facility of 
higher education above the twelfth grade.  This definition does not include training or skill 
development facilities.   
 
(Add) GROUP B MEDICAL AND DENTAL OCCUPANCIES. Shall apply to Group B 
medical and dental occupancies that provide services or treatment for four or more 
patients who may simultaneously be rendered incapable of taking action for self-
preservation under emergency conditions. The occupancy shall include, but not be limited 
to, the following:  

Outpatient clinics with general anesthesia or life-support equipment; 

Dental centers providing treatment under general anesthesia; 

One-day surgical centers; and 

Physicians’ offices providing treatment under general anesthesia. 

 



24 
 

Facilities such as the above that do not provide general anesthesia or life support 
equipment simultaneously to four or more patients shall be classified as Group B 
Business occupancies. 
 
(Add) IN-HOME GROUP B OCCUPANCY. (Live-Work Unit) Customary in-home 
business occupancies located within a single-family dwelling unit that provide 
professional services and employ a maximum of one employee within the dwelling in 
addition to the residents of the dwelling unit shall be classified as a single-family dwelling. 
 
(Add) IN-HOME INDUSTRIAL OCCUPANCIES, OTHER THAN HIGH HAZARD 
INDUSTRIAL OCCUPANCIES. (Live-Work Unit) Customary in-home industrial 
occupancies located within a single-family dwelling unit, in which processing, assembling, 
mixing, packaging, finishing, decorating, or repair operations are conducted, that employ 
a maximum of one employee within the dwelling in addition to the residents of the dwelling 
unit, shall be classified as single-family residential occupancies. 
 
(Amd) Group E, day care facilities, more than six children. This group includes 
buildings, structures, or portions thereof occupied by more than six children 3 years of 
age or older who receive educational, supervision or personal care services for fewer 
than 24 hours per day. 

 

(Del) Five or fewer children.  Delete. 

 

(Del) Five or fewer children in a dwelling unit. Delete.  
 
(Add) Group E, day care facilities, six or fewer children. A building, structure,  or 
portion thereof having six or fewer children who receive educational, supervision or 
personal care services shall be classified as part of the primary occupancy. 
 
(Add) Group E, day care facilities, six or fewer children in a dwelling unit. As 
described in subdivision (3) of subsection (a) of section 19a-77 of the Connecticut 
General Statutes, a family child care home shall be classified as Group R-3 or shall 
comply with the 2015 International Residential Code portion of the Connecticut State 
Building Code in accordance with Section 101.2.  

Note:  Residential Group R-4, Four to sixteen persons receiving care; and Residential 
Group R-3, Three or fewer persons receiving care are located under the Institutional 
Group I-1 heading. 

   
 
(Add) Group R-1 BED and BREAKFAST or BED and BREAKFAST 
ESTABLISHMENT. A building: 

(1) That provides sleeping accommodations to the public for a fee for no more than 
sixteen persons with guest rooms limited to the first and second floor of the 
structure, and 



25 
 

(2) Where the owner occupies the building or an adjacent property as his or her 
primary place of residence, and 

(3) Where cooking or food warming of any type is not allowed in guest rooms, and 

(4) That is a maximum of three stories in height and does not contain a mixed 
occupancy. 

 
(Add) ONE-FAMILY DWELLING. A building containing one dwelling unit with not more 
than six lodgers or boarders.  Also known as a single-family dwelling.  
 
(Add) TWO-FAMILY DWELLING. A building containing two dwelling units with not more 
than six lodgers or boarders per dwelling unit.   
 
(Amd) Residential Group R-4, Four to sixteen persons receiving care. A facility 
housing not fewer than four and not more than sixteen persons receiving custodial care 
shall be classified as R-4. 
 
(Amd) Residential Group R-3 Three or fewer persons receiving care. A facility with 
three or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as Group R-3 or shall 
comply with the 2018 International Residential Code portion of the Connecticut State 
Building Code. 
 
(Amd) Institutional Group I-2. Institutional Group I-2 occupancy shall include buildings 
and structures used for medical care on a 24-hour basis for more than three persons who 
are incapable of self-preservation.  This group shall include, but not be limited to, the 
following: 

Foster care facilities 

Detoxification facilities 

Hospitals 

Nursing homes 

Psychiatric hospitals 
 
(Del) Five or fewer persons receiving medical care. Delete. 
 
(Add) Institutional Group I-2, Three or fewer persons receiving care. A facility with 
three or fewer persons simultaneously receiving medical care shall be classified as Group 
R-3 or shall comply with the 2018 International Residential Code portion of the State 
Building Code. 
 
(Add) Small I-2 Home, Alternative compliance for small I-2 homes. See Section 
1407.14 for alternative compliance provisions for Group I-2 homes serving four to six 
persons who are incapable of self-preservation. 
 
(Amd) Institutional Group I-3. Institutional Group I-3 occupancy shall include buildings 
that are inhabited by more than three persons who are under restraint or security. A Group 



26 
 

I-3 facility is occupied by persons who are generally incapable of self-preservation due to 
security measures not under such persons’ control. This group shall include, but not be 
limited to, the following: 

Correctional centers 

Detention centers 

Jails 

Prerelease centers 

Prisons 

Reformatories 

 
Buildings of Group I-3 shall be classified as one of the five following occupancy 
conditions:  

Condition 1. This occupancy condition shall include buildings in which free 
movement is allowed from sleeping areas, and other spaces where access 
or occupancy is permitted, to the exterior via means of egress without 
restraint. A Condition 1 facility is permitted to be constructed as Group R.  

Condition 2. This occupancy condition shall include buildings in which free 
movement is allowed from sleeping areas and any other occupied smoke 
compartment to one or more other smoke compartments. Egress to the 
exterior is impeded by locked exits.  

Condition 3. This occupancy condition shall include buildings in which free 
movement is allowed within individual smoke compartments, such as within 
a residential unit comprised of individual sleeping units and group activity 
spaces, where egress is impeded by remote-controlled release of means of 
egress from such a smoke compartment to another smoke compartment.  

Condition 4. This occupancy condition shall include buildings in which free 
movement is restricted from an occupied space. Remote-controlled release 
is provided to permit movement from sleeping units, activity spaces and 
other occupied areas within the smoke compartment to other smoke 
compartments.  

Condition 5. This occupancy condition shall include buildings in which free 
movement is restricted from an occupied space. Staff-controlled manual 
release is provided to permit movement from sleeping units, activity spaces 
and other occupied areas within the smoke compartment to other smoke 
compartments. 

 

(Amd) Institutional Group I-4, day care facilities. Institutional Group I-4 occupancy 
shall include buildings and structures occupied by more than six persons of any age who 
receive custodial care for fewer than 24 hours per day by persons other than parents or 



27 
 

guardians or relatives by blood, marriage or adoption, and in a place other than the home 
of the person cared for. This group shall include, but not be limited to, the following: 

Adult day care 

Child day care 

 
(Amd) Institutional Group I-4, Classification as Group E. A child day care facility that 
provides care for more than six but not more than one hundred children 3 years or less 
of age, where the rooms in which the children are cared for are located on the level of exit 
discharge serving such rooms and each of these child care rooms has an exit door directly 
to the exterior, shall be classified as Group E. 
 
(Del) Five of fewer occupants receiving care. Delete. 
 
(Del) Five of fewer occupants receiving care in a dwelling unit. Delete. 
 
(Add) Institutional Group I-4 day care facilities, six or fewer persons receiving care. 
A facility having six or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as part 
of the primary occupancy.  
 
(Add) Institutional Group I-4 child care. As described in subdivision (3) of subsection 
(a) of section 19a-77 of the Connecticut General Statutes, a family child care home shall 
be classified as Group R-3 or shall comply with the 2015 International Residential Code 
portion of the Connecticut State Building Code.  
 
(Amd) Residential Group R-1. Residential occupancies containing sleeping units in 
which the occupants are primarily transient in nature, including:  

Bed and breakfast establishments  

Boarding houses with more than six occupants  

Congregate living facilities with more 
than six occupants 

Hotels 

Motels 
 
(Amd) Residential Group R-2. Residential Group R-2 occupancies containing sleeping 
units or more than two dwelling units where the occupants are primarily permanent in 
nature, including: 

Apartment houses 

Boarding houses with more than six occupants 

Congregate living facilities with more than six occupants 

Convents 

Dormitories 

Fraternities and sororities 



28 
 

Hotels 

Live/work units 

Monasteries 

Motels 

Vacation timeshare properties  
 
(Amd) Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-3 occupancies where the occupants 
are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4 or I, including: 
 

Buildings that do not contain more than two dwelling units, with not more than six 
lodgers or boarders per dwelling unit. 

Care facilities that provide accommodations for five or fewer persons receiving 
care. 

Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with six or fewer occupants where 
personal care services are not provided. 

Boarding houses (nontransient) 

Convents 

Dormitories 

Fraternities and Sororities 

Monasteries 

Congregate living facilities (transient) with six or fewer occupants where personal 
care services are not provided. 

 

Boarding houses (transient) with six or fewer occupants where personal care 
services are not provided. 

 
 
(Amd) Residential Group R-4. Residential Group R-4 occupancy shall include buildings, 
structures or portions thereof for more than 3 but not more than 16 occupants, excluding 
staff, who reside on a 24-hour basis in a supervised residential environment and receive 
custodial care.  Buildings of Group R-4 shall be classified as one of the occupancy 
conditions specified in Section 310.6.1 or 310.6.2 of the 2018 International Building Code 
portion of the Connecticut State Building Code. The persons receiving care are capable 
of self-preservation. This group shall include, but not be limited to, the following: 

Alcohol and drug centers 

Assisted living facilities 

Congregate care facilities 

Group homes 

Halfway houses 

Residential board and care custodial care facilities 

Social rehabilitation facilities 



29 
 

 
Group R-4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for construction as defined for Group 
R-3, except as otherwise provided for in the Connecticut State Building Code. 
 
(Add) PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS. See Construction Documents. 
 
(Add) PLATFORM. A raised area within a building used for worship, the presentation of 
music, plays or other entertainment; a head table for special guests; a raised area for 
lecturers or speakers; a boxing or wrestling ring; a theatre-in-the round stage; or an area 
used for similar purposes wherein, other than horizontal sliding curtains, there are no 
overhead hanging curtains, drops, scenery or stage effects other than lighting and sound. 
A temporary platform is one installed for not more than 30 days. 

Exception: Curtains suspended from overhead that open and close in a horizontal 
manner shall be permitted at platforms. 

 
(Add) SPARKLERS AND FOUNTAINS.  “Sparklers” and “fountains” have the same 
meanings as provided in section 29-356 of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Amd) SPECIAL AMUSEMENT BUILDING.  A special amusement building is any 
temporary or permanent building or portion thereof that is occupied for amusement, 
entertainment or education purposes and that contains a device or system that conveys 
passengers or provides a walkway along, around or over a course in any direction so 
arranged that the means of egress path is not readily apparent due to visual or audio 
distractions or is intentionally confounded or is not readily available because of the nature 
of the attraction or mode of conveyance through the building or structure. 

Exception: Children’s play structures that do not exceed 10 feet (0.93m) in height 
and do not have an aggregate horizontal projection in excess of 300 square feet 
(27.9m). 

 
  



30 
 

 

C H A P T E R  3  

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS 
 

 

(Amd) 301.2 Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 for the 
activities or uses regulated by Sections 303, 306, 307, 308 and 315. 

 

(Del) SECTION 307 
OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND PORTABLE OUTDOOR 

FIREPLACES 
 

Delete section in its entirety.  See section 23-48 of the Connecticut General Statutes.   

(Amd) 308.1 General.  Open flame, fire and burning shall be in accordance with Sections 
308.1.1 to 308.4.1, inclusive, and with other applicable sections of this code. 

(Amd) 308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns. A person shall not release or cause to be released an 
untethered sky lantern.  

(Amd) 308.2 Permits required. Permits shall be obtained from the fire code official in 
accordance with Section 105.5 prior to engaging in the following activities involving open 
flame, fire and burning: 

1. Use of a torch or flame-producing device to remove paint from a structure. 

2. Except for theatrical performance open flame devices as specified in Section 
308.3.2, the use of open flame, fire or burning in connection with Group A or E 
occupancies. 

3. Use or operation of torches and other devices, machines or processes liable to 
start or cause fire in or on wildfire risk areas. 

Note: See section 29-357a of the Connecticut General Statutes for permit 
requirements for displays of special effects produced by pyrotechnics or flame 
producing devices.   

 

(Amd) 308.3.2 Theatrical performances, flame effects before an audience. Where 
approved by the State Fire Marshal, open flame devices or effects used in conjunction 
with theatrical performances or flame effects before an audience shall be in conformance 
with and governed by the requirements of the Connecticut State Fire Prevention Code. 

(Add) 308.3.2.1 Approval. The use of flame effect materials, devices or components 
governed by NFPA 140 and NFPA 160; the device, its arrangement, and location(s) shall 
be approved by the State Fire Marshal and shall be in conformance with the requirements 
of the Connecticut State Fire Prevention Code. 



31 
 

 
(Del) SECTION 310 

SMOKING 
 

Delete section in its entirety.   
 
 

(Del) SECTION 319 
MOBILE FOOD PREPRATION VEHICLES 

 
Delete section in its entirety.   
 
 

  



32 
 

 

C H A P T E R  4  

EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS. 
 

 
(Amd) 401.1 Scope. Reporting of emergencies, coordination with emergency response 
forces, emergency plans and procedures for managing or responding to emergencies 
shall comply with the provisions of this section. 
 
(Amd) 403.2.2 Announcements. As required by subsection (b) of section 29-381 of the 
Connecticut General Statutes, before any performance or event at any theater, concert 
or music hall or assembly hall or at any building, auditorium or room used for public 
gatherings of more than one hundred persons, the owner, proprietor, manager or agent 
of such theater, hall, building, auditorium or room shall make a public announcement that 
describes the location of emergency exits.   

(Amd) 403.4.1 Fire drills. Crisis response drills. (a) Each local and regional board of 
education shall provide for a fire drill to be held in the schools of such board not later than 
thirty days after the first day of each school year and at least once each month thereafter, 
except as provided in subsection (b) of this section. 

(b) Each such board shall substitute a crisis response drill for a fire drill once every three 
months and shall develop the format of such crisis response drill in consultation with the 
appropriate local law enforcement agency. A representative of such agency may 
supervise and participate in any such crisis response drill. 

 
(Amd) 403.7.2 Group I-2 occupancies. Group I-2 occupancies shall comply with 
Sections 401, 403.7.2.1 to 403.7.2.4.1, inclusive, and 404 to 406, inclusive. 
 
(Amd) 403.7.2.4 Emergency evacuation drills not including small I-2 homes. 
Emergency evacuation drills shall comply with Section 405.  

Exceptions: 

1. The movement of patients to safe areas or to the exterior of the building is not 
required. 

2. Where emergency evacuation drills are conducted after visiting hours or where 
patients or residents are expected to be asleep, a coded announcement shall be 
an acceptable alternative to audible alarms. 

 
(Add) 403.7.2.4.1 Emergency evacuation drills for small I-2 homes. Emergency 
evacuation drills shall involve the actual evacuation of all residents to an assembly point, 
as specified in the emergency action plan required by the CSFPC, and shall provide 
residents with experience in egressing through all exits and means of escape required by 
the code.  



33 
 

 
(Amd) 403.9.2.1 College and university buildings. Residential boarding and high 
school buildings. An approved fire safety and evacuation plan in accordance with 
Section 404 shall be prepared and maintained for Group R-2 college and university 
buildings, and R-2 Residential boarding and high school buildings. Group R-2 college and 
university buildings, and R-2 Residential boarding and high school buildings shall comply 
with Sections 403.9.2.1.1 and 403.9.2.1.2. 

 

(Amd) 403.9.2.1.1 First emergency evacuation drill. The first emergency evacuation 
drill of each school year shall be conducted within 30 days of the beginning of classes. 

 

(Amd) 403.9.2.2.1 Guide contents. A fire emergency guide shall describe the location, 
function and use of fire protection equipment and appliances available for use by 
residents, including fire alarm systems, smoke alarms and portable fire extinguishers. 
Guides shall include an emergency evacuation plan for each sleeping unit or dwelling 
unit.  

 

(Amd) 403.9.3.1.1 Fire safety plan. A copy of the fire safety plan shall be maintained at 
the facility at all times. The plan shall include the following in addition to the requirements 
of Section 404.2.2:               

1. Location and number of resident sleeping rooms. 

2. Location of special locking or egress control arrangements. 

3. Location of all points of safety. 

 

(Add) 403.10.6 Road tunnels. Newly-constructed road tunnels shall comply with Chapter 
7 of NFPA 502.  Renovations to existing road tunnels are not required to comply with 
Chapter 7 of NFPA 502. 

 

(Amd) 403.11.3 Crowd managers. Where facilities or events involve a gathering of 
more than 250 people, crowd managers shall be provided in accordance with Sections 
403.11.3.1 to 403.11.3.3, inclusive.  
 
(Amd) 403.11.3.1 Number of crowd managers. Not fewer than one trained crowd 
manager for each 250 persons or portion thereof, shall be provided for the gathering. 

Exceptions: 

1. Outdoor events with fewer than 1,000 persons in attendance shall not require 
crowd managers. 

2. Assembly occupancies used exclusively for religious worship with an occupant 
load not exceeding 500 shall not require crowd managers. 



34 
 

3. The number of crowd managers shall be reduced where, in the opinion of the 
fire code official, the fire protection provided by the facility and the nature of the 
event warrant a reduction. 

 

(Amd) 404.2.3.2 Drills. Lockdown plan drills shall be conducted in accordance with the 
approved plan. Except as provided for in Section 403.4.1, such drills shall not be 
substituted for fire and evacuation drills required by Section 405.2. 
 

(Amd) Table 405.3 

FIRE AND EVACUATION DRILL FREQUENCY AND PARTICIPATION 

Group or 
Occupancy 

Frequency Participation 

Group A Quarterly Staff 

Group Bb Annually All occupants 

Group Bc 
(Ambulatory care 

facilities) 
Quarterly on each shifta Staff 

Group Bb (Clinic, 
outpatient) 

Annually Staff 

Group E Monthlya,e All occupants 

Group F Annually Staff 

Group I-1 Semiannually on each shiftb All occupants 

Group I-2 Quarterly on each shifta Staff 

Small I-2 Group 
Homes 

Quarterly on each shift 
All occupants, See Section 

403.7.2.4 

Group I-3 Quarterly on each shifta Staff 

Group I-4 Monthly on each shifta All occupants 

Group R-1 Quarterly on each shift Staff 

Group R-2d Four annually All occupants 

Group R-4 Semiannually on each shifta,f All occupantsf 

 

a. In severe weather conditions, the fire code official shall have the authority to modify the 
emergency evacuation drill frequency.  

b. Emergency evacuation drills are required in Group B buildings having an occupant load of 500 
or more persons or more than 100 persons above or below the lowest level of exit discharge.  

c. Emergency evacuation drills are required in ambulatory care facilities in accordance with 
Section 403.3.  

d. Emergency evacuation drills in Group R-2 college and university buildings shall be in 
accordance with Section 403.9.2.1. Other Group R2 occupancies shall be in accordance with 
Section 403.9.2.2. 

e. See Section 403.4.1 for crisis response drills. 

f. See Section 403.9.3.4. 



35 
 

 

 

C H A P T E R  5  

FIRE SERVICE FEATURES 
 
(Amd) 501.1 Scope The fire chief in conjunction with the fire code official shall assure fire 
service features for buildings, structures, operations, and premises shall comply with this 
chapter.   
 
(Amd) 501.2 Permits. A permit shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5. 
 
(Amd) 503.1 Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and 
maintained in accordance with Section 503.1. 
 
(Amd) 503.1.1 Buildings and facilities. Approved fire apparatus access roads shall be 
provided for every facility, building, or portion hereafter constructed or moved into or 
within the jurisdiction. Each fire apparatus access road shall comply with the requirements 
of Appendix D.    
 
(Amd) 503.1.2 Additional access. The fire code official in conjunction with the fire chief 
is authorized to require more than one fire apparatus access road based on the potential 
for impairment of a single road by vehicle congestion, condition of terrain, climate 
conditions or other factors that could limit access.   
 
(Del) 503.2 Specifications. Delete section in its entirety.   
 
(Del) 503.4 Obstruction to fire department access roads. Delete section in its entirety.   
 
(Del) 503.5 Required gates or barriers. Delete section in its entirety.   
 
(Del) 503.6 Security gates. Delete section.   
 
(Del) 507.1 Required water supply. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 507.2 Type of water supply. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 507.3 Fire flow. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 507.4 Water supply test. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Amd) 507.1 Required water supply. Fire hydrant systems shall comply with Sections 
507.1.1 to 507.5.6, inclusive. 



36 
 

 
(Del) 507.5.1 Where required. Delete section. 
 
(Amd) 510.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings. Existing 
buildings other than Group R-3, undergoing an addition, alteration, renovation, or change 
of use either by the requirements of this code or the International Existing Building Code 
portion of the Connecticut State Building Code, that do not have approved in-building, 
two-way emergency response communication coverage for emergency responders in the 
building based on existing coverage levels of the public safety communication systems, 
shall be equipped with such coverage according to one of the following: 

1. Where an existing wired communication system cannot be repaired or is being 
replaced, or where not approved in accordance with Section 510.1, Exception 1. 

2. Within a time frame established by the authority having jurisdiction. 

Exception: Where it is determined by the fire code official that the in-building, two-way 
emergency responder communication coverage system is not needed. 

 

 

 

C H A P T E R  6  

BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS 
 
(Add) 601.3 Gas. The International Fuel Gas Code is not adopted by the state of 
Connecticut.  Any references to the International Fuel Gas Code within the body of this 
code shall be considered references to the requirements of NFPA 54, National Fuel Gas 
Code; NFPA 2, Hydrogen Technologies Code; and NFPA 58, Liquified Petroleum Gas 
Code. These requirements apply to gas piping systems extending from the point of 
delivery to the inlet connections of appliances, the installation and operation of residential 
and commercial gas appliances and related accessories as covered by this code. 
 
(Amd) 603.10 Abandoned wiring. Abandoned cables that are able to be accessed 
without causing damage, or requiring demolition to the building, shall be tagged for future 
use or removed.    
 
(Amd) 604.1 State Elevator Code. All elevators, dumbwaiters, material lifts, vertical and 
inclined platform lifts, inclined stairway chairlifts, limited-use/limited application elevators 
and escalators, including existing systems, shall comply with the regulations of the 
Department of Administrative Services adopted pursuant to chapter 538 of the 
Connecticut General Statutes as enforced by the State Elevator Inspector and the 
requirements of this section. 
 
(Del) 604.2 Emergency operations. Delete section in its entirety. 



37 
 

 
(Del) 604.3 Standby power. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 604.5 Maintenance of elevators. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Del) 604.6 Elevator keys. Delete section in its entirety. 
 
(Amd) 605.4 Fuel oil storage systems. Fuel oil storage systems for building heating 
systems shall be installed and maintained in accordance with the requirements of NFPA 
31 and this Code. Tanks and fuel-oil piping systems shall be installed in accordance with 
NFPA 31 and Chapter 13 of the International Mechanical Code. 
 
(Amd) 605.5 Portable unvented heaters.  Portable unvented heaters shall conform to 
the requirements of sections 29-318 to 29-318c, inclusive, of the Connecticut General 
Statutes.  Portable unvented fuel fired heating equipment shall be prohibited in 
occupancies in Groups A, E, I, R-1, R-2, R-3 and R-4 and ambulatory care facilities. 

Exception: 

Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances in accordance with Section 605.5.2. 

 
(Amd) 606.1 General. Commercial kitchen exhaust hoods shall comply with the 
requirements of the 2021 International Mechanical Code portion of the Connecticut State 
Building Code.  
 
 

C H A P T E R  7  
(AMD) INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE OF FIRE AND SMOKE PROTECTION 

FEATURES 
 

(Amd) 701.1 Scope. The provisions of this Chapter shall govern the inspection and 
maintenance of the materials, systems and assemblies used for structural fire resistance, 
fire-resistance-rated construction separation of adjacent space and construction installed 
to resist the passage of smoke to safeguard against the spread of fire and smoke within 
a building and the spread of fire to or from buildings. New buildings shall comply with the 
2021 International Building Code portion of the Connecticut State Building Code and 
Section 701.1.1.  
 
(Add) 701.1.1 Additional requirements.  In addition to the requirements of this Chapter, 
the requirements of Chapter 7 of the 2021 International Building Code portion of the 2022 
Connecticut State Building Code shall also be considered requirements of this Code and 
known as the 2021 International Building Code, Chapter 7 portion of the 2022 Connecticut 
State Fire Safety Code.    
 
(Amd) 701.6 Owner’s responsibility. The owner shall maintain an inventory of all 
required fire-resistance-rated construction, construction installed to resist the passage of 
smoke and the construction included in Sections 703 to 707, inclusive, and Sections 



38 
 

602.4.1 and 602.4.2 of the 2021 International Building Code portion of the Connecticut 
State Building Code. Such construction shall be visually inspected by the owner annually 
and properly repaired, restored or replaced when damaged, altered, breached or 
penetrated. Records of inspections and repairs shall be maintained. Where concealed, 
such elements shall not be required to be visually inspected by the owner unless the 
concealed space is accessible by the removal or movement of a panel, access door, 
ceiling tile or similar movable entry to the space. 
 

C H A P T E R  8  

INTERIOR FINISH, DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND FURNISHINGS 
 

(Amd) 801.1 Scope. The provisions of this Chapter shall govern interior finish, interior 
trim, furniture, furnishings, decorative materials and decorative vegetation in buildings.  
Buildings shall comply with Sections 801 to 808 inclusive.  

 
(Add) 801.1.1 Additional requirements.  In addition to the requirements of this chapter, 
the requirements of Chapter 8 of the 2021 International Building Code portion of the 2022 
Connecticut State Building Code shall also be considered requirements of this code and 
known as the 2021 International Building Code, Chapter 8 portion of the 2022 Connecticut 
State Fire Safety Code.    
 

(Amd) SECTION 803 

WALL AND CEILING FINISHES 

 
 

(Amd) SECTION 804 

INTERIOR WALL AND CEILING TRIM AND INTERIOR FINISH IN BUILDINGS 

 

(Amd) 804.1 804.1 Interior trim. Combustible trim in buildings, excluding handrails and 
guards, shall not exceed 10 percent of the specific wall or ceiling areas to which it is 
attached. Other than foam plastic, material used as interior trim shall comply with Section 
804.1.1 or 804.1.2. Foam plastic used as interior trim shall comply with Section 804.2. 

 

(Amd) SECTION 805 

UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE AND MATTRESSES IN BUILDINGS 

 

(Amd) SECTION 806 

NATURAL DECORATIVE VEGETATION IN BUILDINGS 

 

(Add) 806.1.1 Where permitted by the fire code official, Christmas trees shall be 
permitted in accordance with Table 806.1.1.   



39 
 

 
 

Table 806.1.1 Provisions for Christmas Trees by Occupancy 
 
 
 
 
 

Occupancy 

 
 
 
 

No Trees 
Permitted 

Cut Tree 
Permitted 

With 
Automatic 
Sprinkler 
System 

Cut Tree 
Permitted 
Without 

Automatic 
Sprinkler 
System 

 
 
 
 

Balled Tree 
Permitted 

     
Ambulatory health care    X 

     
Apartment buildings  Within unit Within unit X 

     
Assembly    X 

     
Board and care    X 

     
Business  X  X 

     
Day-care  X  X 

     
Detention and correctional X    

     
Dormitories   X** X 

     
Educational    X 

     
Health care    X 

     
Hotels    X 

     
Industrial  X X X 

     
Lodging and rooming  X  X 

     
Mercantile  X  X 

     
Storage  X X X 

 

** Cut trees in dwelling units that are associated with supervisory personnel in dormitory 
occupancies are permitted subject to the approval of the AHJ. 

 

 



40 
 

 

 

(Amd) SECTION 807 

DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND TRIM AND ARTIFICIAL DECORATIVE 
VEGETATION IN BUILDINGS 

 

(Amd) SECTION 808 

FURNISHINGS AND OTHER UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE AND MATTRESSES OR 
DECORATIVE MATERIALS IN BUILDINGS 

 

C H A P T E R  9  

FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS 
 
(Amd) 901.3 Permits. A permit shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5. 
 
(Amd) 901.5 Installation acceptance testing. Fire detection and alarm systems, 
emergency alarm systems, gas detection systems, fire-extinguishing systems, fire 
hydrant systems, fire standpipe systems, fire pump systems, private fire service mains 
and all other fire protection systems and appurtenances thereto shall be subject to 
acceptance tests as contained in the installation standards and as approved by the fire 
code official. The fire code official shall be notified before any required acceptance testing. 
Testing shall be conducted in the presence of the fire code official or his or her 
representative at the expense of the owner or owner’s representative. 
 
(Amd) 901.6 Inspection, testing and maintenance. Fire detection and alarm systems, 
emergency alarm systems, gas detection systems, fire-extinguishing systems, 
mechanical smoke exhaust systems and smoke and heat vents shall be maintained in an 
operative condition at all times, and shall be replaced or repaired where defective. Non-
required fire protection systems and equipment shall be inspected, tested and maintained 
or removed. The responsible person conducting an inspection, testing, or maintenance 
shall make records of all inspections, tests, and maintenance of the systems and its 
components and make the records available to the AHJ upon request. In the event of a 
system deficiency discovered during a required inspection or other event, the system shall 
be immediately tagged by such responsible person conducting the inspection noting the 
issue and date. The discovered deficiency(cies) shall be noted on the inspection report 
and a copy of such report shall be immediately forwarded to the AHJ. Contact information 
for the responsible person shall be included in the report. 
 
(Add) 901.6.1.1 Maintenance of NFPA 13D systems. 
 
(Add) 901.6.1.1.1 Monthly maintenance. A minimum monthly maintenance program 
shall include: 

(1) Visually inspecting all sprinklers to ensure against obstruction of spray. 



41 
 

(2) Inspecting all valves to ensure they are open. 

(3) Checking the pressure of air used with dry systems. 

(4) Checking the water level in storage tanks. 

(Add) 901.6.1.1.2 Quarterly maintenance. A minimum quarterly maintenance program 
shall include: 

(1) Testing of all water flow alarms. 

(2) Testing of the alarm system. 

(Add) 901.6.1.1.3 Sprinkler Replacement. Operated or damaged sprinklers shall be 
replaced with sprinklers having the same performance characteristics as the original 
equipment. 

(Add) 901.6.1.1.4 Painted Sprinklers.  Any sprinklers that have been painted outside the 
factory shall be replaced with a new listed sprinkler. 

 
(Amd) 901.7 Systems out of service. Where a required fire protection system is out of 
service for more than 4 hours in a 24-hour period, the fire department and the fire code 
official shall be notified immediately and, where required by the fire code official, the 
building shall be either evacuated or an approved fire watch shall be provided for all 
occupants left unprotected by the shut down until the fire protection system has been 
returned to service.  Where utilized, fire watches shall be provided with not less than one 
approved means for notification of the fire department. The only duty of the fire watch 
shall be to perform constant patrols of the building and keep watch for fires. 

Exception: Facilities with an approved notification and impairment management 
program. The notification and impairment program for water-based fire protection 
systems shall comply with NFPA 25.  

 
(Add) 901.11 Ceiling tiles and ceiling assemblies. Where automatic sprinklers or 
automatic fire detection devices are installed, ceiling tiles and ceiling assemblies 
necessary for the proper actuation of the fire protection devices shall be maintained. 
 
(Amd) 903.1.1 Alternative protection. In any occupancy where the character of fuel for 
fire is such that extinguishment or control of fire is accomplished by a type of alternative 
automatic extinguishing system complying with Section 904, such alternative system shall 
be permitted in lieu of an automatic sprinkler system and shall be installed in accordance 
with the applicable standard and approved by the fire code official. 
 
(Amd) 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for fire 
areas containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where 
one of the following conditions exists:  

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464.5 m2). 

Exception: Existing restaurants in existing non-sprinklered buildings 
that were designated Use Group A-3 under a previous edition of the 



42 
 

Connecticut State Building Code that undergo addition, alteration or 
change of occupancy that results in an increase in the restaurant’s 
fire area provided the proposed fire area does not exceed 12,000 
square feet (1,115 m2). 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more or where the occupant 
load exceeds 100 or more in the following assembly occupancies: 

a.  Dance halls 

b.  Discotheques 

c.  Night clubs 

d.  Assembly occupancies with festival seating. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving 
such occupancies. 

 
(Add) 903.2.3.1. Statutory requirements. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided in Group E occupancies pursuant to section 29-315 of the Connecticut General 
Statutes. 
 
(Amd) 903.2.7 Group M.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
buildings containing a Group M occupancy where one or more of the following conditions 
exists:                                              

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1,115 m2). 

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any 
mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2,230 m2). 

4. Throughout stories below the level of exit discharge where such stories have an 
area exceeding 2,500 square feet (232 m2) and are used for the sale, storage or 
handling of combustible goods or merchandise. 

5. In Group M occupancies storage rooms containing consumer fireworks, 
regardless of size, in a new or existing permanent store shall be protected with an 
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with NFPA 13 or separated 
from the retail sales area by a fire barrier having a fire resistance rating of not less 
than 1 hour. The quantity of fireworks permitted in storage shall not exceed 3,600 
cubic feet, including packaging. Such storage shall be segregated into areas of 
1,200 cubic feet or less, and separated by a minimum of 4 feet of clear space. 

6. In Group M occupancies, the total quantity of sparklers and fountains on hand 
either displayed or in storage shall not exceed 227.2 lb. (gross) [103 kg (gross)], 
including packaging or 1,000 lb. (gross) [454 kg (gross)] in a building protected 
throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance 
with NFPA 13. A quantity in excess of these amounts is subject to approval by the 
State Fire Marshal.  

 
(Amd) 903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with 
Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all newly constructed buildings with a Group 



43 
 

R fire area or in existing buildings that have a Group R fire area newly introduced by 
change of occupancy, occupancy group designation or by an addition.  

Exceptions: 

1. Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments.  

2. In existing buildings four stories or less in height containing not more than four 
dwelling units where dwelling units are added to an existing Group R use that does 
not involve a physical increase in the height or area of the building and where each 
dwelling unit has either:  

2.1 An exit door directly to the exterior at a level of exit discharge,  

2.2 Direct access to an exterior stair serving a maximum of two dwelling units 
on the same story, or 

2.3 Direct access to an interior stair serving only that dwelling unit and 
separated from all other portions of the building with 1-hour fire-resistance-
rated fire barriers.  

3. Existing buildings converted prior to June 15, 1994, from a one- or two-family 
building or Group R-3 to Group R-2 containing not more than four dwelling units.  

4. Horizontal additions containing newly introduced Group R occupancies that are 
added to existing buildings shall have an automatic sprinkler system installed in 
the addition only if the addition is completely separated from the existing building 
by fire barriers with a minimum 1-hour fire-resistance rating. 

5. In a building with a maximum of two dwelling units where: 

5.1 Each dwelling unit has a direct independent exit to grade. 

5.2 Each exit and dwelling unit is separated from any non-residential 
occupancy by a minimum 1-hour fire-resistance-rated separation. 

5.3 The non-residential occupancy is protected by an automatic fire 
detection and alarm system with notification in each dwelling unit. 
 

The use of any exceptions in this section shall not negate the requirements of Chapter 
10. 
 
(Amd) 903.2.8.4 Care facilities. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance 
with Section 903.3.1.3 shall be permitted in Group R-4 care facilities with sixteen or fewer 
residents when all of the following conditions are met: 

1. The facility is not in a building containing mixed occupancies,  

2. The building in which the facility is located is limited to two stories above grade 
plane and 40 feet (12.2 m) in height,  

3. The automatic sprinkler system has a minimum 30-minute water supply,  

4. All habitable, enclosed, usable areas and closets shall be sprinklered, 

5. Facilities with more than eight residents shall be treated as two-family dwellings 
with regard to water supply, and 



44 
 

6. The automatic sprinkler system is provided with valve supervision by one of the 
following methods:  

6.1. A single listed control valve that shuts off both domestic and automatic 
sprinkler system water supply and a separate valve that shuts off the 
domestic system only.  

6.2. Electrical supervision connected to the facility’s fire alarm system.  

6.3. Valve closure that causes the sounding of an audible alarm audible 
throughout the premises. 

 
(Amd) 903.2.11 Specific building areas and hazards.  In all occupancies other than 
Group U, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed for building design or hazards 
in the locations set forth in Sections 903.2.11.1 to 903.2.11.7, inclusive.  
 
(Add) 903.2.11.7 Additional statutory requirements. Pursuant to section 29-315 of the 
Connecticut General Statutes, automatic fire extinguishing systems shall be installed on 
each floor of any building or structure to be built more than four stories tall and to be used 
for human occupancy and in other occupancies as required by the State Fire Marshal in 
the interest of safety because of special occupancy hazards. 
 
(Amd) 903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations. Automatic sprinklers shall not be required in the 
following rooms or areas where such rooms or areas are protected with an approved 
automatic fire detection system in accordance with Section 907.2 that will respond to 
visible or invisible particles of combustion. Sprinklers shall not be omitted from any room 
merely because it is damp, of fire-resistance-rated construction or contains electrical 
equipment.    

1. Generator and transformer rooms separated from the remainder of the building by 
walls and floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies having a fire-resistance-rating of 
not less than 2 hours.                           

2. Fire service access elevator machine rooms and machinery spaces. 

3. Machine rooms, machinery spaces, control rooms and control spaces associated 
with occupant evacuation elevators designed in accordance with Section 3008 of 
the 2021 International Building Code portion of the Connecticut State Building 
Code. 

 
(Add) 903.3.1.1.3 Vertical openings. Closely spaced sprinklers and draft stops are not 
required around floor openings permitted to be unenclosed by this code unless the closely 
spaced sprinklers and draft stops are being utilized in lieu of an enclosure as specified by 
Section 712.1.3.1 of the 2021 International Building Code portion of the Connecticut State 
Building Code.  
 
(Add) 903.3.5.3 Water authority approval. Unless served by a private well of sufficient 
capacity or other approved source, domestic service shall be permitted to provide the 



45 
 

water supply for the automatic sprinkler system only upon written approval of the water 
authority supplying such domestic service. 
 
(Amd) 904.1 General. Automatic fire-extinguishing systems, other than automatic 
sprinkler systems, shall be designed, installed, inspected, tested and maintained in 
accordance with the provisions of this section and the applicable referenced standards 
listed in Chapter 80. Where other fire protection systems are required to be installed by 
the provisions of this code or are installed with the approval of the AHJ as an alternative 
or equivalency or by a condition of a modification, the design and installation of the system 
shall comply with the appropriate standards listed in Chapter 80. The responsible person 
conducting an inspection, testing, or maintenance shall make records of all inspections, 
tests, and maintenance of a system and its components and make the records available 
to the AHJ upon request. In the event of a system deficiency discovered during a required 
inspection or other event, the system shall be immediately tagged by such responsible 
person conducting the inspection noting the issue and date. The discovered deficiency 
shall be noted on the inspection report and a copy of such report shall be immediately 
forwarded to the AHJ. Contact information for the responsible person shall be included in 
the report. 
 
(Add) 905.2.1 Piping design. The riser piping, supply piping and the water service piping 
shall be sized to maintain a residual pressure of at least 100 pounds per square inch (psi) 
(690 kPa) at the topmost outlet of each riser while flowing the minimum quantities of water 
specified based upon a pressure of 150 psi (1035 kPa) available at the fire department 
connection. 

Exception: In buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system 
in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or Section 903.3.1.2 and where the highest 
floor level is not more than 75 feet above the lowest level of fire department vehicle 
access, Class I standpipes shall have an automatic or manual-wet supply. 

 

SECTION 906  
PORTABLE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS 

 
(Amd) 906.1 Where required. Portable fire extinguishers shall be installed and 
maintained in accordance with NFPA 10 in all of the following locations:  

1.  In Group A, B, E, F, H, I, M, R-1, R-1 Bed and Breakfast (in the kitchen), R-2, 
R-4, and S occupancies.   

Exceptions: 
1. In Group R-2 occupancies that are classified as apartment or 
dormitory occupancy.   

2. In storage areas of Group S occupancies where forklift, powered 
industrial truck or powered cart operators are the primary occupants, 
fixed extinguishers, as specified in NFPA 10, shall not be required if 
all of the following requirements are satisfied: 



46 
 

2.1. Use of vehicle-mounted extinguishers shall be approved 
by the fire code official. 

2.2. Each vehicle shall be equipped with a 10-pound, 
40A:80B:C extinguisher affixed to the vehicle using a 
mounting bracket approved by the extinguisher manufacturer 
or the fire code official for vehicular use. 

2.3. Not less than two spare extinguishers of equal or greater 
rating shall be available on-site to replace a discharged 
extinguisher. 

2.4. Vehicle operators shall be trained in the proper operation, 
use and inspection of extinguishers. 

2.5. Inspections of vehicle-mounted extinguishers shall be 
performed daily. 

2. Within 30 feet (9,144 mm) distance of travel from commercial cooking equipment 
and from domestic cooking equipment in Group I-1 and Group I-2, Condition 1. 

3. In areas where flammable or combustible liquids are stored, used or dispensed. 

4. On each floor of structures under construction, except Group R-3 occupancies, 
in accordance with Section 3316.1. 

5. Where required by the sections indicated in Table 906.1. 

6. Special-hazard areas, including, but not limited to, laboratories, computer rooms 
and generator rooms, where required by the fire code official. 

7. In all occupancies, outside and immediately adjacent to the entrance to all 
special hazardous areas except general storage areas. If the only entrance to a 
special hazardous area is from the exterior of the building, the fire extinguisher 
may be located just inside the entrance door.   

8. New and existing mercantile occupancies selling sparklers and fountains shall   
have a minimum of two dedicated 2-A water fire extinguishers at the location of the 
sparklers and fountains.   

 

Exception: Portable fire extinguishers are not required at normally unmanned Group U 
occupancy buildings or structures where a portable fire extinguisher suitable to the hazard 
of the location is provided on the vehicle of visiting personnel. 
 
(Del) 906.2.1 Certification of service personnel for portable fire extinguishers. 
Delete section. 
 
(Amd) 907.2.7.1 Occupant notification. During times that the building is occupied, the 
initiation of a signal from a manual fire alarm box shall not be required to activate the 
alarm notification appliances when an alarm signal is activated at a constantly attended 
location from which evacuation instructions shall be initiated over an emergency 
voice/alarm communication system installed in accordance with Section 907.5.2.2. 
 



47 
 

(Add) 907.2.7.2 Staged evacuation/selective occupant notification. Where approved 
by the authority having jurisdiction and where total evacuation of occupants is impractical 
due to building configuration, only occupants in the affected zones shall be initially 
notified, and provisions shall be made to selectively notify occupants in other zones to 
afford orderly evacuation of the entire building. When selective occupant notification is 
utilized, the portion of the building that does not receive the initial notification of alarm 
shall be separated from areas of immediate emergency and initial evacuation by 
construction having a fire resistance rating of at least 1 hour or other features approved 
by the authority having jurisdiction.   
 
(Amd) 907.2.8.2 Automatic smoke detection system. An automatic smoke detection 
system that activates the occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 
shall be installed throughout all interior corridors serving sleeping units. 

Exceptions: 

1. In buildings that do not have interior corridors serving sleeping units and where 
each sleeping unit has a means of egress door opening directly to an exit or to an 
exterior exit access that leads directly to an exit. 

2. In Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments. (See Section 907.2.11.1.1.) 
 
(Amd) 907.2.9.1 Manual fire alarm system. A manual fire alarm system that activates 
the occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in 
Group R-2 occupancies where: 

1. Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located three or more stories above the lowest 
level of exit discharge; 

2. Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located more than one story below the highest 
level of exit discharge of exits serving the dwelling unit or sleeping unit; or 

3. The building contains more than 11 dwelling units or sleeping units. 

Exceptions:  

1. In buildings not over two stories in height where all dwelling units or sleeping 
units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from each other and 
public or common areas by at least 1-hour fire partitions and each dwelling unit 
or sleeping unit has an exit directly to a public way, egress court or yard. 

2. In buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in 
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 where the occupant notification 
appliances will automatically activate throughout the notification zones upon a 
sprinkler water flow.   

3. In buildings that do not have interior corridors serving dwelling units or sleeping 
units and are protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in 
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, provided dwelling units or 
sleeping units either have a means of egress door opening directly to an 
exterior exit access that leads directly to the exits or are served by open-ended 
corridors designed in accordance with Section 1027.6, Exception 3. 

 



48 
 

(Amd) 907.2.9.3 Group R-2 college and university buildings and primary or 
secondary school buildings. An automatic smoke detection system that activates the 
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group 
R-2 occupancies operated by a college or university, or primary or secondary schools for 
student or staff housing in all of the following locations:  

1. Common spaces outside of dwelling units and sleeping units. 

2. Laundry rooms, mechanical equipment rooms and storage rooms.  

3. All interior corridors serving sleeping units or dwelling units.  

Exception: An automatic smoke detection system is not required in buildings that 
do not have interior corridors serving sleeping units or dwelling units and where 
each sleeping unit or dwelling unit either has a means of egress door opening 
directly to an exterior exit access that leads directly to an exit or a means of egress 
door opening directly to an exit. Required smoke alarms in dwelling units and 
sleeping units in Group R-2 occupancies operated by a college or university for 
student or staff housing shall be interconnected with the fire alarm system in 
accordance with NFPA 72.  

 
(Add) 907.2.11.1.1 Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments. An approved 
household fire warning system in accordance with the requirements of NFPA 72, 
consisting of a control unit with smoke detectors, a manual fire alarm box on each floor 
and occupant notification shall be installed in all Group R-1 bed and breakfast 
establishments. A heat detector shall be installed in the kitchen. 
 

(Add) 907.2.11.2.1 Group R-4. In Group R-4 occupancies, single or multiple-station 
smoke alarms shall be installed in living rooms, dens, day rooms and similar spaces in 
addition to the locations required by Section 907.2.11.2. 
 
(Add) 907.2.11.2.2 Alterations and additions. When alterations or additions requiring a 
permit occur in Group R-2, R-3 and R-4 occupancies, or when one or more sleeping 
rooms are added or created in existing dwelling units, the entire dwelling unit shall be 
provided with smoke detectors located as required for new dwelling units. Such smoke 
detectors within existing spaces may be battery operated and are not required to be dual-
powered or interconnected unless other remodeling considerations require removal of 
wall and ceiling coverings which would facilitate concealed interconnected wiring. 
 
(Add) 907.2.11.2.2.1 During construction. Pursuant to section 29-315b of the 
Connecticut General Statutes, whenever a single-family or two-family dwelling is 
occupied during interior alterations or additions requiring a building permit, the temporary 
installation of battery-operated smoke alarms shall be required in the vicinity of such 
alterations or additions for the duration of construction activities. A combined smoke and 
carbon monoxide alarm may be installed to comply with Section 915.8 and this section. 
 



49 
 

(Add) 907.2.11.2.3 Group I-4 and Group E day care facilities. Single- or multiple-station 
smoke detectors shall be installed and maintained in all day care facilities in the following 
locations: 

1. In each story in front of doors to the stairways; 

2. In the corridors of all floors occupied by the day care occupancy; and  

3. In lounges, recreation areas and sleeping rooms in the day care 
occupancy. 

Exception: Day care facilities housed in one room.  
 

(Add) 907.4.3.2 Ceiling tiles and ceiling assemblies. Where automatic fire detectors 
are installed, ceiling tiles and ceiling assemblies necessary for the proper actuation of the 
fire protection device in accordance with NFPA 72 shall be maintained.   
 
(Add) 907.6.6.1.1 Automatic telephone-dialing devices. Automatic telephone-dialing 
devices used to transmit an emergency alarm shall comply with the requirements of 
subsection (c) of section 28-25b of the Connecticut General Statutes. 
 
(Del) 907.9 Where required in existing buildings and structures. Delete section. 
 
(Amd) 912.2 Location. With respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings and landscaping, 
fire department connections shall be so located that fire apparatus and hoses connected 
to supply the system will not obstruct access to the buildings for other fire apparatus. The 
location of fire department connections shall be approved by the fire code official in 
conjunction with the fire chief.  
 
(Amd) 912.2.1 Visible location. Fire department connections shall be located on the 
street side of buildings or facing approved fire apparatus access roads, fully visible and 
recognizable from the street, fire apparatus access road or nearest point of fire 
department vehicle access or as otherwise approved by the fire code official in 
conjunction with the fire chief.     
 
(Amd) 912.2.2 Location signage. On buildings, wherever the fire department connection 
is not visible to approaching fire apparatus, the fire department connection shall be 
indicated by an approved sign mounted on the street front or on the side of the building. 
Such sign shall have the letters “FDC” not less than 6 inches (152 mm) high and words 
in letters not less than 2 inches (51 mm) high or an arrow to indicate the location. Such 
signs shall be subject to the approval of the fire code official in conjunction with the fire 
chief.     
 
(Add) 913.2.3 Electric fire pumps. Buildings provided with standby electrical power for 
the purpose of continuing operations or occupancy shall provide standby power in 
accordance with Article 701 of the 2020 NFPA 70, National Electrical Code, portion of the 
Connecticut State Building Code for any electric fire pump installed to provide an 



50 
 

adequate water supply or minimum operating pressure to a required automatic sprinkler 
system. Such system shall be in accordance with Section 1203. 
 
(Amd) 915.1 General. Carbon monoxide detection and warning equipment shall be 
installed in new buildings and occupancies in accordance with Sections 915.1 to 915.6, 
inclusive. When alterations or additions requiring a permit occur in existing buildings, 
carbon monoxide detection and warning equipment shall be provided in accordance with 
Section 915.7. 
 
(Amd) 915.1.1 Where required. Carbon monoxide detection shall be provided in the 
following locations: 

1. Group E occupancies in accordance with Section 915.2.3 
2. Group I-1, I-2, I-4 and R occupancies where any of the conditions in Sections 

915.1.2 through 915.1.6 exist. 
 

(Amd) 915.1.2 Fuel-burning appliances and fuel-burning fireplaces. Carbon 
monoxide detection and warning equipment shall be provided in dwelling units and 
sleeping units that contain a fuel-burning appliance or fuel-burning fireplace. 
 
(Amd) 915.1.3 Fuel-burning forced-air furnaces. Carbon monoxide detection and 
warning equipment shall be provided in dwelling units and sleeping units served by a fuel-
burning, forced-air furnace. 

Exception: Carbon monoxide detection and warning equipment shall not be 
required in dwelling units and sleeping units where carbon monoxide detection is 
provided in the first room or area served by each main duct leaving the furnace, 
and the carbon monoxide alarm signals are automatically transmitted to an 
approved location. 

 
(Amd) 915.1.4 Fuel-burning appliances outside of dwelling units and sleeping units. 
Carbon monoxide detection and warning equipment shall be provided in dwelling units 
and sleeping units located in buildings that contain fuel-burning appliances or fuel-burning 
fireplaces. 

Exceptions: 

1. Carbon monoxide detection and warning equipment shall not be required in 
dwelling units and sleeping units without communicating openings between the 
fuel-burning appliance or fuel-burning fireplace and the dwelling unit or sleeping 
unit. 

2. Carbon monoxide detection and warning equipment shall not be required in 
dwelling units and sleeping units where a carbon monoxide detection and warning 
equipment is provided in one of the following locations: 

2.1. In an approved location between the fuel-burning appliance or fuel-
burning fireplace and the dwelling unit or sleeping unit. 



51 
 

2.2. On the ceiling of the room containing the fuel-burning appliance or fuel-
burning fireplace. 

 
(Amd) 915.1.5 Private garages. Carbon monoxide detection and warning equipment 
shall be provided in dwelling units and sleeping units in buildings with attached private 
garages. 

Exceptions: 

1. Where there are no communicating openings between the private garage and 
the dwelling unit or sleeping unit. 

2. In dwelling units and sleeping units located more than one story above or below 
a private garage. 

3. Where the private garage connects to the building through an open-ended 
corridor. 

4. Where carbon monoxide detection and warning equipment is provided in an 
approved location between openings to a private garage and dwelling units or 
sleeping units. 
 

(Amd) 915.2.3 Group E occupancies. Carbon monoxide detection and warning 
equipment shall be provided in the locations specified in Sections 915.2.3.1 and 
915.2.3.2. 

Exception: Group E rooms with cooking appliances, laboratories and 
maintenance spaces. 

 
(Add) 915.2.3.1. Locations. Carbon monoxide detectors shall be located as follows: 

1. On the ceilings of rooms containing permanently installed fuel-burning heating 
equipment. 

2. Centrally located within the first room or area served by the first air supply 
register by each main duct leaving a fuel-burning, forced-air furnace. 
 

(Add) 915.2.3.2 Signage. A sign shall be provided at all entrances to such rooms 
indicating that carbon monoxide detectors are located within the space. 
 
(Add) 915.4.5 Interconnection of alarms. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be 
interconnected in accordance with Section 29.7.2 of NFPA 72. 
 
(Add) 915.5.4 Group E alarm notification. Carbon monoxide detectors shall be 
connected to the building fire alarm signaling system as a separate zone or zones. Such 
alarms shall activate a supervisory signal at the main control unit and any remote 
annunciators. Such alarms shall not activate the building evacuation alarm. 
 
(Amd) 915.6 Maintenance. Carbon monoxide alarms and carbon monoxide detection 
systems shall be maintained in accordance with NFPA 72. Carbon monoxide alarms and 
carbon monoxide detectors that become inoperable, begin producing end-of-life signals 
or have reached the manufacturer’s replacement date shall be replaced. 
 



52 
 

(Add) 915.7 Alterations and additions. When alterations or additions requiring a permit 
occur to buildings with Group R-3 and R-4 occupancies and to Group R-1 bed and 
breakfast establishments, or when one or more sleeping rooms are added or created in 
such occupancies, the entire occupancy shall be provided with carbon monoxide 
detectors located as required for new construction. The carbon monoxide detectors shall 
have a power source in accordance with Section 915.4.1. 

When alterations or additions requiring a permit occur to buildings with Group I-1, I-2, I-
4, R-1 other than bed and breakfast establishments, R-2 and E occupancies, or when 
one or more sleeping rooms are added or created in such occupancies, only the work 
area shall be provided with carbon monoxide detectors located as required for new 
construction. The carbon monoxide detectors shall have a power source in accordance 
with Section 915.4.1. For the purpose of this section, “work area” is defined as that portion 
or portions of a building consisting of all reconfigured spaces as indicated on the 
construction documents. “Work area” excludes other portions of the building where 
incidental work entailed by the intended work must be performed and portions of the 
building where work not initially intended by the owner is specifically required by this code.  

Exceptions: 
1. The carbon monoxide detectors may be battery operated or plug-in and are not 
required to be interconnected when other remodeling considerations do not require 
the removal of the appropriate wall or ceiling coverings to facilitate concealed 
interconnected wiring. 

2. Alterations to the exterior surfaces of existing buildings including, but not limited 
to, reroofing, re-siding, window replacement and the construction of decks without 
roofs, are exempt from the requirements of this section. 

3. Carbon monoxide detectors shall not be required in buildings not containing a 
fuel-burning appliance, fireplace or attached garage. 

 
(Add) 915.8 During construction. Pursuant to section 29-315b of the Connecticut 
General Statutes, whenever a single-family or two-family dwelling is occupied during 
interior alterations or additions requiring a building permit where a fuel-burning appliance, 
fireplace or attached garage exists, the temporary installation of battery-operated carbon 
monoxide alarms shall be required in the vicinity of such alterations or additions for the 
duration of construction activities. Combined smoke and carbon monoxide alarms may 
be installed to comply with Section 907.2.11.2.2.1 and this section. 
 

C H A P T E R  1 0  

MEANS OF EGRESS 
 
(Amd) 1001.1 General. Buildings or portions thereof shall be provided with a means of 
egress system as required by this chapter. The provisions of this chapter shall control the 
design, construction and arrangement of means of egress components required to 
provide an approved means of egress from structures and portions thereof.  



53 
 

Exception: Pursuant to section 29-292 of the Connecticut General Statutes, 
detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings 
(townhouses) not more than three stories above grade plane in height with a 
separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply with the 
International Residential Code.   

 
(Add) 1003.8 Security device. Any security device or system that emits any medium that 
could obscure a means of egress in any building, structure or premises shall be 
prohibited. 
 
(Amd) 1004.5 Areas without fixed seating. The number of occupants shall be computed 
at the rate of one occupant per unit of area as prescribed in Table 1004.5. For areas 
without fixed seating, the occupant load shall not be less than the number determined by 
dividing the floor area under consideration by the occupant load factor assigned to the 
function of the space as set forth in Table 1004.5. Where an intended function is not listed 
in Table 1004.5, the fire code official shall establish a function based on a listed function 
that most nearly resembles the intended function. 
 

(Amd) 1005.3.1 Stairways. The capacity, in inches (mm), of means of egress stairways 
shall be calculated by multiplying the occupant load served by such stairway by a means 
of egress capacity factor of 0.3 inch (7.6 mm) per occupant. Where stairways serve more 
than one story, only the occupant load of each story considered individually shall be used 
in calculating the required capacity of the stairways serving that story. 

Exceptions: 
1. Facilities with smoke-protected assembly seating shall be permitted to use the 
capacity factors in Table 1030.6.2 indicated for stepped aisles for exit access or 
exit stairways where the entire path for means of egress from the seating to the 
exit discharge is provided with a smoke control system complying with Section 
909. 

2. Facilities with open-air assembly seating shall be permitted to the capacity 
factors in Section 1030.6.3 indicated for stepped aisles for exit access or exit 
stairways where the entire path for means of egress from the seating to the exit 
discharge is open to the outdoors. 
 

(Amd) 1005.3.2 Other egress components. The capacity, in inches (mm), of means of 
egress components other than stairways shall be calculated by multiplying the occupant 
load served by such component by a means of egress capacity factor of 0.2 inch (5.1 
mm) per occupant. 

Exceptions: 
1. Facilities with smoke-protected assembly seating shall be permitted to use the 
capacity factors in Table 1030.6.2 indicated for level or ramped aisles for means 
of egress components other than stairways where the entire path for means of 



54 
 

egress from the seating to the exit discharge is provided with a smoke control 
system complying with Section 909. 

2. Facilities with open-air assembly seating shall be permitted to the capacity 
factors in Section 1030.6.3 indicated for level or ramped aisles for means of egress 
components other than stairways where the entire path for means of egress from 
the seating to the exit discharge is open to the outdoors. 

 
(Amd) 1006.1 General. The number of exits or exit access doorways required within the 
means of egress system shall comply with the provisions of Section 1006.2 for spaces, 
including mezzanines, and Section 1006.3 for stories or occupied roofs. 

Exception: Buildings of Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments shall only 
be required to have one exit.   

 
(Add) 1006.2.2.7 Group I-4 Day care means of egress. Group I-4 facilities, rooms or 
spaces where care is provided for more than 10 children who are 3 years of age or 
younger shall have access to not less than two exits or exit access doorways. 
 
(Amd) 1008.2 Illumination required. The means of egress from a room or space, 
including the exit discharge, shall be illuminated at all times the building space served by 
the means of egress is occupied. 

Exceptions: 

1. Occupancies in Group U. 

2. Aisle accessways in Group A. 

3. Within dwelling units and sleeping units in Groups R-1, R-2 and R-3. 

4. Within sleeping units of Group I occupancies. 

5. In Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments when illumination of the 
means of egress is initiated upon initiation of a fire alarm.  

 
(Add) 1008.2.4 Arrangement of illumination. Required illumination shall be arranged so 
that the failure of any single lamp does not result in an illumination level of less than 0.2 
foot-candle (2.15 lux) at the floor level. 
 
(Amd) 1008.3.3 Rooms and spaces. In the event of power supply failure, an emergency 
electrical 
system shall automatically illuminate all of the following areas: 

1. Electrical equipment rooms. 

2. Fire command centers. 

3. Fire pump rooms. 

4. Generator rooms. 

5. Public restrooms with an area greater than 300 square feet (27.87 m2). 



55 
 

6. Means of egress components, other than those within sleeping rooms, of Group 
R-1 Bed and breakfast establishments. 

 
(Add) 1008.3.6 Activation. The emergency means of egress illumination system shall be 
arranged to provide the required illumination automatically in the event of any interruption 
of normal lighting due to any of the following: 

1. Failure of a public utility or other outside electrical power supply.  

2. Opening of a circuit breaker or fuse.  

3. Manual acts including accidental opening of a switch controlling normal lighting 
facilities.  

 
(Add) 1010.1.1.2 Bed and breakfast establishments. Doors within and accessing 
Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments shall have a minimum clear width of 28 
inches (711 mm). Doors within and accessing bathrooms shall have a minimum clear 
width of 24 inches (610 mm).  
 
(Amd) 1010.1.2.1 Direction of swing. Side-hinged swinging doors, pivoted doors, or 
balanced doors shall swing in the direction of egress travel where serving a room or area 
containing an occupant load of 50 or more persons, an exit enclosure (unless the door 
serves an individual living/dwelling unit that opens directly into an exit enclosure) or a 
Group H occupancy. 
 
(Add) 1010.2.1.1 Bathroom doors. In Group R-4 occupancies, Group I-2 child care 
facilities, and Group I-4 day care facilities, bathroom doors that latch in the closed position 
shall be capable of being unlocked from the ingress side. 
 
(Amd) 1011.5.2 Riser height and tread depth. Stair riser heights shall be 7 inches (178 
mm) maximum and 4 inches (102 mm) minimum. The stair riser height shall be measured 
vertically between the nosings of adjacent treads or between the stairway landing and the 
adjacent tread. Rectangular tread depth shall be 11 inches (279 mm) minimum measured 
horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent treads and 
at right angle to the tread’s nosing. Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 
11 inches (279 mm) between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent 
treads at the intersections with the walkline and a minimum tread depth of 10 inches (254 
mm) within the clear width of the stair. 

Exceptions: 

1. Alternating tread devices in accordance with Section 1011.14. 

2. Ships ladders in accordance with Section 1011.15. 

3. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1011.10. 

4. Aisle stairs in assembly seating areas where the stair pitch or slope is set, 
for sightline reasons, by the slope of the adjacent seating area in 
accordance with Section 1030.14. 



56 
 

5. In Group R-1 bed and breakfast occupancies; Group R-3 occupancies; 
within dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; and in Group U 
occupancies that are accessory to Group R-3 occupancies, or accessory to 
individual dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies; the maximum riser 
height shall be 8 inches (203.2 mm) and the minimum tread depth shall be 
9 inches (229 mm); the minimum winder tread depth at the walkline shall be 
10 inches (254 mm); and the minimum winder tread depth shall be 6 inches 
(152 mm). A nosing not less than 3/4 inch (19.1 mm) but not more than 1- 
1/4 inches (32 mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers where 
the tread depth is less than 11 inches (279 mm). 

6. The riser height and tread depth of existing stairways in buildings 
undergoing addition, alteration, repair, relocation or change of occupancy 
that involve the existing stairways shall be permitted to remain, provided the 
greatest riser height within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest 
by 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) and the greatest tread depth within any flight of stairs 
shall not exceed the smallest by 3/8 inch (9.5mm) and the greatest tread 
depth within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by 3/8 inch (9.5 
mm).   

7. See Section 503.1 of the International Existing Building Code for the 
replacement of existing stairways.   

8. In Group I-3 facilities, stairways providing access to guard towers, 
observation stations and control rooms, not more than 250 square feet (23 
m2) in area, shall be permitted to have a maximum riser height of 8 inches 
(203 mm) and a minimum tread depth of 9 inches (229 mm).  

(Amd) 1011.5.3 Winder treads. Winder treads are not permitted in means of egress 
stairways except within a dwelling unit and within existing detached one- and two-family 
dwellings undergoing a change of occupancy to Group R-1 bed and breakfast 
establishments.  

 

Exceptions: 

1. Curved stairways in accordance with Section 1011.9. 

2. Spiral stairways in accordance with Section 1011.10. 
 
(Amd) 1011.7.2 Outdoor conditions. Outdoor stairways and outdoor approaches to 
stairways shall be designed so that water will not accumulate on walking surfaces. In 
other than occupancies in Group R-3, and occupancies in Group U that are accessory to 
an occupancy in Group R-3, treads, platforms and landings that are part of exterior 
stairways shall be protected to prevent the accumulation of snow and ice. 
 
(Amd) 1011.11 Handrails. Flights of stairways shall have handrails on each side and 
shall comply with Section 1014. Where glass is used to provide the handrail, the handrail 
shall also comply with Section 2407 of the 2021 International Building Code portion of 
the Connecticut State Building Code. 



57 
 

Exceptions: 

1. Flights of stairways within dwelling units and Group R-1 bed and breakfast 
establishments and spiral stairways are permitted to have a handrail on one 
side only. 

2. Decks, patios and walkways that have a single change in elevation where 
the landing depth on each side of the change in elevation is greater than 
what is required for a landing do not require handrails. 

3. In Group R-3 occupancies, a change in elevation consisting of a single riser 
at an entrance or egress door does not require handrails. 

4. Changes in room elevations of three or fewer risers within dwelling units 
and sleeping units in Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments and 
Groups R-2 and R-3 occupancies do not require handrails. 

5. Where a platform lift is in a stationary position and the floor of the platform  
lift serves as the upper landing of a stairway, handrails shall not be 
required on the stairway, provided that all of the following criteria are met: 

5.1. The stairway contains not more than two risers. 

5.2. A handhold, positioned horizontally or vertically, is located on one 
side of the stairway adjacent to the top landing. 

5.3. The handhold is located not less than 34 inches (864 mm) and not 
more than 42 inches (1067 mm) above the bottom landing of the stairway. 

5.4. The handhold gripping surface complies with Section 1014.3 and is 
not less than 4.5 inches (114 mm) in length. 

 
(Add) 1013.1.1 Accessible exits. Where exit signs are required by Section 1013.1 of this 
code, accessible exit doors at the level of exit discharge that lead directly to accessible 
paths of exit discharge shall additionally be marked by the International Symbol of 
Accessibility. Such symbol shall be not less than 6 inches (152 mm) high and shall be 
incorporated into the required exit sign or shall be located directly adjacent to it. Such 
symbol shall meet the requirements of Section 1013. 
 

(Amd) 1013.2 Low-level exit signs. Where exit signs are required from a room or space 
in Group R-1 occupancies, Group I-2 occupancies, and Group R-2 occupancies by 
Section 1013.1, additional low-level exit signs shall be provided at doors within exit 
access corridors serving guest rooms in Group R-1 occupancies, patient and client 
sleeping areas of Group I-2 occupancies and sleeping areas and dwelling units in Group 
R-2 occupancies and shall comply with Section 1013.5.  

The bottom of the sign shall be not less than 10 inches (254 mm) nor more than 12 inches 
(305 mm) above the floor level. The sign shall be flush mounted to the door or wall on 
the same plane as the door. Where mounted on the wall, the edge of the sign shall be 
within 4 inches (102 mm) of the door frame on the latch side.    

Exception: Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments.   



58 
 

(Amd) 1014.9 Intermediate handrails. Stairways shall have intermediate handrails 
located in such a manner that all portions of the stairway width exceeding 75 inches 
(1,905 mm) required for egress capacity are within 30 inches (762 mm) of a handrail. On 
monumental stairs, handrails shall be located along the most direct path of egress travel. 
 
(Amd) 1015.3 Height. Required guards shall not be less than 42 inches (1,067 mm) high, 
measured vertically as follows:  

1. From the adjacent walking surfaces including adjacent fixed seating. 

2. On stairways, and stepped aisles, from the line connecting the leading edges of 
the tread nosings. 

3. On ramps and ramped aisles, from the ramp surface at the guard. 

Exceptions:  
1. For occupancies in Group R-3 not more than three stories above grade in 

height, and within individual dwelling units in occupancies in Group R-2 not 
more than three stories above grade in height with separate means of 
egress, required guards shall not be less than 36 inches (914 mm) in height 
measured vertically above the adjacent walking surfaces. 

2. For occupancies in Group R-3, and within individual dwelling units in 
occupancies in Group R-2, guards on the open sides of stairs shall have a 
height not less than 34 inches (864 mm) measured vertically from a line 
connecting the leading edges of the treads. 

3. For occupancies in Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments, Group 
R-3, and within individual dwelling units in occupancies in Group R-2, 
where the top of the guard also serves as a handrail on the open sides of 
stairs, the top of the guard shall not be less than 34 inches (864 mm) and 
not more than 38 inches (965 mm) measured vertically from a line 
connecting the leading edges of the treads. 

4. For occupancies in Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments, level 
guards shall be not less than 36 inches (914 mm) high, measured vertically 
above the adjacent walking surface. 

5. The guard height in assembly seating areas shall be in accordance with 
Section 1030.17 as applicable. 

6. Along alternating tread devices and ship ladders, guards whose top rail 
also serves as a handrail shall have a height not less than 30 inches (762 
mm) and not more than 34 inches (864 mm) measured vertically from the 
leading edge of the device tread nosing. 

7. In group F occupancies where exit access stairways serve fewer than three 
stories and such stairways are not open to the public, and where the top of 
the guard also serves as a handrail, the top of the guard shall be not less 
than 34 inches (864 mm) and not more than 38 inches (965 mm) measured 
vertically from a line connecting the leading edges of the treads. 

 



59 
 

(Amd) 1015.4 Opening limitations. Required guards shall not have openings which 
allow passage of a sphere 4 inches (102 mm) in diameter from the walking surface to the 
required guard height.    

Exceptions:  

1. From a height of 36 inches (914 mm) to 42 inches (1067 mm), guards shall not 
have openings which allow passage of a sphere 4⅜ inches (111 mm) in diameter. 

2. The triangular openings at the open side of a stair, formed by the riser, tread and 
bottom rail shall not allow passage of a sphere 6 inches (152 mm) in diameter. 

3. At elevated walking surfaces for access to and use of electrical, mechanical or 
plumbing systems or equipment, guards shall not have openings which allow 
passage of a sphere 21 inches (533 mm) in diameter.  

4. In areas that are not open to the public within occupancies in Group I-3, F, H or 
S, and for alternating tread devices and ship ladders, guards shall not have 
openings which allow passage of a sphere 21 inches (533 mm) in diameter.  

5. In assembly seating areas, guards required at the end of aisles in accordance with 
Section 1030.17.4 shall not have openings which allow passage of a sphere 4 
inches (102 mm) in diameter up to a height of 26 inches (660 mm) above adjacent 
walking surfaces. From a height of 26 inches (660 mm) to 42 inches (1067 mm) 
above the adjacent walking surfaces, guards shall not have openings which allow 
passage of a sphere 8 inches (203 mm) in diameter. 

6. Within individual dwelling units and sleeping units in Group R-2 and R-3 
occupancies, guards on the open sides of stairs shall not have openings which 
allow passage of a sphere 4⅜ inches (111 mm) in diameter. 

7. In Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments, guards shall have balusters or 
ornamental patterns such that a sphere 6 inches (152mm) in diameter cannot pass 
through any opening. 

(Add) 1015.9 Retaining walls. Retaining walls where the difference in height between 
the finished grade at the top of the wall and the finished grade at the bottom of the wall is 
greater than 4 feet (1219 mm) shall be provided with guards complying with Sections 
1015.3, 1015.4 and 1607.9 when a walking surface, parking lot or driveway is located 
closer than 2 feet (610 mm) from the edge of the top of the retaining wall. For the purpose 
of this section, grass, planting beds or landscaped areas shall not be considered a walking 
surface. 

 
(Amd) 1019.3 Occupancies other than Groups I-2 and I-3. In other than Group I-2 and 
I-3 occupancies, floor openings containing exit access stairways or ramps that do not 
comply with one of the exceptions listed in this section shall be enclosed with a shaft 
enclosure constructed in accordance with Section 713 of the 2021 International Fire Code 
portion of the Connecticut State Building Code.   

Exceptions:  

1. In buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in 
accordance with Section 903.3.1 with other than Group H or I occupancies, exit 



60 
 

access stairways and ramps serving an occupant load of less than 10 not more 
than one story above the level of exit discharge.  

2. In Group R-1, R-2 and R-3 occupancies, exit access stairways and ramps 
connecting four stories or less serving and contained within a single residential 
dwelling unit or sleeping unit or live/work unit.    

3. Exit access stairways serving and contained within a Group R-3 congregate 
residence or a Group R-4 facility are not required to be enclosed.  

4. Exit access stairways connecting the first and second floors of Group R-1 bed 
and breakfast establishments. Stairways connecting the second and third floors 
in such occupancies shall be enclosed with fire separation assemblies having a 
fire-resistance rating of not less than 1 hour. Stairways connecting the basement 
and the first floor occupancies shall be enclosed with fire partitions having a fire-
resistance rating of not less than 1/2 hour with 20-minute fire-resistance rated 
door assemblies. Fire-resistance assemblies at stairways in Group R-1 bed and 
breakfast establishments shall not be required to be supported by fire-resistance 
rated construction. 

5. Exit access stairways and ramps within an atrium complying with the provisions 
of Section 404 of the 2021 International Fire Code Portion of the Connecticut 
State Building Code. 

6. Exit access stairways and ramps in open parking garages that serve only the 
open parking garage. 

7. Exit access stairways and ramps serving smoke-protected or open-air assembly 
seating complying with the exit access travel distance requirements of Section 
1029.7. 

8. Exit access stairways and ramps between the balcony, gallery or press box and 
the main assembly floor in occupancies such as theaters, places of religious 
worship, auditoriums and sport facilities. 

9. Stairways serving outdoor facilities where all portions of the means of egress are 
significantly open to the outside. 

10. Exit access stairways serving mezzanines complying with the provisions of 
Section 505 of the 2021 International Fire Code portion of the Connecticut State 
Building Code. 

11. Exterior exit access stairways or ramps between occupied roofs. 
 
(Add) 1020.1.2 Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments. A fire-resistance rating 
is not required for corridors in Group R-1 bed and breakfast establishments. Doors 
leading from guest rooms into corridors or hallways in Group R-1 bed and breakfast 
establishments shall be equipped with self-closing devices. 
 
(Amd) 1020.2 Construction. Corridors shall be fire-resistance rated in accordance with 
Table 1020.2. The corridor walls required to be fire-resistance rated shall comply with 
Section 708 of the International Building Code for fire partitions. 

Exceptions: 



61 
 

1. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in an occupancy in Group 
E where each room that is used for instruction has not less than one door 
opening directly to the exterior and rooms for assembly purposes have not less 
than one-half of the required means of egress doors opening directly to the 
exterior. Exterior doors specified in this exception are required to be at ground 
level. 

2. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors contained within a dwelling 
unit or sleeping unit in an occupancy in Groups I-1 and R. 

3. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in open parking garages. 

4. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in an occupancy in Group 
B that is a space requiring only a single means of egress complying with Section 
1006.2. 

5. Corridors adjacent to the exterior walls of buildings shall be permitted to have 
unprotected openings on unrated exterior walls where unrated walls are 
permitted by Table 705.5 of the 2021 International Fire Code portion of the 
Connecticut State Building Code and unprotected openings are permitted by 
Table 705.8 of the 2021 International Fire Code portion of the Connecticut State 
Building Code. 

 
 

(Amd) TABLE 1020.2 
CORRIDOR FIRE-RESISTANCE RATING 

 

OCCUPANCY 
OCCUPANT LOAD 

SERVED BY 
CORRIDOR 

REQUIRED FIRE-RESISTANCE RATING 
(hours) 

WITHOUT 
SPRINKLER SYSTEM 

WITH SPRINKLER 
SYSTEM c 

H-1, H-2, H-3 All Not Permitted 1 
H-4, H-5 Greater than 30 Not Permitted 1 
A, B, E, F, M, S, U Greater than 30 1 0 
R Greater than 10 Not Permitted 0.5 c / 1 d 
I-2 d All Not Permitted 0 
I-1, I-3 All Not Permitted 1 b, c 
I-4 All 1 e 0 

 
a. For requirements for occupancies in Group I-2, see Sections 1407.2 and 1407.3. 

b. For a reduction in the fire-resistance rating for occupancies in Group I-3, see Section 
1408.8. 

c. Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 where allowed. 

d. Group R-3 and R-4 buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system 
in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3. See Section 903.2.8 for occupancies where 
automatic sprinkler systems are permitted in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3. 



62 
 

e. For Group I-4 day care facilities that satisfy Section 903.2.6, Exception 2, a corridor 
fire-resistance rating of zero (0) shall be permitted. 

 
(Add) 1022.3 Group M occupancies. In mercantile occupancies other than bulk 
merchandising retail buildings, if the only means of customer entrance is through one 
exterior wall of a building, one-half of the required egress width from the street floor shall 
be located in such wall. For the purpose of this section, bulk merchandising retail building 
is defined as a building exceeding 12,000 square feet (1115 m²) in area in which the sales 
area includes the storage of combustible materials on pallets, in solid piles, or in racks in 
excess of 12 feet (3658 mm) in storage height. 
 
(Add) 1025.6.1 Size and location. Luminous egress path marking systems or devices 
shall be sized and located in exit access corridors as prescribed by Section 1025.2.4. In 
exit access corridors exceeding 120 inches (3,048 mm) in width, the marking shall be 
provided on both sides of the corridor. 
 
(Add) 1025.6.2 Device or system requirements. Luminous egress path marking 
systems or devices shall be listed and labeled and installed in accordance with the 
manufacturer’s installation requirements. Self-luminous and photoluminescent egress 
path markings shall comply with Sections 1025.4 and 1025.5. Such systems shall not 
incorporate arrows, chevrons, signs or alternating lighting patterns designed or intended 
to lead an occupant to any one specific exit in preference over another exit.  

Exception: Systems incorporating arrows, chevrons, signs or alternating lighting 
patterns designed or intended to lead an occupant in any one specific direction 
shall be permitted in common paths of travel and dead end corridors. 

 
(Add) 1025.6.3 Illumination. Luminous egress path marking systems or devices shall be 
continuously illuminated or shall illuminate within 10 seconds of a power failure. 
Illumination shall be maintained for a period of not less than 90 minutes following loss of 
power to the corridor within which the system or device is located. 
 
(Add) 1028.4.1 Remoteness. Where two or more doors leading to exit discharge are 
required, a minimum of two such doors shall be placed a distance apart equal to not less 
than one-third of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the building 
served, measured in a straight line between doors. Additional doors leading to exit 
discharge shall be arranged a reasonable distance apart so that if one becomes blocked, 
the others will be available. 
 
 (Amd) 1030.2 Assembly main exit. Pursuant to section 29-381a of the Connecticut 
General Statutes, in a building, room or space used for assembly purposes and provided 
with a single main entrance/exit, the main exit shall be of sufficient width to accommodate 
not less than two-thirds of the occupant load, but such width shall not be less than the 
total required width of all means of egress leading to the exit. This applies to Group A 



63 
 

occupancies that are newly constructed, have an increase in the number of occupants 
by addition or alteration or are created by change of occupancy. Where the building is 
classified as a Group A occupancy, the main exit shall front on at least one street or an 
unoccupied space of not less than 10 feet (3,048 mm) in width that adjoins a street or 
public way. In a building, room or space used for assembly purposes where there is no 
well-defined main entrance/exit or where multiple main entrances/exits are provided, 
exits shall be permitted to be distributed around the perimeter of the building provided 
the total width of egress is not less than 100 percent of the required width. 
 
(Amd) 1031.2 Where required. In addition to the means of egress required by this 
chapter, emergency escape and rescue openings shall be provided in the following 
occupancies: 

1. Group R-2 occupancies located in stories with only one exit or access to only 
one exit as permitted by Tables 1006.3.4(1) and 1006.3.4(2) or utilizing an 
exception to 903.2.8. 

2. Group R-3 and R-4 occupancies. 

Basements and sleeping rooms below the fourth story above grade plane shall have not 
fewer than one emergency escape and rescue opening in accordance with this section. 

Where basements contain one or more sleeping rooms, an emergency escape and 
rescue opening shall be required in each sleeping room, but shall not be required in 
adjoining areas of the basement. Such openings shall open directly into a public way or 
to a yard or court that opens to a public way. 

Exceptions: 

1. Basements with a ceiling height of less than 80 inches (2032 mm) shall 
not be required to have emergency escape and rescue openings. 

2. Emergency escape and rescue openings are not required from 
basements or sleeping rooms that have an exit door or exit access door 
that opens directly into a public way or to a yard, court or exterior egress 
balcony that opens to a public way. 

3. Basements without habitable spaces and having not more than 200 
square feet (18.6 m2) in floor area shall not be required to have emergency 
escape and rescue openings.  

4. Storm shelters are not required to comply with this section where the 
shelter is constructed in accordance with ICC 500. 

5. Within individual dwelling and sleeping units in Groups R-2 and R-3, 
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler 
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or 
903.3.1.3, sleeping rooms in basements shall not be required to have 
emergency escape and rescue openings if the basement has one of the 
following: 



64 
 

5.1. One means of egress and one emergency escape and rescue 
opening. 

5.2. Two means of egress. 

(Add) 3. Group E occupancies. In Group E occupancies, emergency escape and rescue 
openings shall be provided in every room or space greater than 250 square feet (23.3 
m2) used for classroom or educational purposes or normally subject to student 
occupancy. 

Exceptions: 
1. Buildings protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system in 

accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. 

2. Rooms or spaces that have a door leading directly to the outside of the building.  

(Add) 4. Group I-4 occupancies. In Group I-4 occupancies, emergency escape and 
rescue openings shall be provided in every room or space greater than 250 square feet 
(23.3 m2) normally subject to client occupancy. 

Exceptions: 
1. Buildings protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system in 

accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. 

2. Rooms or spaces that have a door leading directly to the outside of the building.  

 
(Amd) 1031.3.2 Minimum dimensions. The minimum net clear opening height 
dimension shall be 24 inches (610 mm). The minimum net clear opening width dimension 
shall be 20 inches (508 mm). The net clear opening dimensions shall be the result of 
normal operation of the opening. 

Exception: In existing buildings undergoing a change of occupancy to Group R-1 
bed and breakfast establishments, the net clear opening dimensions may be 
obtained by removal of the sash without the use of a key or tool provided the 
instructions for the removal of the sash are clearly posted on the inside of the guest 
room door. 

 
(Amd) 1031.3.3 Maximum height from floor. Emergency escape and rescue openings 
shall have the bottom of the clear opening not greater than 44 inches (1,118 mm) 
measured from the floor.  

Exception: In an existing building undergoing a change of use, the 44-inch (1,118 
mm) maximum height may be measured vertically above a fixed, permanent 
platform, step or steps whose minimum width shall equal or exceed the operable 
width of the opening and shall be centered on such opening. Any stairs or steps 
shall comply with Section 1011.5.  

 
(Add) 1032.2.3 Inspection of door openings. Door openings shall be inspection in 
accordance with the requirements of NFPA 80.   

 
 



65 
 

C H A P T E R  1 1  
(Amd) CODE REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING BUILDING 

 

(Amd) 1101.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to buildings for which a 
building permit was applied for on or after January 1, 2006, and prior to the adoption of 
this Code, and not undergoing any alterations, renovations, or change of use. Buildings 
for which a permit was applied for prior to, January 1, 2006 shall be governed by the 
Connecticut State Fire Prevention Code.  

(Amd) 1101.2 Intent. The intent of this chapter is to provide a minimum degree of fire 
and life safety to persons occupying existing buildings by providing minimum code 
requirements where such existing buildings do not comply with the minimum 
requirements found elsewhere in this code. 

(Amd) 1101.3 Conflicts. Where a conflict exists between a provision in this Chapter 
and a code requirement in effect at the time of construction, the code requirement in 
effect at the time of construction shall prevail. 

(Del) 1101.4 Owner notification. Delete entire section. 

(Amd) 1103.1 Required construction.  Existing buildings shall comply with not less 
than the minimum provisions specified in Table 1103.1 and as further enumerated in 
Sections 1103.2 to 1103.10, inclusive. 

The provisions of this chapter shall not be construed to allow the elimination of fire 
protection systems or a reduction in the level of fire safety provided in buildings 
constructed in accordance with previously adopted codes. 

Exceptions: 

1. Where a change in fire-resistance rating has been approved in accordance 
with Section 501.2 or 802.6 of the 2021 International Existing Building Code 
portion of the Connecticut State Building Code.   

2. Group U occupancies. 

(Amd) 1103.1.1 Historic buildings. Historic buildings shall be evaluated on a case-by-
case basis with use of the code modification process in accordance with section 29-296 
of the Connecticut General Statutes. 

(Amd) 1103.3 Existing elevators. Existing elevators shall comply with the Connecticut 
Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators.  

(Amd) 1103.4 Vertical openings.  Interior vertical openings, including, but not limited, 
to stairways, elevator hoistways, service and utility shafts, that connect two or more 
stories of a building, shall be enclosed or protected as required by Chapter 7.  



66 
 

(Del) 1103.4.1 Group I-2 and I-3 occupancies. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.2 Three to five stories. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.3 More than five stories. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.4 Atriums and covered malls. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.5 Escalators in Group B and M occupancies. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.6 Escalators connecting four or fewer stories. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.7 Escalators connecting more than four stories. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.8 Occupancies other than Groups I-2 and I-3. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.9 Waste and linen chutes. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.4.10 Flue fed incinerators. Delete section. 

(Amd) 1103.5 Sprinkler systems.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in 
existing buildings as required by Chapter 9.  

(Del) 1103.5.1 Group A-2. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.5.2 Group I-2. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.5.3 Group I-2 Condition 2. Delete section. 

(Del) 1103.5.5 Pyroxylin plastics. Delete section. 

(Amd) 1103.6 Standpipes. Standpipes shall be provided in existing buildings as 
required by Chapter 9.  

(Amd) 1103.7 Fire alarm systems.  An approved fire alarm system shall be installed in 
existing buildings and structures as required by Chapter 9 and provide occupant 
notification in accordance with Section 907.5 unless other requirements are provided by 
other sections of this code. 

Exception: Occupancies with an existing, previously approved fire alarm system. 

(Amd) 1103.8.2 Interconnection.  Where more than one smoke alarm is required to be 
installed within an individual dwelling or sleeping unit, the smoke alarms shall be 
interconnected in such a manner that the activation of one alarm will activate all of the 
alarms in the individual unit.  Physical interconnection of smoke alarms shall not be 
required where listed wireless alarms are installed and all alarms sound upon activation 
of one alarm.  The alarm shall be clearly audible in all bedrooms over background noise 
levels with all intervening doors closed. 



67 
 

(Amd) 1103.8.3 Power source. Single-station smoke alarms shall receive their primary 
power from the building wiring provided that such wiring is served from a commercial 
source and shall be equipped with a battery backup. Smoke alarms with integral strobes 
that are not equipped with battery backup shall be connected to an emergency electrical 
system. Smoke alarms shall emit a signal when the batteries are low. Wiring shall be 
permanent and without a disconnecting switch other than as required for overcurrent 
protection. 

(Amd) 1104.1 General. Means of egress in existing buildings shall comply with Chapter 
10. Where the provisions of this chapter conflict with the building code that applied at 
the time of construction, the most restrictive provision shall apply.  

(Del) 1104.2 Elevators, escalators and moving walks. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.3 Exit sign illumination. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.4 Power source. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.5 Illumination emergency power. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1104.6 Guards. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1104.7 Size of doors. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1104.8 Opening force for doors. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.9 Revolving doors. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1104.10 Stair dimensions for existing stairways. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1104.11 Winders. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.12 Curved stairways. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.13 Stairway handrails. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1104.14 Slope of ramps. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.15 Width of ramps. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.16 Fire escape stairways. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1104.17 Corridor construction. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1104.18 Dead ends. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.19 Exit access travel distance. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.20 Common path of egress travel. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.21 Stairway discharge identification. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.22 Exterior stairway protection. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.23 Minimum aisle width. Delete section. 

(Del) 1104.24 Stairway floor number signs. Delete section. 



68 
 

(Del) 1104.25 Egress path markings. Delete section. 

 

SECTION 1105 

(Amd) CODE REQUIREMENTS 

FOR EXISTING GROUP I-2 

(Del) 1105.2 Applicability. Delete section. 

(Del) 1105.3 Construction. Delete section. 

(Del) 1105.4 Incidental Uses in Existing I-2. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1105.5 Corridor Construction. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1105.6 Means of Egress. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1105.7 Smoke Compartments. Delete section in its entirety. 

(Del) 1105.8 Group I-2 care suites. Delete section. 

(Del) 1105.9 Group I-2 automatic sprinkler systems. Delete section. 

(Del) 1105.10 Group I-2 automatic fire alarm systems. Delete section. 

(Del) 1105.11 Essential electrical systems. Delete section in its entirety. 

 
 

C H A P T E R  1 2  
ENERGY SYSTEMS 

 
(Add) 1203.2.20 Electric fire pumps. Buildings provided with standby electrical power 
for the purpose of continuing operations or occupancy shall provide standby power in 
accordance with Article 701 of the 2020 NFPA 70, National Electrical Code, portion of the 
Connecticut State Building Code for any electric fire pump installed to provide an 
adequate water supply or minimum operating pressure to a required automatic sprinkler 
system. 
 
(Amd) 1205.2.3 Building-integrated photovoltaic (BIPV) systems. Where building-
integrated photovoltaic (BIPV) systems are installed in a manner that creates areas with 
electrical hazards to be hidden from view, markings shall be provided to identify the 
hazardous areas to avoid. The markings shall be reflective and be visible from grade.  
 
(Add) 1205.2.3.1 Required signage. Where a BIPV system is installed, a placard shall 
be provided on the outside of the building at the electrical service meter location to which 
the BIPV system is connected.  The placard shall display a firefighter Maltese cross with 
“PV” printed in the center of the cross.  The placard shall be not less than 4 inches by 6 



69 
 

inches in size and made of a durable material approved by the authority having 
jurisdiction. 

 
(Amd) TABLE 1207.6 

ELECTROCHEMICAL ESS TECHNOLOGY-SPECIFIC REQUIREMENTS 
 

COMPLIANCE REQUIRED b BATTERY TECHNOLOGY OTHER ESS AND 
BATTERY 

TECHNOLOGIES b 

CAPACITOR 
ESS b Features Section Lead-

Acid 
Ni-Cd 
and 

Ni-MH 

Lithium 
-ion 

Flow 

Exhaust 
Ventilation 

1207.6.1 Yes Yes No f Yes Yes Yes 

Explosion 
control 

1207.6.3 Yes a Yes a Yes No Yes Yes 

Safety caps 1207.6.4 Yes Yes No No Yes Yes 
Spill control 

and 
neutralization 

1207.6.2 Yes c Yes c No Yes Yes Yes 

Thermal 
runaway 

1207.6.5 Yes d Yes Yes  No Yes Yes 

 
a. Not required for lead-acid and nickel-cadmium batteries at facilities under the exclusive 
control of communications utilities that comply with NFPA 76 and operate at less than 50 
VAC and 60 VDC. 

b. Protection shall be provided unless documentation acceptable to the fire code official 
is provided in accordance with Section 104.8.2 that provides justification why the 
protection is not necessary based on the technology used. 

c. Applicable to vented-type (i.e., flooded) nickel-cadmium and lead-acid batteries. 

d. Not required for vented-type (i.e., flooded) lead-acid batteries. 

e. Reserved. 

f. Exhaust ventilation is required when flammable gasses are released under abnormal 
conditions.  
 
1207.6.1.2.4 Gas detection system. Where required by Section 1207.6.1.2, rooms, 
areas and walk-in units containing ESS shall be protected by an approved continuous 
gas detection system that complies with Section 916 and with the following: 

1. The gas detection system shall be designed to activate the mechanical 
ventilation system when the level of flammable gas in the room, area or walk-in 
unit exceeds 25 percent of the LFL or where the level of toxic or highly toxic gasses 
exceeds one-half (1/2) of the IDLH, or where gas indicative of venting from a 
lithium-ion cell is detected.  

2. The mechanical ventilation system shall remain on until the flammable gas 
detected is less than 25 percent of the LFL. 

3. The gas detection system shall be provided with a minimum of 2 hours of 



70 
 

standby power in accordance with Section 1203.2.5. 

4. Failure of the gas detection system shall annunciate a trouble signal at an 
approved central station, proprietary or remote station service in accordance with 
NFPA 72, or shall initiate an audible and visible trouble signal at an approved 
constantly attended on-site location. 

 
(Add) 1207.6.6. The thermal runaway detector shall activate upon detection of gas vapors 
produced by liquid electrolyte in a lithium-ion cell at the start of a battery venting event. 
Upon detection of gas vapors, the detection system shall shut down the affected ESS 
rack and transmit a fire alarm signal. Detection of a thermal runaway event shall activate 
the mechanical ventilation when it is provided as a method of explosion control. 
 
 

C H A P T E R S  1 3  t h r o u g h  1 9  

RESERVED 
 
 

(Del) C H A P T E R 20 
AVIATION FACILITIES 

 
Delete chapter in its entirety and replace with the following.  
 
 

(Add) C H A P T E R 20 
AVIATION FACILITIES 

 
(Add) 2001.1 Scope.  Airports, heliports, helistops, and aircraft hangers shall be in 
accordance with this chapter and Section 116 for items involving building construction, 
services or systems. Pursuant to section 29-291a of the Connecticut General Statutes, 
the Connecticut State Fire Prevention Code shall be applicable for oil burners, flammable 
and combustible liquids, gas equipment and piping, liquefied gas and liquefied natural 
gas, hazardous chemicals, and processes and activities that occur in the building or 
structure that are not used to support the building components services or systems, and 
for the purposes of prevention of fire and other related emergencies.  
 
(Add) 2001.2 Regulations not covered. Regulations not specifically addressed shall be 
in accordance with NFPA 407, NFPA 409, NFPA 410 and NFPA 415.  
 
(Add) 2001.3 Permits. The applicable provisions of Section 105.5 shall apply for permits 
to airport terminal buildings and hangars.  
 
 




