Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

February2018

Offi f Educati . .
and Data Management [ll Significant Changes to the

2015 International Residential Code
Spring 2018
Career Development|ll Milton Gregory Grew, AIA

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in writing by the State ob@BnneitS LIk NI YSy & 2F | RYAYA &GN} GA @S

2018 CONNECTICUT STATE BUILDING CODE
" SIGNIFICANT CHANGES TO THE
2015 INTERNATIONAL®
RESIDENTAL CODE "

Presented by

MILTON GREGORY GREW, AIA
for

State of Connecticut '

DepartmmWW
Office of Education & Data Management

February 2018

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 2F I!1IRY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Milton Gregory Grew, AlA

# Licensed architect since 1988
# Licensed building official since 1999

# Director of Permits & Inspections,
Town of East Hartford

# Grew Design, architectural practice

4 Connecticut Code Consultants

# AIA National Codes & Standards Committee
4 |CC Building Code Action Committee

# |CC IEBC Code Development Committee

Disclaimer

# The opinions expressed in this
presentation are solely those of the
speaker and do not represent the State
of Connecticut, State Building Inspector
or any municipality.

#While | have tried to be thorough there
may be errors or omissions.

# All code users should obtain and
familiarize themselves with the codes.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNRAGAY3I o0& (GKS {GFLGS 2F /2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIGYSYyd 2F I12R)Y



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

2018 Connecticut State
Building Code

#2015 International Building Code

#2015 International Residential Code
#2015 International Plumbing Code
#2015 International Mechanical Code
#2015 International Existing Building Code
#2017 National Electrical Code

#2009 ICC A117.1

#2018 CT State Amendments

Obijectives

# Review significant changes from the
2012 102015 IRC

# Highlight Connecticut Amendments to
2015 IRC

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NILIYSYyid 2F I3RY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

SIGNIFICANT CHANGES TO THE

Resources

Significant Changes
T Soft cover or

PDF download from
ICC Store

# |ICC has videos of key changes:

www.iccsafe.org/codes-tech-support/codes/2015-
changes/key-changes-irc/

Tracking Changes in the 2015
IRC model code text

# Solid vertical line = technical change

R301.2.1 Wind design criteria. Buildings and portions
thereof shall be constructed in accordance with the wind
provisions of this code using the ultimate design wind []
speed in Table R301.2(1) as determined from Figure
R301.2(4)A. The structural provisions of this code for

wind lnade are nat narmittad whasra serdind danicw fnoa ot

# Arrow = something was deleted

R322.1.8 Flood-resistant materials. Building materials
and installation methods used for flooring and interior and
exterior walls and wall coverings below the elevation
required in Section R322.2 or R322.3 shall be flood dam-
age-resistant materials that conform to the provisions of
FEMA TB-2.

R322.1.9 Manufactured homes. The bottom of the frame
of new and replacement manufactured homes on founda-

tions that conform to the requirements of Section R322.2
ar R277 2 ac annlinahla chall ha alavatad ta ar ahatwa tha

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materjals must be qpproved,in o 3
GNAGAY3 o6& GKS {GFdGS 2F /1 2yySOiA0Odziszs 5SLINIYSyd 2F 14RY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Tracking Change

# Single asterisk = something moved from here

provided with tfootings that extend below the
frost line.

Footings shall not bear on frozen soil unless the fro-
zen condition is permanent.

R403.1.5 Slope. The top surface of footings shall be level.
The bottom surface of footings shall not have a slope
exceeding one unit vertical in 10 nnite harizantal (10 nar

# Double asterisk = new location

R404.1 Concrete and masonry foundation walls. Concrete
foundation walls shall be selected and constructed in accor-
dance with the provisions of Section R404.1.3. Masonry
foundation walls shall be selected and constructed in accor-
dance with the provisions of Section R404.1.2.

k3K R404.1.1 Design required. Concrete or masonry founda-
tion walls shall be designed in accordance with accepted
engineering practice where either of the following condi-

Hama Awl

Accessory Structures
(R101.2 & R202 Definition)

#An accessory structiy
height has been increased from 2 to 3

stories.

# Accessory structures no longer have a
building area limitation but still must be
incidental to the dwelling on the same
lot.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materjals must be :ilpproved,.in o 3
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NILIYSYyid 2F I5RY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Electrical
(R101.4.57 CT add)

#|RC is the default electrical code for IRC
occupancies.

(Add) R101.4.5 Applicable electrical code. The applicable electrical code requirements for
buildings constructed under this code are those of chapters 34-43 of this code. The permit
applicant may elect at the time of application for permit to follow the requirsmeants of the 2017
NFPA 70 Mational Electrical Code portion of the 2018 State Building Code, as an alternative
compliance to the electrical requirements of this code. The applicant mustindicate this choice on
the permit application and on all construction documents.

Appendices
(R102.57 CTamd)

#CT Adopted Appendices:
A E: Manufactured Housing Used As Dwellings

A F: Passive Radon Gas Controls Methodg#eavily
amended)

A G: Piping Standards for Various Applications

A H: Patio Covers

A K: Sound Transmission

A O: Automatic Vehicular Gates

A P: Sizing of Water Piping System

A V: Wind Speeds, Seismic Design Categories &
Ground Snow Loads (CT completely)

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARGAY3T o6& GKS {dGF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NILIYSYyid 2F I6RY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

Accessibility Exemptions
(R104.10.2717 CTamd)

#0Only OSBI involved in reviewing and
approving.

(Add) R104.10.2 Accessibility exemption. Pursuant to subsecticn (b) of section 29-269 of the
Connecticut General Statutes, any variation of or exemption from any provisions relating to
accessibility to, use of and egress from, buildings and structures as required herein shall be
permitted only when approved by the State Building Inspector... Pursuant to subsection (b) of
section 29-269 of the Connecticut General Statutes, any person aggrieved by the joint decision
of the State Building Inspector may appeal to the Codes and Standards Committee within 30 days
after such decision has been rendered.

CT Removed Provision for
Research Reports

# This paragraph was in 2016 CSBC and
has been removed from 2018 CSBC.

(Add) R104.11.2 Research reports. Submission to the local building official of a valid research
report prepared by an approved evaluation service that supports the efficacy of use of any
material, appliance, equipment or method of construction not specifically provided for in this code,
or that demonstrates compliance with this code, may be deemed evidence of compliance with
this code.

0é

February 2018

GKS {G1FrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAQOdziz 5SLI NLYSyld 27

17R Y



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Flood Hazard Areas
(R105.3.1.1)

#lt i s the building
to make a determination of substantial
improvement to existing buildings in
flood hazard areas.

Wind Design Criteria for
Existing Structures
(R105.3.1.1.1 17 CT Add)

# Shoreline flood damaged dwellings may
be subject to some upgrading of
structure for wind resistance.

(Add) R105.3.1.1.1 Wind design criteria for existing structures. For structures where the
proposed work 15 determined to be a substantial improvement or restoration under R105.3.1.1
and having a wind Exposure D, structural elements that are uncovered shall be required to be
improved to meet the wind speed design criteria in R301.2.1.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GKS {G1FrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAQOdziz 5SLI NLYSyld 27

GNRGAY3

0é

February 2018

18R



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Wind Design Criteria
(R301.2.1.47 CT Amd)

# CT amends sections regarding exposure
category, wind direction and sectors,
surface roughness

# Surface Roughness B and Exposure
Category B will be used most often.

Component & cladding loads
(Table R301.2(2))

# The component and cladding table has
replaced basic wind speeds with
ultimate design wind speeds.

# Roof slopes are divided into new
categories for determining component
and cladding loads.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYyid 2F I9RY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GKS {G1FrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyY

GNRGAY3

Component & cladding loads
(Table R301.2(2))
At

TABLE R301.2(2)
COMPONENT AND CLADDING LOADS FOR A BUILDING WITH A MEAN
ROOF HEIGHT OF 30 FEET LOCATED IN EXPOSURE B (ASD) (psf)*®=**

EFFECTIVE ULTIMATE DESIGN WIND SPEED. V,,, (mph)
ZONE | WIND AREA
(feet) 110 115 120 130 140 150 160 170 180
1 10 100 | -13.0 100 | -140 10.0 15.0 10.0 18.0 10.0 21.0 9.9 24.0 11.2 27.0 126 | -31.0 142 -35.0
1 20 10.0 | -12.0 100 | -13.0 100 | -15.0 100 | -17.0 10.0 | -200 9.2 -23.0 106 | -26.0 11.9 | -30.0 133 | -34.1
] 0 100 | 2120 [ 100 [ 130 | 100 | 210 {100 [ 70 [ 100 [ 90 [ ss [ 220 [ 100 | 260 [ 108 [ 200 [122] 20
H 1 100 100 | -1L.0 100 | -13.0 10.0 14.0 10.0 | -16.0 10.0 -19.0 T8 22.0 10.0 | -25.0 10.0 | -28.0 113 | -320
£ ) 100 | 210 [ 100 | 230 [ 100 | 260 [ 100 [ 300 [ 100 [ 350 [ 09 | w00 | 112 | w60 | 126 | 520 [ 142 | 587
M 2 100 | <190 [ 100 [ 210 [ 100 | 230 [ 100 [ 270 [ 100 [ 300 [ 02 [ 360 [ 106 | <10 |1 [ 60 [ 133 | 24
E s0 100 | 160 [ 100 [ 180 [ 100 | 2190 {100 [ 230 [100 [ 260 [ 85 [ 300 [ 100 | 340 [ 108 [ 300 [122 [ aan
‘nn' 2 100 100 ] -140 10.0 -15.0 10.0 -16.0 10.0 -19.0 10.0 =220 T8 -26.0 10.0 =30.0 10.0 -33.0 13 =379
2| s 10 100 330 | 100 | 360 | 100 | 390 | 100 | 460 | 100 | 530 | 99 | 610 | 112 | 690 | 126 | 780 | 142 | 883
3 20 100 | -27.0 10.0 -29.0 10.0 32.0 10.0 38.0 10.0 44.0 9.2 -50.0 10.6 57.0 1.9 -63.0 133 -73.1
3 50 100 | -19.0 100 | -2L0 10.0 | -23.0 100 | -27.0 10.0 | -32.0 8.5 -36.0 10.0 | 410 108 | -47.0 12.2 | -53.1
3 100 100 | -140 [ 100 [ 150 | 100 | 2160 [ 100 [ 2io0 [ 100 [ 220 | 78 [ 260 [ 100 | 300 [ 100 [ 330 [ 13 | 570
1 10 10.0 | -1L0 100 | -13.0 10.0 [ -14.0 105 | -16.0 122 -19.0 140 | -220 159 | -25.0 179 | -280 | 202 | -32.0
] 20 100 | -0 [ 100 | 120 [ 100 | 130 [ 100 [ cie0 [ 1 | ciso [ 12| 200 [ 1as | 240 [ 164 [ 270 [ 184 | 00
1 0 100 | -0 [ 100 [ <1zo | 100 | 130 {100 [ aso {100 [ so [ | 200 [ 127 | 230 [ 143 [ 260 [ 160 [ 299
I » » 220 [ 126 | 250 [ 142 | 290
E‘ 2 Aoi7 deg=upto 1.5:12 (2012: 0 i 10) 440 [ 179 | 90 [ 202 | -sss
¢ A >7 i 27 deg = upt0 6:12 (2012:>10 i 80) [ oo lnil
A >27 i 45deg=upto 12:12 (2012: >30 i 45)
A wall

Component & cladding loads
(Figure R301.2(7))

GABLE ROOFS
7' <845 HIP ROOFS
T e =27
For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, | degree = 0.0175 rad.
Note: a = 4 feet in all cases.
FIGURE R301.2(7)

COMPONENT AND CLADDING PRESSURE ZONES

0é

February 2018

z

i

27 1R\



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

gNRGAY3

Sunrooms
(R301.2.1.1.1)
SRR
# 2015 IRC requires AAMA/NPEAINSA 2100-12
Sunrooms to Comply Wlth Specifications for
AAMA/NPEA/NSA 2100 sunrooms

(Editorially Revised)

1 2 Spcifications for
Sunroom® whi ch
contains requirements
for habitable and
nonhabitable sunrooms.

4 Sunroom: glazing >40%
of enclosing walls & roof;
either stick built wood or

prefab parts. B ﬁ;% i

MANUFACTURERS ASSOCIATION

Sunrooms
(R301.2.1.1.1)

#5 categories of sunrooms that affect
performance requirements:

# |: Thermally isolated; open or enclosed; screens or plastic film;
nonhabitable; unconditioned.

# |l : Thermally isolated; enclosed walls; plastic or glass, translucent or
transparent openings; nonhabitable; unconditioned.

# |l : Thermally isolated; enclosed walls; plastic or glass, translucent or
transparent openings; fenestration rqmts for air/water & structural
rqgmts; nonhabitable; unconditioned.

# |V : Thermally isolated; enclosed walls; separate heat/cool system or
controls; fenestration rqmts for air/water/thermal; structural rgmts;
nonhabitable; conditioned.

# V: Enclosed walls; open to main structure incl. heat/cool; fenestration
rgmts for air/water/thermal; habitable; conditioned

0é

February 2018

GKS {G1FrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 27 1IR)



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Sunrooms
(R301.2.1.1.1)

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNAGAY3T o0& GKS {GFGS 2F /1 2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyd 27 1IRY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

February 2018

Sunrooms
(R301.2.1.1.1)

]
MINIMUM |
AEGUREMENTS CATEGORY | | CATEGORY Il | CATEGORY M | CATEGORY IV | CATEGORYV | |
Structural design in accordance with the code. X | X X | X X ] ‘
Fenestration products must comply with AAMA/ | |
WDMAJ/CSA 101/1.S.2/A440 (includes resistance X X | X X |
to air leakage, water penetration, forced entry, |
etc., as well as structural design pressure rating). | | |
Comply with the Intemational Energy Conserva- ! [ X X |
tion Code® (IECC®) or IRC Chapter 11. | |
Comply with the foundation/footings, site loca- | ‘
tion, and emergency escape and rescue open- X X X X i X |
ings requirements of the code. \
Emergency escape and rescue openings are % |
permitted 1o open onto a sunroom |
Comply with the natural lighting requirements of X X X X X |
the code. ‘ ‘
Openings for natural lighting are permitted to X 1
open onlto a sunroom. | |
Comply with the requirements of the code for X X X i X 1
stairway and egress illumination. | I
Required to have exit lighting X X | X | X | |
Receptacle outlets as required by NFPA 70, Arti- ! X X ‘ |
cle 314 | | |

Figure R301.2.1.1.1

SUNROOM MINIMUM REQL}IREMENTS

Table from 2015 IRC Commentary

nNcr ease

protect openings.

Protection of Openings In
~Wind Borne Debris Regions
(R301.2.1.2)

@ |
roof hgt) for use of wood structural panels to

s height

s

from 2

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

0é

iKS

{aras 27

/| 2yySOGAOdzi £

5SLI NI YSyi

2F AR



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

Wind Exposure Category
(R301.2.1.4)

# Category A has been deleted (large city
center with taller buildings). Was removed
from IBC & ASCE 7.

# Category B unchanged. Most locations.
# Category C unchanged. Open terrain.

# Category D now applies to open water, mud
& salt flats, unbroken ice fields for a distance
of at least 5,000 ft & hurricane-prone regions
on or near ocean shore. Extends 600 ft in from
edge of unobstructed area. Wind takes some
time to slow down due to new obstructions.

Story Height for Walll Const
(R301.3) R

A Story height of wood &
steel wall framing, =
insulated concrete, and 3
SIP walls may not exceed E — B
1100. T -

A Masonry wall height is
Il imitedoto 136

0é

February 2018

GKS {G1FrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 27 14R)



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Story Height for Wall Const.
(R301.3)

-4
TABLE R602..
SIZE, HEIGHT AND SPACING OF WOOD STUDS*
BEARING WALLS NONBEARING WALLS
Maximum spacing Maximum spacing T Maximum spacing
STUD SIZE Laterally when a | when one  when supp g two spacing Lateralty
{inches) ted | roof- floor, plus a roof- fioors, plus aroof- | when supp g ng
stud height* or a habitable attic celling assembly or a | celling assembly ora | one ficor height* stud height* (
(teet) only attic (inches) (tesat) nches)
(inches) assembly (inches) assembly (inches)
2x3 | — — — — — 10 16
2x4 | 24 16° — 24 I 24
Ix4d 10 24 24 16 24 14 24
2x5 10 24 24 — 24 | 16 24
2x6 10 24 24 16 24 t 20 24

For §1: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

a. Listed heights are distances between points of lateral support placed perpendicular to the plane of the wall. Bearing walls shall be sheathed on not less than
one side or bridging shall be installed not greater than 4 feel apart measured vertically from cither end of the stud. Increases in unsupported height are
permitted where in compliance with Exception 2 of Section R602.3.1 or designed in with accepted ing practice.

b. Shall not be used in exterior walls.

¢ A habitable attic assembly supported by 2 x 4 studs is limit@ilto a roof span of 32 feet. Where the roof span exceeds 32 feet, the wall studs shall be increased
to 2 x 6 or the studs shall be designed in accordance with ted engineering practice.

See Table R602.3.1

Exterior Walls
(R302.1)

# Unprotected roof
overhangs are now
permitted to
project to within 2

ft of the property Fireblocking

ll_ne (FSD) \N_hen No fire-resistant

fireblocking is protection required 3

5 . " - <5 ft. NS 3

installed between o reesisiantaed s 8

the top Of the Wa“ NS = No sprinkler system ! E_g3

and the t‘OOf S = Sprinkler system ‘ g

sheathing. See totne €
Fire resistance rating is not required for roof eave projections =

footnotes in Table  when fireblocking is installed.
R302.1(1).

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 2F 1RY



Significant Changes to the

February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Townhouse Separation
(R302.2)

# Provisions for structurally independent
fire-resistant-rated walls have been
removed in favor of common wall
provisions.

# Common walls rated 2 hours w/o fire
sprinklers

Townhouse Separation
(R302.2

L il AW

o

Electrical installations are g4 Common 2-hour
permitted in common wall al fire-resistance-rated
Electrical boxes must meet —|™ ||/ wall continuous

f nt penetration

from foundation to

requirements. roof sheathing

No plumbing, |
<i——————————— mechanical, — =
//' ducts, or vents— ‘ v
J ,/« in common wall ¥ 1
& .
I
Townhouse Townhouse Townhouse Townhouse ]
dwelling unit A dwelling unit B dwelling unit A dwelling unit B ®
7 >
| 5
{ g
b £
One-hour common wall for townhouses with sprinklers E

Two-hour common wall for townhouses without sprinklers

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARGAY3 o6& GKS {dGF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYyid 2F 16RY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Fire Protection of Floors
(R302.13)

# Clarified that penetrations are
permitted.

d I $ I 1 ;L':
Manufactured
|-joists
Min. 1/2-in. gypsum board,
5/8-in. wood structural panel,
or equivalent material

International Code Council®

Basement space without
sprinkler protection

Fire protection of floors

Stairway lllumination
(R303.7 & R303.8)

# Interior & exterior stairway illumination
provisions have been placed in separate
sections. Conflicting language has been
removed.

# Code no longer prescribes location of
light source for interior stairs, allowing
design flexibility.

#No minimum illumination level for
exterior stairs.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARGAY3T o6& GKS {dGF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 2F 1RY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

February 2018

Stairway lllumination
(R303.7 & R303.8)

R303.7 Interior stairway illumination. Interior stairways
shall be provided with an artificial light source to illuminate
the landings and treads. The light source shall be capable of
illuminating treads and landings to levels of not less than 1
foot-candle (11 lux) as measured at the center of treads and
landings. There shall be a wall switch at each floor level to
control the light source where the stairway has six or more
risers.

Exception: A switch is not required where remote, central

or automatic control of lighting is provided.

R303.7.1 Light activation. Where lighting outlets are
installed in interior stairways, there shall be a wall switch
at each floor level to control the lighting outlet where the
stairway has six or more risers. The illumination of exte-
rior stairways shall be controlled from inside the dwelling
unit.

Exception: Lights that are continuously illuminated or

automatically controlled.

R303.8 Exterior stairway illumination. Exterior stairways
shall be provided with an artificial light source located at the
top landing of the stairway. Exterior stairways providing
access to a basement from the outdoor grade level shall be
provided with an artificial light source located at the bottom
landing of the stairway.

#New

squa

Minimum habitable room area
(R304.1)

# Requirement for one habitable room
with a minimum floor area of 120 SF
has been removed from IRC.

| anguage

have a floor area of not less than 70

re feet. o

nHabit

( Excenq

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {dGF3dS 2F [/ 2yySOiGAOdziz

5SLI NI YSyi

2F A&



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Minimum habitable room area
(R304.1)

Kitchen and <
Laundry
.

Bedroom
8-6 x 10-6

International Code Council®

Small dwelling complying with minimum area requirements

Ceiling Height
(R305)

# Min. ceiling height for bathrooms, toilet
rooms & | aundry r-®or

# The exception for allowing beams,
girders, ducts or other obstructions to
project t-4H0 widg haxip a&én
include basements w/ habitable space.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARGAY3T o6& GKS {dGF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 2F 1RY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Glazing Adjacent to Doors
(R308.4.2)

# Glazing installed perpendicular to a door
i n a closed positiorn
door only requires safety glazing if it is
on the hinge side of an in-swinging door.

(R308.4.2)

Glazing in windows adjacent and perpendicular to door ~ Windows adjacent and perpendicular to door

Glazing Adjacent to Doors

Safety glazing required Safety glazing required
in 2012 IRC in 2012 and 2015 IRC
Not required in

2015 IRC M

I
I

| &

No
Only window on hiny ge
a of in: swlg gd
safety glazi

International Code Council®

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GKS {G1FrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 27 20R)

GNRGAY3

0é

February 2018



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

February 2018

Glazing & Wet Surfaces

mor e

(R308.4.5)

#The exception from the safety glazing
requirements
from the water
bathtub, hot tub, spa, whirlpool or
swimming pool has been expanded to
include glazing that is an equivalent
distance from the edge of a shower,

sauna or steam room.

for gl

Jan Sl o}

Glazing & Wet Surfaces

SG = Safety glazing required

Measurements are to exposed glazing

Shower
7 ot 4 -
!
(@}
Hy SG
il 1 SG

<60 in. %
5 ks
: S
. <60 in. 3
] <60in.
;* 8
i 38
| . . Floor =
.- Plan view Section view .5
T
IS
3
£

Glazing facing shower

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

0é

iKS

{aras 27

/| 2yySOGAOdzi £

5SLI NI YSyi

2F 2IR\



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Emergency Escape & Rescue
OpeningsT EERO (R310)

# Section has been reorganized. Separate
provisions spell out the requirements for
windows & doors used for emergency
escape & rescue.

#No technical changes.

EERO for Additions, Alterations
& Repairs (R310.5, R310.6)

#Remodeling a basement does not trigger
installing in EERO

# Creation of new bedroom requires EERO

# Addition of a basement does not require
EERO if there is access to existing
basement w/ EERO

#®CT deletes R310.61 Alterations or
repairs of existing
R310.1(2) says the same thing.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYyild 2F 2RY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Means of Egress
(R311.1)

#Added AThe required
open directly into a public way or to a
yard or court that opens to a public

Stair Headroom
(R311.7.27 CT Amd)

#Lower ed -6fr ot#p0 66060 r e
or replacement stairways serving
basements or attics being converted to
habitable space.

]

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNRAGAY3T o0& (GKS {GFGS 2F /2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYyid 27F 2R\



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Stair Risers
(R311.7.3, R311.7.5.1)

#Vertical rise between landings has
il ncreased from 120 t

#Fully open risers pe
high rise, then r ed.U
opng.

# Open risers permitted on spiral stairs.

Alternating Tread Devices &
_Ship Ladders (R311.7.11,
R311.7.12)

#Brought in same provisions as in IBC.

# Cannot be used as an element of MOE.
# Can be used where MOE is not required
or required MOE serving that space is

located elsewhere.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {dGF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NILIYSYyild 2F 24RY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

February 2018

Ramps
(R311.8)

slope not greater than 1:8.

#Ramps that do not serve the required
egress door are now permitted to have a

Guard Height
(R312.1.2)

#Removed
requirement

to measure - W

=36 in

height from /
adjacent fixed

seating. R | ]

Measuring guard height at fixed seating

deck guard : IS

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

0é

GKS {dGrasS 2F /2yySOGAOdzis

5SLI NI YSyi

2F 25\



Significant Changes to the

2015 International Residential Code

Smoke Alarms
(R314)

#New provisions address smoke alarms
installed new bathrooms and cooking
appliances.

® R314.3(4): Smoke alarms shall be installed not
less than 3 feet horizontally from the door or
opening of a bathroom that contains a bathtub
or shower unless this would prevent
placement of a smoke alarm required by
Section R314.3.

(R314)

Smoke Alarms

R314.3.1: Smoke alarms shall not be installed in the
following locations unless this would prevent placement
of a smoke alarm in a location required by Section
R314.35.

1. lonization smoke alarms shall not be installed less than 20
feet horizontally from a permanently installed cooking appliance.
2. lonization smoke alarms with an alarm -silencing switch shall
not be installed less than 10 feet horizontally from a permanently
Installed cooking appliance.

3. Photoelectric smoke alarms shall not be installed less than 6
feet horizontally from a permanently installed cooking appliance.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

0é

GKS {GFrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyi

February 2018

2F 26R)



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Smoke Alarms
(R314)

<

Living Dining T
(o)} = 1
EE = I
T S :IQ Kitchen I
&4 £ Min. 10t
=<

p @0
IoAnization smoke alarm < O |y
with silence switch o< . O
Hall ﬂ Min. 3 ft.
:w j;
Bedroom Bedroom

* 4

International Code Council®

Smoke alarm distances from bathrooms and cooking
appliances

Mezzanines
(R325)

# New provisions place limitations on the
construction of mezzanines related to
ceiling height and openness consistent
with the IBC, so as not to be considered
a story.

# Definition (R202): MEZZANINE. An
Intermediate level or levels between the floor
and ceiling of any story.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in i 3
GNRAGAY3T o0& (GKS {GFGS 2F [/ 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIGYSyd 2F 2R\



Significant Changes to the

2015 International Residential Code

Mezzanines
(R325)

# Clear height above or below: 7 ft min.

# Aggregate area not more than 1/3 of the
area of the room in which it is located
and open to.

®0Openness with wall s
except when not more than 10% of the
mezzanine, or except 2 stories w/
sprinklers & 2 MOE

Mezzanines
(R325)

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

gNRGAY3

0é

GKS {GFrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyi

February 2018

2F 28\



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

Swimming Pools, Spas & Hot
Tubs (R32617 CT Amd)

#|RC model text points to ISPSC.

#CT is adding all text from previous 2012
IRC Appendix G.

# Updated ANSI reference standards.

Minimum Footing Sizes
(R403.1.1)

#The table for minimum footing sizes has
been expanded into 3 tables based on
the type of construction being
supported: light frame, light frame w/
veneer, and concrete or masonry.

# Tables apply to concrete footings only.

# Footing sizes increase for homes with a
crawl space or basement.

0é

February 2018

GKS {G1FrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 2F 2R)



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

February 2018

Minimum Footing Sizes

(R403.1.1)

Snow Load = 30 psf

Two-story house with basement foundation:

Light-frame construction
Soil-bearing strength = 2000 psf

28 ft. wide building with interior load-bearing wall (see footnote b)
Footnote b allows buildings with roof widths smaller than 32 ft. to
subtract 2 in. from the footing width for every 2 ft. of width less than 32 ft.

Minimum Footing Width

2012 2015
] Larger footing
2X6 7" —2x2" =13" 52 2
126 17 2RSS width required
13X6

Snow Load = 30 psf

4-inch brick veneer over light-frame construction
Soil-bearing strength = 2000 psf

Minimum Footing Width

2012 2015 Larger footing
B width required

32 ft. wide building with interior load-bearing wall

© International Code Council

Foundation Anchorage

(R403.1.6)

# Anchor Av AV
bolts are .' :

now
required
to be
placed in
the middle
third of sill
plates.

plate, then:
3%"/3=1%"
The edge of the bolt, not the bolt

head, should begin at least 1% in
in from the edge of the plate.

2x4 plates are 3.5 in. wide. If a bolt
needs to be in the middle third of the

2x6 plates are 5.5 in. wide. If a bolt
needs to be in the middle third of the
plate, then:

5% /3=1%"
The edge of the bolt, not the bolt

head, should begin at least 1% in
in from the edge of the plate

[ " F ]
" lw

3.5in.

Minimum edge distance

© International Code Council

55in.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

gNRGAY3

0é

GKS {GlFraGS 27

[ 2yySOGAQdziz 5SLI NILYSyi

2F BR)Y



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GKS {G1FrGS 2F /1 2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 27 BIR)

GNRGAY3

Retaining Walls
(R404.4)

# Retaining walls, freestanding walls not

of unbalanced backfill or resist additional

| at er al | oads with

unbal anced backfi lm
accoraance with accepted engineering

practiceo .

supported at the t of

.

Floor Joist Spans

(Table R502.3.1(1),R502.3.1(2))

# Changes to lumber capacities
# Spans for Southern Pine (SP) decreased.

# Spans for DouglasFir-Larch (DFL) and
Hemlock Fir (HF) have increased.

#2015 IRC span tables now in agreement

with wood standar ds@d

0é

February 2018



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Decking
(R507.1, R507.5)

#New Table R507.4 provides maximum
deck joist spacing depending on type of
decking and its orientation.

TABLE R507.4
MAXIMUM JOIST SPACING

MAXIMUM ON-CENTER JOIST SPACING
MATERIAL TYPE AND NOMINAL SIZE - —
Perpendicular to joist Diagonal to joist®
11/4-inch-thick wood 16 inches 12 inches
2-inch-thick wood 24 inches 16 inches
Plastic composite In accordance with Section R507.3 In accordance with Section R507.3

For SI: 1inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm. 1 degree = 0.01745 rad,

a Maximum angle of 45 degrees from perpendicular for vood deck boards

Deck Ledger Connection
(R507.2)

#The deck ledger section is reorganized to
better describe minimum requirements
for connection of deck ledgers to band
joists. No real technical changes.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYyild 2F BRY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Deck Lateral Load Connection
(R507.2.4)

#\When the prescriptive deck lateral load
connection that appeared in previous
editions is chosen, IRC now requires the
2 hold-down devices to be within 2 ft of
the end of the deck.

# A new lateral load connection option
prescribes 4 hold-downs installed below
the deck structure.

Deck Lateral Load Connection
(R507.2.4)

nnnnnnnnnn

CREW PREDRILLED W/ MIN. 3" PENETRATION
ENTER OF TOP PLATE, STUDS, OR HEADER

FIGURE R507.2.3(2)

Y:gggﬁ‘ggﬁ gggggg LAR DECK ATTACHMENT FOR LATERAL LOADS

A
v

FIGURE 507.2.3(1)
DECK ATTACHMENT FOR LATERAL LOADS

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYyild 2F BRY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Deck Joists & Beams
(R507.5, R507.6, R507.7)

#New Table R507.5 Deck Joist Spans
#New Table R507.6 Deck Beam Spans
#R507.7 Joist to beam bearing

2% in. min

—
/ Beam

Notched post

Connection of deck posts to deck beam

Deck Posts
(R507.8)

#New section establishes minimum sizes
of wood posts supporting decks &
describes requirements for connection to
footing.

R507.8 Deck posts.
For single-level wood-framed decks with beams sized in accordance with Table R507.6, deck post size shall be in accordance with Table R507.8

TABLE R507.8
DECK POST HEIGHT?

DECK POST SIZE MAXIMUM HEIGHT?
4x4 g
4x6 g
6x6 14"

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

a. Measured to the underside of the beam

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNRAGAY 3T o0& (GKS {GFLGS 2F /2yySOGAOdziz 5SLI NIGYSyid 27F B4R)



Significant Changes to the

February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Deck Posts
(R507.8)

R507.8.1 Deck post to deck footing.

Posts shall bear on footings in accordance with Section R403 and Figure R507.8.1. Posts shall be restrained to prevent lateral displacement at the bottom
support. Such lateral restraint shall be provided by manufactured connectors installed in accordance with Section R507 and the manufacturers
instructions or a minimum post embedment of 12 inches (305 mm) in surrounding soils or concrete piers.

ConcreTe RoST - DECT
Gl
2 7 \ ZiN ZAIS

B 1o % R e, il il
&= o S o FOOTING b
8| p.ao’s S
Bleesd 2 [ =4

ey e e

FIGURE R507.8.1
TYPICAL DECK POSTS TO DECK FOOTINGS

Fastening Schedule- Roof
(Table R602.3(1))

# The Fastening Schedule now contains
multiple nail size options. Clarification of
roof rafter connections at ridge, valley
and hip has been added.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYyid 2F BRY



Significant Changes to the

2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
| 2y ySOGAOdzi =

GNRGAY3

Fastening Schedule- Roof
(Table R602 3(1))

U TABLER602. 3(1) Fast

Spacing and Location
af Fasteners

Description of Building Elements Number and Type of Fastener* ¢
Item Roof
1 Blocking betwe ceiling joists or e " % 0.113") or 3-8d
rafters to l]]l( W con l"u‘] or.3-10d box_
3" pi " nails

2 Ceiling joists to top plate-tee-nait

3 Ceiling joist not attached

rf(rlapso er partitio —km-—nm-l—

e Sections R802.3.1, R
Rtmz .1(9)]

Collar tie to rafter, face nail or 1%4" x

20 gage ridge strap to rafter

6 Rafter or roof truss to plate-tee-net

Roof ra fl s to ridge, valley or lup
rafters of rafter to minimum 2
ridge I m

3-16d co
¢ or4-3"x0.131" nanl

3-84 4-8d box (214" XOIH”L&LLE.

common (24" X 0.131"); or 3-10d hox_
5 g

&—md“udh x{i 0.128"); o1

Par Table R802.5.1(9)

4—}04410(11))([3 uua) r3-10d
X 0,148"; or 4-3" X

3-16d box nails (3'" X 0.135%); or 3-10d
common n.ils (3’ X n.llﬂ’)m:_i;mhg&

Toe nail

Face nail each rafter

2 toe nails on one side and
1 toe nail on opposite side
of each rafter or truss'

Toe nail

Fastening Schedule- Wall

(Table R602.3(1))

# The Fastening Schedule now contains
multiple nail size options. Clarification of
double top plate splicing has been
added.

# Coordinated with IBC Table 2304.10.1.

0é

iKS

{aras 27

5SLI NI YSyi

February 2018

2F B6R)Y



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

gNRGAyYy3

Fastening Schedule- Walll
(Table R602 3(1))

77 TABLE R602.3(1) F:

of Building El Number and Type of Fastener* " © Spacing of Fasteners-
and Location
Item Wall
8 Stud t 404-3%%-6:128") 16d common 24" o.c. face nail

Built-up hsld
" spacer]

Top plate o top plate Beuble-top-plates— e 16d common (31" e 16°
Wl x 24-e-€: 16" 0.c. face nail

1 " X ; or 3" x " nails

Fastening Schedule- Wall
(Table R602.3(1))

Stirek-tosole .11 ue
platetorsnt 3- md 0x (314" X 0.135"); gujdmmmm
(234" X 0.131"); or 4-10d box (3" % 0.128");

£ 43" X 0.131" nail

2-46d 3-16d box (34" X 0.135"), or 2-16d End nail
common [3'%4" X 0.162"); or 3-10d box

18 1" brace to each stud and plateface-nail- 2-8d 3-8d gx (2% X 0. 113"]. or 2-8d
ﬁ_&]&aﬂ, or 2 staples 1%

20 X8 and wider sheathing to each mﬂgm(zw X ona")mm Face nail
bearingfece-nail 214" X
3 staples Wl_mlﬁw
Wider than 1" X 8" 3-8d 4-8d box (2'4” X 0.113"); or 3-8d common  Face nail
X ; or 3- X 5
or 4 staples 1% 1" crown, 16 ga., 1%" long

(Footnotes not shown for brevity and clarity.)

0é

February 2018

GKS {GFrGS 2F /1 2yySOGA0dzizs 5SLINIYSyid 2F BRY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

Fastening Schedule- Floor
(Table R602.3(1))

#The Fastening Schedule now contains
multiple nail size options. Clarification of
joist-to-band-joist (rim board)
connection has been added.

# Coordinated with IBC Table 2304.10.1.

Fastening Schedule- Floor
(Table R602.3(1))

TABLE R602.3(1) Fastening Schedule for Structural Members

ltem  Description of Building Elements

Joist to sill, top plate or girder

2 Rim joist, band jolst, or blocking to sill.
o top plate (roof applications also)

1" X 6" subfloor or less ta each joist

2 2" subfloor o joist or girder blind-and-
fave-nail-

2" planks (plank & beam - floor & roof)  2-46d 3-16d

o (3

% Band or rim
loist to joist

Built-up girders and beams, 2-inch
lumber layers

» Ledger strip supporting joists or raflers  3-46-4-16d box (3%* x 0.135;0r 3-16d. At each joist or rafter.
45" X ) or 4- face nail fi

(3" % 0,128 or 4-3" % 0.031" nail

Bridging to joist 2:10d (3* % 0,128 Each end, toenail

0é

February 2018

GKS {GFrGS 2F /1 2yySOGA0dzis 5SLI NIYSyid 2F BRY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

Stud Size, Height & Spacing
(R602.3.1)

#Deleted 2012 IRC Table R602.3.1 for
Ma X . Al |l owabl e

#The process for determining whether
walls studs, a wall, or a story must be
engineered based on stud height now
checks:

Table R602.3(5) 1 next slide

Section R602.10- Wall Bracing

Section R602.3.1, Exception 2(N/A in CT)

) p)

>

Lengt

Stud Size, Height & Spacing
(R602.3.1)

TABLE R602.365I_)
SIZE, HEIGHT AND SPACING OF WOOD STUDS®
BEARING WALLS NONBEARING WALLS
Maximum spacing Maximum spacing Maximum spacing
STUD SIZE Laterally when a | when one | when two spacing Laterally
(inches) unsupported [roof-ceilingassembly floor, plus a roof- floors, plus a roof- when i i
stud height* | ora habitable attic | ceiling assembly or a ceiling assembly or a one floor height* stud height* qpaz ng
(feet) assembly, only habitable attic habitable attic (inches) (feet) (inches)
(inches) assembly (inches) assembly (inches)
2x3° — — — - — 10 16
2x4 10 24 16° - 24 14 24
3x4 10 24 24 16 24 14 24
2x5 10 24 24 — 24 16 24
2x6 10 24 24 16 24 20 24

For SI: 1 inch =25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

a. Listed heights are distances between points of lateral support placed perpendicular to the plane of the wall. Bearing walls shall be sheathed on not less than
one side or bridging shall be installed not greater than 4 feet apart measured vertically from either end of the stud. Increases in unsupported height are
permitted where in compliance with Exception 2 of Section R602.3.1 or designed in accordance with accepted engineering practice.
b. Shall not be used in exterior walls.

c. A habitable attic assembly supported by 2 x 4 studs is limited to a roof span of 32 feet. Where the roof span exceeds 32 feet, the wall studs shall be increased
102 x 6 or the studs shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering practice.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

0é

GKS {dGrasS 2F /2yySOGAOdzis

5SLI NI YSyi

February 2018

2F BR)Y



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Headers
(R602.7)

# Girder & header span tables moved from
Chapter 5 to 6, header section.

# Multi-ply & single header tables are
combined.

# New section describing rim board
headers is added.

Headers
(R602.7)

- TABLE R602.7(1) |
GIRDER SPANS* AND HEADER SPANS® FOR EXTERIOR BEARING WALLS
(Maximum spans for Douglas fir-larch, hem-fir, southern pine and spruce-pine-fir® and required number of jack studs)
GROUND SNOW LOAD (psf)®
GIRDERS AND 2 [ b L
HEADERS SIzE Building width (feet)
SUPPORTING 20 28 36 20 28 3% 20 28 36
Span | NJ° | Span | NJ* [Span | NJ* [Span| NJ° |Span| NJ° [Span| NJ* |Span| NJ*¥ Span | NJ* | Span | NJ*
12x8 [ 46| 1 [310] 1 [35[ 1 [39[ 1 [32| 1 [210] 2 [ =] =1 =1 =1 =1=
1210 |58 [ 1 [an[ 1 [aa [0 [a0 [0 [aa |1 |37 2| == =T=1=1T=
12x2 611 | 1 [sn[ 2 s3] 2 [59] 2 |48 2 |38] 2 | =<1 =1=1=1T=
22x4 |36 [ 1 [32 [ 1 [200] 1 [ 32 1 |29 1 |26] 1 |20 1 |26 1 |23 1
22x6 | 55 [ 1 [48 [ 1 [a2 | 1 [a48| 1 [a1 ]| 1 |38] 2 |2 1 [38] 2 |33
22x8 [610] 1 [sn| 2 [54a| 2 [sn| 2 |s2] 2 |a7| 2 | 52| 2 a7 | 2 |+
oo ] 22x10 [ 85| 2 [93 ] 2 [66| 2 |73 2 |63 | 2 | 57| 2 [66] 2 |57 ] 2 |50 2
Roof and ceiling
22x12 [ 99 [ 2 [ws|[ 2 [76| 2 [85| 2 73] 2 |66 | 2z |76 ] 2 |66 2 [510 3
32xR R4 1 1.8 1 he 1¢ ce - e n Y ) = —
X8 |39 | 2 | 50| 2 |46 2 | 52| 2 [ 46| 2 |41 | 2 |49 | 2 |42 2 |390] 2
Roof, ceiling [732510 70 [ 2 [62 ] 2 |56 2 |62 | 2 56| 2z [0z [ 2 51z T
and one center-
bearingfloor | 22x12 | 81 | 2 [ 71 [ 2 [65] 2 |74 | 2 | 65| 2 |59 3 |68 ] 2 |sw0] 3 |33 3
32x8 [72[ v 63| 2 [ s8] 2 [6s] 2 [s81 2 Isa1 2 Isul 2 Tsal 2 I ax
> S |2 |30 2 |F0] 2 |34 2 [ 0] 2 [ 36| 2 || 2 |29
22x8 [ 50 [ 2 [a4 | 2 [310] 2 [410] 2 |42 | 2 [39 | 2 |46 ] 2 |30 ] 2 |36 2
Roof, ceiling 55570 61 | 2 |53 | 2 48] 2 |su] 2 [sa] 2 (&7 3 [ss 2 o2 T
and one clear
spanfloor | 22x12 [ 71| 2 |61 | 3 | 55| 3 |60 2 |su1| 3 |54 ] 3 |6a| 2 |56 3 |50 3
32x8 [ 63 [ 2 [s5[ 2 [410] 2 [61 ]| 2 | 53| 2 |48 ] 2 |57 ] 2 |&u| 2 | 45
32x10 [77 [ 2 [ 67| 2 [su| 2 [75| 2 |65 2 1591 2 lewl 2 60l 2z |32

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training rpaterjals must be qpproved,in . 3
GNAGAY3T o0& GKS {GFGS 2F /1 2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSyid 27 40RY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

-

Headers
(R602.7)

TABLE R602.7(3)
GIRDER AND HEADER SPANS* FOR OPEN PORCHES
(Maximum span for Douglas fir-larch, hem-fir, southern pine and spruce-pine-fir)

SUPPORTING ROOF
GROUND SNOW LOAD (psf)
- 5 I = = SUPPORTING FLOOR
DEPTH OF PORCH" (feet)
8 14 8 14 8 14 8 14
2-2x6 7-6 5-8 6-2 4-8 54 4-0 6-4 4-9
2-2x8 10-1 7-7 83 6-2 7-1 54 85 6-4
2-2x10 12-4 9-4 10-1 77 8-9 6-7 10-4 79
2-2x12 14-4 10-10 11-8 8-10 10-1 7-8 11-11 9-0

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.
a. Spans are given in feet and inches.

b. Tabulated values assume #2 grade lumber, wet service and incising for refractory species. Use 30 psf ground snow load for cases in which ground snow load

is less than 30 psf and the roof live load is equal to or less than 20 psf.

¢. Porch depth is measured horizontally from building face to centerline of the header. For depths between those shown, spans are permitted to be interpolated.

Headers
(R602.7)

No rim board header splices
Floor
over the header span ;
. joist
Single-ply or two-ply rim
board header as required
Joist hanger required when d

bearing distance is <12 in. \

Rim board header end or
splice 6 in. past outer
full height stud

One or more full height studs
per Section R602.7.2

Rim board header construction

— Cripples

@ International Code Council

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

GNRGAY3

0é

GKS {dGrasS 2F /2yySOGAOdzis

5SLI NI YSyY

February 2018

0 27F 4IR\Y



2018
Significant Changes to the February
2015 International Residential Code

Headers
(R602.7)

R602.7.5 Supports for headers. Headers shall be sup-
ported on each end with one or more jack studs or with
approved framing anchors in accordance with Table
R602.7(1) or R602.7(2). The full-height stud adjacent to
each end of the header shall be end nailed to each end of
the header with four-16d nails (3.5 inches x 0.135 inches).
The minimum number of full-height studs at each end of a
header shall be in accordance with Table R602.7.5.

TABLE R602.7.5
MINIMUM NUMBER OF FULL HEIGHT STUDS
AT EACH END OF HEADERS IN EXTERIOR WALLS

MAXIMUM STUD SPACING (inches)
HEADER SPAN [per Table R602.3(5)]

(feet)

16 24

<3 1 1

4 2 1

8’ 3 2

12 5 3

16’ 6 4

Bracing Rgmts Based on Wind
Speed (Table R602.10.3(1))

#Table values have changed slightly due
to use of ultimate design wind speed to
calculate required bracing length.

# Changed from 4 winds speeds (85, 90,
100, 110) to 5 (110, 115, 120, 130, 140)

# All bracing methods are now specifically
listed in the table.

i i ini ials must be approved in
ffice of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materia r 2 in 3
gsl\euc\)fi?xlcya 08 GUKS {G1FGS 2F /1 2yySOGAQdziz 5SLI NILIYSYild 2F 4Ry



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Bracing Rgmts Based on Wind
Speed (Table R602.10.3(1))

TABLE R

equirements Based on Wind Speed

w
Bra PC
Line Meth Method A
feet) LIB® GB S
10 3.5 3.5 0 20
0 65 6.5 5 35
30 95 9.5 55 45
40 125 12.5 70 6.0
50 15.0 15.0 9.0 7.5
60 18.0 18.0 105 9.0
10 7.0 7.0 40 as
20 125 125 5 6.5
30 180 18.0 105 9.0
40 235 235 135 ns
50 290 290 165 14.0
60 345 345 200 17.0
10 NP 10.0 6.0 5.0
20 NP 185 1.0 9.0
30 NP 220 155 130
40 NF 35.0 200 17.0
5 430 245 21.0
) 510 200 250

Contributing Length of CS-PF
Panels (Table R602.10.5)

# The contributing length of continuously
sheathed portal frames (Method CSPF)
in low seismic regions has increased by
50%.

#Based on testing and number of
fasteners.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T o6& GKS {dGF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYild 2F 4FRY



Significant Changes to the
2015 International Residential Code

February 2018

Contributing Length of CS-PF
Panels (Table R602.10.5)

TABLE R602.10.5 Minimum Length of Braced Wall Panels

Minimum Length? (in.)

Wall Height

Method (See Table R602.10.4) 8 ft. 9ft. 10ft. 11ft. 12 ft

Contributing
Length (in.)

H CS-PF

SDCA.B,andC 16 18 20  22° 24°
SDCD, D, and D, 16 18 20 22° 24°

1.5 X Actual®
Actual®

\ Two rows of nails

£ 6101 aspect ratio,
i min, 16 n.lengih

Comparison of nailing of CS-PF and PFG

{Portion

s of table and footnotes not shown for brevity and clarity.)

Steel strap
One row of nails
4:1 aspect

ratio,
min. 24 in. length

Method PFG

© Ilmamaricnal Code Council

Method PFH: Portal Frame w/
Hold-Downs (R602.10.6.2)

#Min. r e qcéapacity capacity of the hold-
downs is lowered to 3,500 Ibs from
4,200 in 2012 IRC.

# New testing confirms 2 sill plates are
sufficient instead of 3 r e qIH2012 IRC.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in

gNAGAY3 o0& GKS {dFraS$S

2F [/ 2yySOGAOdzi =

5SLI NIYSYyid 2F 44RY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

]
| ] L] L ]
-
4
| Extent of header with double portal frames (two braced wall panels) ————————————>-
< Extent of header with single portal frames
(one braced wall pane))
218 finished width of opening
| for single or double portal Tension strap per
A = ;1 Table R602.10.6.4
Ponywall | (on oppasite side
height of sheathing) 4l Fasten king stud
N — to header with
Min. 3in. x 11% in. net header; Steel header prohibited If needed, panel 6-16dsinkers
If % in. spacer is used, place on back-side of header splice edges shall
ocour over and be
Fasten sheathing to header with 84 nailed to common Fasten to
= common or galvanized box nails in 3 in. grid blocking within the Plateto P
; pattern as shown middle 24 in. of the header with
= Header to jack-stud strap per Table ——————" portal-leg height. wo rows of 16D
- R602.10.6.4 on both sides of opening One row of 3in. 0. sinker nails at
¥ b opposite side of sheathing nailing is raquired 3in. oc. typ.
2 in each panel edge. —_|
s % Min. double 2 x 4 framin et
\g covered with min. Min. % in. wood
EE % in. thick wood structural panel sheathing Typical portal il Mt
a3 with 8d common or galvanized box nails at frame construction ——._ | panei
2 3 in. 0.c. i all framing (studs, blocking, and i P oethin
sils) ty S I
P. Min. double 2 x 4 post
Min. length of panel per Table RB02.10.5 (king and jack stud)
Number of jack studs
} Min. (2) 3500 Ib. strap-type hold-downs per Tables R502.5(1)
(embedded into concrete and nailed into and (2).
framing) .
Min. reinforcing of foundation, one #4 bar A g2
e top and bottom of foating, Lap bars 15 in. min. Min. 1000 b. hold-down 5 3
device (embedded into 3t} o
concrete and nalled into i Y
framing) 2] 9
£ 2
e S
Min. footing size under opening s 12° x 12", A turned- g
down siab shall be permittad at door apenings. S
Min. (1) 4 in. diameter anchor bolt installed per 2
Section A403.1.6-with 2* x 2* x 15" plate washer H
£
Front elevation Section o)
S ] I . f - d W I I B .
p
-4
#Now allowed for up to 3 story dWG”IﬂgS,

wind exp. B or C w/ ult design wind
speed of 130 mph or less.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARAGAY3T 068 GKS {dGF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYyild 2F 45RY



Significant Changes to the February 2018
2015 International Residential Code

Masonry Walls
(R606)

# Sections R606, R607, R608 & R609 have
been organized into one section
providing requirements for masonry
construction.

# Masonry unit requirements now defined,
same as IBC.

@® Masonry veneer in Chapter 7 & masonry
foundations in Chapter 4.

Exterior Covering
(R703)

#Numerous changes regarding standards
for siding & veneer materials and
attachment methods.

Use of Office of Education and Data Management (OEDM) training materials must be approved in
GNARGAY3T o6& GKS {GF3dS 2F /2yySOiGAOdziz 5SLI NIYSYild 2F 46RY






