
S. Parenting and Childcare 
Advanced 
Knows what toys and activities are 
appropriate for child’s age and 
developmental level 

PPCC-9; PPCC-19 through 20; PPCC-22 through 24; PPCC-45 
through 47 

Knows how to access community resources 
for children (Early Intervention, DCF, 
WIC, etc.) 

PPCC-36 

Knows how to discipline a child without 
using extreme measures (hitting, 
screaming, withholding food or care) 

PPCC-21; PPCC-38 through 43; PPCC-88 

Knows how to make arrangements for 
regular childcare that is safe and 
appropriate 

PPCC-3 through 6 

Knows the importance of taking their child 
to childcare on time, picking child up from 
childcare on time 

PPCC-56 

Knows how to spend “quality time” with 
child each day (reading, talking, playing, 
listening to child, etc.) 

PPCC-45 through 48; NP-1 through 4; NP-115 

Knows where to go for help with parenting 
if needed 

PPCC-55; Several online resources 

Knows how to properly feed a child with 
age appropriate and nutritious foods 

http://www.babycenter.com/0_age-by-age-guide-to-feeding-
your-baby_1400680.bc 
 

Knows how to choose a pediatrician and 
knows the importance of regular well-baby 
visits 

http://www.babycenter.com/0_choosing-a-doctor-for-your-
baby_320.bc 
 
http://www.babycenter.com/0_doctor-visits-for-your-babys-
first-year_66.bc 
 
http://www.parents.com/baby/care/pediatricians-
medicine/well-baby-visits-for-your-baby/ 
 

Knows how to recognize age appropriate 
developmental milestones 

http://uppua.org/pdfs/CW%20II%20Handouts/Effects%20of%2
0Abuse%20and%20Neglect%20on%20Child%20Development/D
evelopment_Chart_for_Booklet.pdf 
 
http://www.child-development-guide.com/child-development-
milestone.html 
 
http://www.webmd.com/children/features/is-your-baby-on-
track 
 

Knows how to recognize and appropriately 
respond to child’s needs 

http://www.babycenter.com/0_12-reasons-babies-cry-and-how-
to-soothe-them_9790.bc 
 
http://kidshealth.org/parent/growth/learning/learnnewborn.ht
ml 
 
http://www.babycenter.com/0_what-every-baby-needs-to-
thrive_6600.bc 
 

Knows how and when to administer 
medication (prescription and OTC) to 
child. 

Refer to medically trained professional. 
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Parenting and Childcare PPCC-9 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-9 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-19 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-20 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-22 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-23 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-24 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-24 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-45 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-46 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-47 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-36 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-21 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-38 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-39 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-40 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-41 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-41 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-42 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-43 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-3 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-4 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-4 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-5 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-6 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-6 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-56 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-56 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-48 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-1 through 5 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-1 through 5 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-1 through 5 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-14 through 15 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-14 through 15 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-88 through 93 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-88 through 93 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-88 through 93 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-88 through 93 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-88 through 93 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-88 through 93 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-115 through 118 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 



Parenting and Childcare NP-115 through 118 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 



Parenting and Childcare NP-115 through 118 

 



Parenting and Childcare NP-115 through 118 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-55 

 



Parenting and Childcare PPCC-55 

 


