From: Jason Blinkhorn <jblinkhorn@qualtekwireless.com>

Sent: Tuesday, April 6, 2021 1:26 PM

To: townmanager@townofnorthbranfordct.com; CSC-DL Siting Council <Siting.Council@ct.gov>

Cc: Adam Trapani <atrapani@qualtekwireless.com>; Corey Michaud <cmichaud@qualtekwireless.com>;
Michael Cypranowski <mcypranowski@qualtekwireless.com>; Siyuan Liu <sliu@qualtekwireless.com>;
Karin Turner <kturner@qualtekwireless.com>; ATT Closeouts <attcloseouts@empiretelecomm.com>;
New England Compliance <newenglandcompliance@empiretelecomm.com>

Subject: AT&T SITE CT5184 CSC NTP REQUEST FOR EM-CING-099-210211

CSC team,
We would like to request NTP to start RF work 4-26-2021.
Alex/Karin,

Please see attached ZN102 for CSC COP requirements.

Thank You,

Jason Blinkhorn / Project Manager / 401-787-6007 / jblinkhorn@qualtekwireless.com
16 Esquire Rd, N Billerica MA 01862
125 Depot St, Bellingham, MA 02019

Disclaimer: This email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If you received this communication in error, please do not distribute it and notify us immediately by email (administrator@qualtekservices.com)
or via telephone (484.804.4500) and delete the original message. Unless expressly stated in this email, nothing in this message or any attachment should be construed as a
digital or electronic signature.



"uoioadsul Joj ajqejieAe Ajipead ‘9[d1yaA S,J0}0BJJUO0D BY) UIyIM 1day aq Aew pJied Siy} sa}is ajowal uQ
‘Aouednoo Jo 81edlIa) 10) paulnial 8q SN Jiwiad SIYyL

4 ‘81 <l 9
€C L 2 S
K44 91 0l v
%4 gl 6 €
‘0¢ 4] ‘8 c
61 €l L I

‘uolionJIsuod Jo wmmm#w SNOLIEA

ay} panoidde sey Jojoadsul ay} [nun paadoud 10U [|eys MJOAN -SIVAOdddY NOILO3dSNI ONIATING

"'seoueUIpJO Buluoz (B0 pue spo?) Bulp|ing a1e1g ayy Aq pesodwi sanjeusd
Ag paysiund aq |jeys Aljedioiunw sy} Ul @oUBUSIUIR| PUB ‘UoheIS)Y ‘Uononiisuo) ‘Buiuoz o) Bunejel seoueuIpIQ pue selniels 8yl Jo Aue a]e|olA [|eys oym uosiad Auy

‘uonejdwo) Apsads e 0] uoaiay) Yiom a8y} 81nossold pue Josisy ajep ay) Wodj
SHLNOW 9 ulyum Buipjing pies uo yiom uibaq |jeys pue Ajjedioiunw ayy ul sBuipjing jo eoueUS)UIB) PUB UOhRIS)Y ‘Uononiisuo) ‘Buiuoz o) Bunejel seoueuIplQ pue
s81N)e]S Y1 Jo suoisirnoid 8y} 0] pue 8921140 SIY) Ul 9jif uo uoieosljdde ay) Jo swis) 8y} 0] Wojuoo 10adsal AloAs Ul jeys Jiwiad siy) bundsooe uosiad sy} jey) pepiroid

0Zvl vl [9Jed 3001d/307 depnpeld dd NOXO4 0§l }e pejedoT

‘sBuimelp uoiONIISUOD payoeje
oy} Jad Jamo | Bunsixa ay) 1e suoneslipow paje|al Jaylo pue sjun olpey ajoway (9) ‘seuusiuy (¢) buiddems - uoneonyipol Juswdinbg |91V

:0} uoissiwiad sey
0711 avOod NOXO4 801 1vHL S31411430 SIHL

gG6-1¢ 49qunn jiuusd

00°000'0€ $ 10D pajewnsy
L 202/9L/€0 :pajueIs) ajeq — — Em m m Z — G — : m
:Ag panieoay —

08'0Zv $ ‘pled @94

133¥1S INOY4 319ISIA SI 11 OS AyvI SIHL 1SOd




PROJECT INFORMATION

TOWER OWNER: SBA
SITE NAME: EAST HAVEN (CT5184)
SITE ADDRESS: 108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471
LATITUDE: 41° 19" 42,937
LONGITUDE: —72" 49’ 08.04”
TOWER HEIGHT: 176'-0"+ AGL
RAD CENTER: 157'-0"+ AGL
ZONING JURISDICTION: TOWN OF NORTH BRANFORD
COUNTY: EAST HAVEN

DESCRIPTION OF WORK:
TELECOMMUNICATIONS FACILITY UPGRADE (LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR

APPROVED

By Stephen Roth at 5:11:11 AM, 3/24/2021

& RETRO):
MONOPOLE:

INSTALL:
(3) DMP65R—BU6DA ANTENNAS (ONE PER SECTOR)
(3) 4449 B5/812 RRUS (ONE PER SECTOR)

(3) 8843 B2/B66A RRUS (ONE PER SECTOR)
(6) Y CABLES
(1) SITEPRO—1 HRK14 HANDRAIL KIT

REMOVE:
(3) 7770 ANTENNAS (ONE PER SECTOR)
(6) LGP—21401 TMAS
(3) RRUS—11 B12 (ONE PER SECTOR)
(3) RRUS—12 B2B2 + A2 B85 (ONE PER SECTOR)
(3) LINES OF 1-5/8" COAX

EXISTING TO REMAIN:
(3) HPA—B65R—BUU—H6 ANTENNAS (ONE PER SECTOR)
(1) DC6—48-60—18—8F SURGE ARRESTOR
(1) 18 PAIR FIBER
(2) 8 DC LINES
(6) LINES OF 1—5/8" COAX

EQUIPMENT AREA/GROUND:

INSTALL:
(1) 6630
(1) IDLE
(2) 4478 B14 RRUS
(3) DBCT108F1V92—1 DIPLEXERS
(1) FLEX 12 CABINET
(1) BREAKER PANEL
(1) FLEX 16 DOOR UPGRADE KIT
(1) pc12

REMOVE:

(6) 782 10250 DIPLEXERS

SITE NUMBER: CT5184

FA# 10071146

SITE NAME: EAST HAVEN

PACE ID: MRCTB048461, MRCTB048640, MRCTB0485

18, MRCTB048533 & MRCTB048538

PROJECT: LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

N
PROJECT
LOCATION

VICINITY MAP

NOT TO SCALE

PROJECT
LOCATION

LOCATION MAP

NOT TO SCALE

DIRECTIONS:
FROM FRAMINGHAM, MA: TAKE 1-90 W. TAKE EXIT 4 TO MERGE ONTO 1-91 N TOWARD HOLYOKE. TAKE EXIT 26 FOR

MASSACHUSETTS 2 W/MASSACHUSETTS 2A E TOWARD GREENFIELD CENTER/NORTH ADAMS. AT THE TRAFFIC CIRCLE, TAKE THE

DRAWING INDEX

3RD EXIT ONTO MA—2 W/MOHAWK TRAIL. TURN LEFT ONTO MASSACHUSETTS 8A S. TURN LEFT ONTO W HAWLEY RD. NO. DESCRIPTION REV. DATE
CONTINUE ONTO S RIVER RD. THE SITE WILL BE ON THE RIGHT. T—1 | TITLE SHEET 2 03/15/21
GN—1 | GENERAL NOTES 2 03/15/21
A—1 | COMPOUND & EQUIPMENT PLANS 2 03/15/21
A—2 | ANTENNA LAYOUT & ELEVATIONS 2 03/15/21
A—3 | DETAILS 2 03/15/21
SN—1 | STRUCTURAL NOTES 2 03/15/21
GENERAL NOTES RF—1 | RF PLUMBING DIAGRAM 2 03/15/21
G—1 | GROUNDING DETAILS 2 03/15/21

PROJECT DIRECTORY

A&E / PROJECT MANAGER:
CENTERLINE COMMUNICATIONS
750 WEST CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
CONTACT: DAVID FORD

PHONE 844.748.8878

APPLICANT:

at&t MOBILITY CORP.
500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

1. THIS DOCUMENT IS THE CREATION, DESIGN, PROPERTY AND COPYRIGHTED WORK OF AT&T. ANY DUPLICATION OR USE
WITHOUT EXPRESS WRITTEN CONSENT IS STRICTLY PROHIBITED. DUPLICATION AND USE BY GOVERNMENT AGENCIES FOR TH
PURPOSE OF CONDUCTING THEIR LAWFULLY AUTHORIZED REGULATORY AND ADMINISTRATIVE FUNCTIONS IS SPECIFICALLY
ALLOWED.

2. THE FACILITY IS AN UNMANNED PRIVATE AND SECURED EQUIPMENT INSTALLATION. IT IS ONLY ACCESSED BY TRAINED
TECHNICIANS FOR PERIODIC ROUTINE MAINTENANCE AND THEREFORE DOES NOT REQUIRE ANY WATER OR SANITARY SEWER
SERVICE. THE FACILITY IS NOT GOVERNED BY REGULATIONS REQUIRING PUBLIC ACCESS PER ADA REQUIREMENTS.

3. CONTRACTOR SHALL VERIFY ALL PLANS AND EXISTING DIMENSIONS AND CONDITIONS ON THE JOB SITE AND SHALL
IMMEDIATELY NOTIFY THE AT&T REPRESENTATIVE IN WRITING OF DISCREPANCIES BEFORE PROCEEDING WITH THE WORK OR
BE RESPONSIBLE FOR SAME.

E

e,

w— at&t

at&t MOBILITY CORP.
500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

750 W CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
PHONE: 781.713.4725

REVISIONS

N

03/15/21 CONSTRUCTION REVISED

01/25/21/ISSUED FOR CONSTRUCTION

o

12/15/20 ISSUED FOR REVIEW

NO.| DATE DESCRIPTION
DESIGNED BY: APPROVED BY:
SS DC

IT IS A VIDLATION OF LAW FOR_ANY PERSON UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING
UNDER THE DIRECTION OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER TO ALTER
THIS DOCUMENT. UNLESS EXPLICITLY AGREED TO BY THE ENGINEER IN
WRITING, THE ENGINEER DISCLAIMS ALL LIABILITY ASSOCIATED WITH THE
REUSE, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF THE CONTENTS HEREIN.

SITE NAME:
EAST HAVEN

SITE NUMBER:
CT5184

SITE ADDRESS:

108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471

PROJECT TYPE:
LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

SHEET TITLE:
TITLE SHEET

DRAWING # REVISION:

=1




GENERAL NOTES

RFE NOTES

1. FOR THE PURPOSE OF CONSTRUCTION DRAWING,
SHALL APPLY:

THE FOLLOWING DEFINITIONS

CONTRACTOR — CENTERLINE COMMUNICATIONS
SUBCONTRACTOR — GENERAL CONTRACTOR (CONSTRUCTION)
OWNER — AT&T MOBILITY

2. PRIOR TO THE SUBMISSION OF BIDS, THE BIDDING SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL
VISIT THE CELL SITE TO FAMILIARIZE WITH THE EXISTING CONDITIONS AND TO
CONFIRM THAT THE WORK CAN BE ACCOMPLISHED AS SHOWN ON THE
CONSTRUCTION DRAWINGS. ANY DISCREPANCY FOUND SHALL BE BROUGHT TO THE
ATTENTION OF CONTRACTOR.

3. ALL MATERIALS FURNISHED AND INSTALLED SHALL BE IN STRICT ACCORDANCE
WITH ALL APPLICABLE CODES, REGULATIONS, AND ORDINANCES. SUBCONTRACTOR
SHALL ISSUE ALL APPROPRIATE NOTICES AND COMPLY WITH ALL LAWS,
ORDINANCES, RULES, REGULATIONS, AND LAWFUL ORDERS OF ANY PUBLIC
AUTHORITY REGARDING THE PERFORMANCE OF THE WORK. ALL WORK CARRIED OUT
SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE MUNICIPAL AND UTILITY COMPANY
SPECIFICATIONS AND LOCAL JURISDICTIONAL CODES, ORDINANCES AND APPLICABLE
REGULATIONS.

4. DRAWINGS PROVIDED HERE ARE NOT TO BE SCALED AND ARE INTENDED TO
SHOW OUTLINE ONLY.

5. UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE, THE WORK SHALL INCLUDE FURNISHING MATERIALS,
EQUIPMENT, APPURTENANCES, AND LABOR NECESSARY TO COMPLETE ALL
INSTALLATIONS AS INDICATED ON THE DRAWINGS.

6. "KITTING LIST” SUPPLIED WITH THE BID PACKAGE IDENTIFIES ITEMS THAT WILL
BE SUPPLIED BY CONTRACTOR. ITEMS NOT INCLUDED IN THE BILL OF MATERIALS
AND KITTING LIST SHALL BE SUPPLIED BY THE SUBCONTRACTOR.

7. THE SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL INSTALL ALL EQUIPMENT AND MATERIALS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH MANUFACTURER’S RECOMMENDATIONS UNLESS SPECIFICALLY
STATED OTHERWISE.

8. IF THE SPECIFIED EQUIPMENT CANNOT BE INSTALLED AS SHOWN ON THESE
DRAWINGS, THE SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL PROPOSE AN ALTERNATIVE INSTALLATION
SPACE FOR APPROVAL BY THE CONTRACTOR.

9. SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL DETERMINE ACTUAL ROUTING OF CONDUIT, POWER AND
T1 CABLES, GROUNDING CABLES AS SHOWN ON THE POWER, GROUNDING AND
TELCO PLAN DRAWING. SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL UTILIZE EXISTING TRAYS AND/OR
SHALL ADD NEW TRAYS AS NECESSARY. SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL CONFIRM THE
ACTUAL ROUTING WITH THE CONTRACTOR.

10. THE SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL PROTECT EXISTING IMPROVEMENTS, PAVEMENTS,
CURBS, LANDSCAPING AND STRUCTURES. ANY DAMAGED PART SHALL BE REPAIRED
AT SUBCONTRACTOR’S EXPENSE TO THE SATISFACTION OF OWNER.

11. SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL LEGALLY AND PROPERLY DISPOSE OF ALL SCRAP
MATERIALS SUCH AS COAXIAL CABLES AND OTHER ITEMS REMOVED FROM THE
EXISTING FACILITY. ANTENNAS REMOVED SHALL BE RETURNED TO THE OWNER'S
DESIGNATED LOCATION.

12. SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL LEAVE PREMISES IN CLEAN CONDITION.

13. ALL CONCRETE REPAIR WORK SHALL BE DONE IN ACCORDANCE WITH AMERICAN
CONCRETE INSTITUTE (ACI) 301.

14. ANY NEW CONCRETE NEEDED FOR THE CONSTRUCTION SHALL BE
AIR—ENTRAINED AND SHALL HAVE 4000 PSI STRENGTH AT 28 DAYS. ALL
CONCRETE WORK SHALL BE DONE IN ACCORDANCE WITH ACI 318 CODE
REQUIREMENTS.

15. ALL STRUCTURAL STEEL WORK SHALL BE DETAILED, FABRICATED AND ERECTED
IN ACCORDANCE WITH AISC SPECIFICATIONS. ALL STRUCTURAL STEEL SHALL BE
ASTM A36 (Fy = 36 ksi) UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED. PIPES SHALL BE ASTM
A53 TYPE E (Fy = 36 ksi). ALL STEEL EXPOSED TO WEATHER SHALL BE HOT
DIPPED GALVANIZED. TOUCHUP ALL SCRATCHES AND OTHER MARKS IN THE FIELD
AFTER STEEL IS ERECTED USING A COMPATIBLE ZINC RICH PAINT.

16. CONSTRUCTION SHALL COMPLY WITH SPECIFICATIONS AND "GENERAL
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES FOR CONSTRUCTION OF AT&T MOBILITY SITES.”

17. SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL VERIFY ALL EXISTING DIMENSIONS AND CONDITIONS
PRIOR TO COMMENCING ANY WORK. ALL DIMENSIONS OF EXISTING CONSTRUCTION
SHOWN ON THE DRAWINGS MUST BE VERIFIED. SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL NOTIFY
THE CONTRACTOR OF ANY DISCREPANCIES PRIOR TO ORDERING MATERIAL OR
PROCEEDING WITH CONSTRUCTION.

18. THE EXISTING CELL SITE IS IN FULL COMMERCIAL QOPERATION. ANY
CONSTRUCTION WORK BY SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL NQOT DISRUPT THE EXISTING
NORMAL QOPERATION. ANY WORK ON EXISTING EQUIPMENT MUST BE COORDINATED
WITH CONTRACTOR. ALSO, WORK SHOULD BE SCHEDULED FOR AN APPROPRIATE
MAINTENANCE WINDOW USUALLY IN LOW TRAFFIC PERIODS AFTER MIDNIGHT.

19. SINCE THE CELL SITE IS ACTIVE, ALL SAFETY PRECAUTIONS MUST BE TAKEN
WHEN WORKING AROUND HIGH LEVELS OF ELECTROMAGNETIC RADIATION.
EQUIPMENT SHOULD BE SHUTDOWN PRIOR TO PERFORMING ANY WORK THAT
COULD EXPOSE THE WORKERS TO DANGER. PERSONAL RF EXPOSURE MONITORS
ARE ADVISED TO BE WORN TO ALERT OF ANY DANGEROUS EXPOSURE LEVELS.

20. APPLICABLE BUILDING CODES:
SUBCONTRACTOR'S WORK SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE NATIONAL, STATE,
AND LOCAL CODES AS ADOPTED BY THE LOCAL AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION
(AHJ) FOR THE LOCATION. THE EDITION OF THE AHJ ADOPTED CODES AND
STANDARDS IN EFFECT ON THE DATE OF CONTRACT AWARD SHALL GOVERN THE
DESIGN.

BUILDING CODE: IBC 2015 & CONNECTICUT STATE BUILDING CODE 2018

ELECTRICAL CODE: 2017 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

LIGHTING CODE: NFPA 70-2017

SUBCONTRACTOR'S WORK SHALL COMPLY WITH THE LATEST EDITION OF THE
FOLLOWING STANDARDS:

AMERICAN CONCRETE INSTITUTE (ACI) 318; BUILDING CODE
REQUIREMENTS FOR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE;

AMERICAN INSTITUTE OF STEEL CONSTRUCTION (AISC)
MANUAL OF STEEL CONSTRUCTION, ASD, FOURTEENTH EDITION;

TELECOMMUNICATIONS INDUSTRY ASSOCIATION (TIA) 222-G,
STRUCTURAL STANDARDS FOR STEEL

ANTENNA TOWER AND ANTENNA SUPPORTING STRUCTURES; REFER
TO ELECTRICAL DRAWINGS FOR SPECIFIC ELECTRICAL STANDARDS.

FOR ANY CONFLICTS BETWEEN SECTIONS OF LISTED CODES AND STANDARDS
REGARDING MATERIAL, METHODS GOF CONSTRUCTION, OR OTHER REQUIREMENTS,
THE MOST RESTRICTIVE REQUIREMENT SHALL GOVERN. WHERE THERE IS CONFLICT
BETWEEN A GENERAL REQUIREMENT AND A SPECIFIC REQUIREMENT, THE SPECIFIC
REQUIREMENT SHALL GOVERN.

ABBREVIATIONS

AGL ABOVE GRADE LEVEL G.C. GENERAL CONTRACTOR  RF RADIO FREQUENCY
AWG AMERICAN WIRE GAUGE MGB MASTER GROUND BUS
BCW BARE COPPER WIRE MIN MINIMUM TBD TO BE DETERMINED
BTS BASE TRANSCEIVER STATION PROPOSED  NEW TBR  TO BE REMOVED
EXISTING EXISTING N.T.S. NOT TO SCALE TBRR TO BE REMOVED

AND REPLACED
EG EQUIPMENT GROUND REF REFERENCE

TYP TYPICAL

EGR EQUIPMENT GROUND RING REQ REQUIRED

ACTUAL LENGTHS SHALL BE DETERMINED PER SITE CONDITION BY SUBCONTRACTOR
THE DESIGN IS BASED ON RF DATA SHEETS, SIGNED AND APPROVED.

RADIO SIGNAL CABLE AND RACEWAY SHALL COMPLY WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF
THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (NEC, NFPA 70), CHAPTER 8.

ALL SPECIFIED MATERIAL FOR EACH LOCATION (E.G. OUT DOORS—OCCUPIED,
INDOORS—UNOCCUPIED, PLENUMS, RISER SHAFTS, ETC.) SHALL BE APPROVED,
LISTED, OR LABELED AS REQUIRED BY THE NEC.

RADIO SIGNAL CABLE SHALL BE SUPPORTED AT MINIMUM OF EVERY THREE (3) FEET
EXCEPT INSIDE MONOPOLES OR MONOPOLES WHERE CABLE AND CONNECTOR
MANUFACTURERS SUPPORT RECOMMENDATIONS SHALL BE FOLLOWED. MANUFACTURER
RECOMMENDATION CABLES SUPPORT ACCESSORIES SHALL BE USED.

THE QUTDOOR CABLE SUPPORT SYSTEM SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH AN ICE SHIELD
TO SUPPORT AND PROTECT ANTENNA CABLE RUNS

DRIP LOOPS SHALL BE REQUIRED ON ALL OUTSIDE CABLES. CABLES SHALL BE
SLOPED AWAY FROM BUILDING OR OUTDOOR BTS CABINETS TO PREVENT WATER
FROM ENTERING THROUGH THE COAXIAL CABLE PORT.

ALL FEEDER LINE AND JUMPER CONNECTORS SHALL BE 7/16 DIN CABLE
CONNECTORS THAT MEET IP68 STANDARDS

7/16 DIN CONNECTORS REQUIRE NO ADDITIONAL WEATHER PROOFING IN INDOOR
APPLICATIONS IF INSTALLED AND TORQUED PROPERLY. IN OUTDOOR APPLICATIONS
WEATHER PROOFING IS REQUIRED AND THE FOLLOWING PROCEDURE SHOULD BE
FOLLOWED.

. USING WEATHERPROOFING KIT APPROVED BY CABLE MANUFACTURER AND

CONTRACTOR START TAPE APPROXIMATELY 5 INCHES FROM THE CONNECTOR, AND
WRAP 2 INCHES TOWARD THE CONNECTOR, THEN REVERSE THE TAPE SO THAT THE
STICKY SIDE IS UP. TAPE OVER THE CONNECTOR OR SURGE ARRESTOR UNTIL THREE
(3) TO FOUR (4) INCHES BEYOND THE CONNECTOR AND REVERSE AGAIN WITH THE
STICKY SIDE DOWN FOR ANOTHER INCH OR TWO. PASS THE BUTYL RUBBER AND
FINISH WITH A FINAL LAYER OF TAPE.

. ANTENNAS SHALL BE PAINTED,WHEN REQUIRED, BY THE LANDLORD OR AUTHORITY OF

HAVING JURISDICTION IN ACCORDANCE WITH ANTENNA MANUFACTURERS' SURFACES
PREPARATION AND PAINTING REQUIREMENTS.

. CABLE SHIELDS AND TOWER CONDUITS SHALL BE GROUNDED AT THE TOP OF THE

TOWER WITHIN 10 FEET OF THEIR CONNECTORS, AND AT THE BOTTOM OF THE
TOWER ABOUT 6 INCHES BEFORE THEY TURN TOWARD THE FACILITY. THEY SHALL BE
GROUNDED AT THE MIDPOINT OF THE TOWERS THAT ARE BETWEEN 60 FEET AND
200 FEET HIGH, AND AT INTERVALS OF 60 FEET OR LESS ON TOWERS THAT ARE
HIGHER THAN 200 FEET.

ANTENNA CABLE AND SCHEDULING NOTES

1 SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL VERIFY THE ACTUAL LENGTH IN THE FIELD BEFORE
INSTALLATION.

2. TAG AND COLOR CODE ALL MAIN CABLES AT LOCATIONS PER AT&T ANTENNA
CABLE MARKING STANDARD:

TOP OF TOWER END OF MAIN COAX

BOTTOM OF TOWER END OF MAIN COAX
DIRECTLY BEFORE AND AFTER RF EQUIPMENT
END OF JUMPERS AT BTS EQUIPMENT

3. ANTENNAS SHALL BE PROCURED AND INSTALLED WITH DOWN TILT MOUNTING
BRACKETS SUPPLIED BY ANTENNA MANUFACTURER.

4.  PRIOR APPRQOVAL IS REQUIRED BEFORE PERFORMING ANY WORK ON EXISTING
CELL SITE EQUIPMENT.

atat

at&t MOBILITY CORP.
500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

750 W CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
PHONE: 781.713.4725

REVISIONS

2 (03/15/21 CONSTRUCTION REVISED
1]01/25/21/ISSUED FOR CONSTRUCTION
12/15/20 ISSUED FOR REVIEW
NO.| DATE DESCRIPTION
DESIGNED BY: APPROVED BY:

SS DC

IT IS A VIOLATION OF LAW FOR_ANY PERSON UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING
UNDER THE DIRECTION OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER TO ALTER
THIS DOCUMENT. UNLESS EXPLICITLY AGREED TO BY THE ENGINEER IN
WRITING, THE ENGINEER DISCLAIMS ALL LIABILITY ASSOCIATED WITH THE
REUSE, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF THE CONTENTS HEREIN.

SITE NAME:

EAST HAVEN

SITE NUMBER:

CT5184

SITE ADDRESS:

108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471

PROJECT TYPE:

LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

SHEET TITLE:

GENERAL NOTES

DRAWING éN - W

REVISION:




NOTES:
1. REFERENCE STRUCTURAL ANALYSIS BY 4 g%g )
OTHERS FOR FURTHER INFORMATION ~%)
REGARDING THE CAPACITY OF THE %&’!’ a &
EXISTING STRUCTURE TO SUPPORT &V ot
THIS EQUIPMENT UPGRADE. -

at&t MOBILITY CORP.

2. REFERTO THE FINAL RF DATA SHEET 500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
FOR FINAL ANTENNA SETTINGS. ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

750 W CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
PHONE: 781.713.4725

(3) COAX (TO BE REMOVED)

A REVISIONS
(6) COAX, (1) FIBER & (2) DC AN
POWER (TO REMAIN)
EXISTING ACCESS EXISTING COMPOUND }\
GATE FENCE EXISTING GPS ANTENNA
EXISTING COMPOUND PROPOSED(]}DC 2 05/15/21 CONSTRUCTION REVISED
\V UTILITY/METER 1 01/25/21ISSUED FOR CONSTRUCTION
\f BREAKER PANEL
X ! X X X x—, CENTER FRAME O 0 [12/15/2 ISSUED FOR REVIEW
PROPOSED FLX16 X NO.| DATE DESCRIPTION
— EXISTING SPRINT PROPOSED FLX12 DOOR UPGRADE KIT
o A—1= = UTILITY CABINETS ON CABINET % DESIGNED BY: APPROVED BY:
H—FRAME PROPOSED (1) ss DC
EXISTING AT&T 6630 & (1) IDLe \
= OVERHEAD CANOF’Y
= DASHED FOR CLARW EXISTING AT&T ICEBRIDGE
iﬁ . / o
= — EXISTING SPRINT a Vg
\\ 1y
= & EQUIPMENT ON I D \ o
B CONCRETE PAD e
EXISTING 176'—0" =
MONOPOLE ' ~ POWER °
7/ Z\\
= EXISTING ICEBRIDGE J N
BY OTHERS (TYP.) / . .
a =
EXISTING T—MOBILE o UMTS o= y
EQUIPMENT ON CABINET N PURCELL
CONCRETE PAD \\ A RxAT ‘ ﬁ//l/ CABINET
= L EXISTING METRO PCS CABINET
I EQUIPMENT CABINET 4
/ /i 1 \
/q Ty
<
‘ 5 < <
s A
o FMB,/DC6
> ./ (5) COAX (TO BE REMOVED) 4 g 4 ] / STACKED ITIS A VIOLATION OF LAW FOR ANY PERSON UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING
EXISTING AT&T (6) COAX, (1) FIBER & (2) DC . - RIS DOGUMENT. DNLESS, EXSLITLY AGREED 10 BY The ENGINEER IN
\CERRIDGE WO T ENGNELR DISa S AL LABLITY, ASSOORTED Wt THE
\ POWER (TOREMAIN/ < D < REUSE, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF THE CONTENTS HEREIN.
\ A
e — \ o | ) 1
' 1 * ==
> o - PURCELL
EXISTING NEXTEL CABINET
‘ E EQUIPMENT SHELTER
=<
EXISTING
S
| lo iza= : . DC12
—_— = RET CABINET
PROPOSED (2) 4478 B14 RRU
X X X X X X MOUNTED TO NEW H-FRAME (6) EXISTING OVERHEAD MOUNTED DIPLEXERS
(TO BE REMOVED AND REPLACED WITH
PROPOSED DC12 DBCT108F1V92-1 DIPLEXERS)
SITE NAME:
EAST HAVEN

SITE NUMBER:
CT5184

SITE ADDRESS:

108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471

EQUIPMENT PLAN
SCALE: 1/2" = 1'=0" (22"X34")

COMPOUND PLAN
SCALE: 1/8" = 1'=0" (22"X34")

PROJECT TYPE:
LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

e = o (e 2 1o (o
SHEET TITLE:
GRAPHIC SCALE GRAPHIC SCALE COMPOUND & EQUIPMENT PLANS
8 0 4 8 16 32 2 Q 1 2 4 8
e e e — e e e — N
( IN FEET ) ( IN FEET ) o




EXISTING CARR

ANTENNA, BY OTHERS

EXISTING 77
(TYP OF 1 PER SECTOR,

NOTES:

1. REFERENCE STRUCTURAL ANALYSIS BY
OTHERS FOR FURTHER INFORMATION
REGARDING THE CAPACITY OF THE
EXISTING STRUCTURE TO SUPPORT
THIS EQUIPMENT UPGRADE.

IER

(TO BE REMOVED)

70 ANTENNA ALPHA SECIOR ALPHA SECTOR
TOTAL OF 3) UMTS 850 LTE 1900
40° 40°

EXISTING HPA-65R—-BUU—H6 ANTENNA
(TYP OF 1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3)
(TO BE RELOCATED)

. -
$ EEEV.OF 0 %@TONHG JOAVéELR = 2. REFER TO THE FINAL RF DATA SHEET
: - Bl FOR FINAL ANTENNA SETTINGS.
EXISTING CARRIER
ANTENNA, BY OTHERS i 1 |1 EXISTING
PROPOSED HANDRAIL KIT RELOCATED LTE ANTENNA DL6-48—60—-18=8F
I SITEPRO-1 P/N: HRK14 HPA-65R-BUU-H6 (TOTAL OF 1)
(1PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3) (TO BE RELOCATED TE;
T POSITION 3
C.L. OF PROPOSED ANTENNAS m I EXISTING DIPLEXERS (TYP OF
ELEV: 157 -0" £ AGL = ‘ 2 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 6)
PROPOSED LTE ANTENNA (TO BE REMO\/ED)
/I M DMPE5R-BUEDA
— (1PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3) — == GAMMA SECTOR
SEE ENLARGED ANTENNA B ‘T LTE 700/1900 BEJ I\Anig(ég%R
ELEVATION ON THIS PAGE - - ‘ ‘ 270" =— \ 60"
CENTER OF PROPOSED I
/7 U @LT&TANTENNAS - ‘ A = ‘ EXISTING RRUS—11 B12
EXISTING CARRIER ELEV. 157'0" {AGL) \ i ‘ T \ (TYP OF 1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3)
ANTENNA, BY OTHERS —_ — (TO BE REMOVED)
H . ‘ | GAMMA SECTOR
L PROPOSED 4449 B5/B12 RRUS ‘ i [ [l | UMTS 850 -
EXISTING 176 -0 MOUTNED BEHIND ANTENNA ‘ \ 270°
MONOPOLE (1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3) \ ‘ \ BETA SECTOR
| | LTE 1900
| | | e
/ EXISTING RRUS—12 B2 + RRUS—A2
PROPOSED 8843 B2/B66A RRUS B25 (TYP OF 1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL
MOUNTED BEHIND ANTENNA OF 3) (TO BE REMOVED)
(1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3)
SCALE: N.T.S SCALE: N.T.S
UMTS
PROPOSED 8843 B2/B66 RRUS 850/700(B14)/PCS

(3) COAX (TO BE REMOVED)
(6) COAX, (1) FIBER & (2) DC\
POWER (TO REMAIN,

PROPOSED 4449 B5/B12 RRUS
. OF 1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3)

GAMMA SECTOR
LTE
700(BC)/850/AWS
270°

EXISTING
DC6—48—60—18—B8F
(TOTAL OF 1)

GAMMA SECTOR
UMTS

PROPOSED ADJUSTABLE CLAMP PLATE W UMTS
L J ASSEMBLY SITEPRO—1 P/N: PUCK 850/70§)é(B)}4)/PCS
W 1 (2 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 6)
ﬂ D a S = G%@BON,,D +LEX&¢ PROPOSED 2" STD PIPE \ BETAL-Q%EECTOR
' - 5 ETBY; EOFN% 700(BC)/850/AWS
TOWER ELEVATION GRAPHIC SCALE 160
SCALE: 3/32" = 1'—0" (22”X34") ' R il i PROPOSED ANTENNA CONFIGURATION
3/64” = 1'=-0" (ﬂ”XWT’) ( IN FEET ) SCALE: N.T.S

(TYP. OF 1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3)

40°
RELOCATED HPA—65R—BUU—HBANTENNA

(TYP OF 1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3)

PROPQOSED HANDRAIL KIT
SITEPRO-1 P/N: HRK14

A PROPOSED ROTATE EXISITNG ANTENNA
MOUNT TO MATCH LTE AZIMUTH (TYP)
ALPHA SECTOR
LTE 700(BC)/850/AWS
40°
PROPOSED DMP65R—-BUBDA
ANTENNA
(TYP. OF 1 PER SECTOR,
TOTAL OF 3)
oz
S

PROPOSED DUAL RRU MOUNT
(TYP OF 1 PER SECTOR,
TOTAL OF 3)

ETA SECTOR

TRUE NORTH

TRUE NORTH

& atat

at&t MOBILITY CORP.
500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

750 W CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
PHONE: 781.713.4725

REVISIONS

2 103/15/21 CONSTRUCTION REVISED
1101/25/21|ISSUED FOR CONSTRUCTION
0 [12/15/20 ISSUED FOR REVIEW
NO.| DATE DESCRIPTION
DESIGNED BY: APPROVED BY:

SS DC

IT IS A VIOLATION OF LAW FOR ANY PERSON UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING
UNDER THE DIRECTION OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENCINEER TO ALTER
THIS DOCUMENT. UNLESS EXPLICITLY AGREED TO BY THE ENGINEER IN
WRITING, THE ENCINEER DISCLAMS ALL LIABILITY ASSOCIATED WITH THE
REUSE, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF THE CONTENTS HEREIN.

SITE NAME:
EAST HAVEN

SITE NUMBER:
CT5184

SITE ADDRESS:

108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471

PROJECT TYPE:
LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

SHEET TITLE:
ANTENNA LAYOUT & ELEVATIONS
DRAWING #A 2 REVISION:




ANTENNA SCHEDULE
EXISTING/ SIZE (INCHES) | ANTENNA ™A/ SIZE ( INCHES) RAYCA
SECTOR | proPOSED BAND ANTENNA (Lx W x D) |G HEIGHT | AZMUTH DIPLEXER RRU (L x W x D) FEEDER P
RELOCATED
UMTS (1) (P() (1) 4478 Bl4 RR)US 18.1x13.4x8.26 | (E) (2) 1-5/8” HPA_GsR_BUUg%gggm
Al EXISTING HPA—65R—BUU—H6 | 72.0X14.8X9.0 | +157’ 40 DBCT108F1V92-1 GROUND MOUNTED : 20, - -
850,/700(B14)/PCS 1 PER SECTOR, TOTAL OF 3
/700(B14)/ (GROUND) (P) (1) 8843 B2/B66A RRUS 14.9X13.2X10.9 COAX CABLES f: )
B B B B B B B B B B B 12"
MIN.
PROPOSED
- - - - - - - - - - - 8843 B2/B66A RRU
@ POSITION 1 (1 PER
SECTOR)
LTE 700 ,
A4 PROPOSED DMP65R—-BUBDA 71.2X20.7X7.7 +157 40° - (P) (1) 4449 B5/B12 RRUS 15%13.2x10.4 - L
(BC)/850/AWS - T
1) (P) (1) 4478 B14 RRUS AT i
UMTS , . ( 18.1x13.4x8.26 £) (2) 1-5/8” e
1| EXSTNG | g50/700(314)/pCs | WPAZESR-BU-HG | 7201149100 | #157 | 160" | DBCTIOSFIVSe-1 | " (GROUND MOUNTED) 1o aioaxs e | © 2 18 | AN |
P) (1) 8843 B2/B66A RRUS ) ) ) LG IR 2=
O [
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ Y - ———— 7 > T
/ g?
EXISTING DUAL RRU =8
- - - - - - - - - - - MOUNT (1 PER SECTOR)
LTE 700 ,
B4 PROPOSED DMP65R—-BUGBDA 71.2X20.7X7.7 +157 160° - (P) (1) 4449 B5/B12 RRUS 15x13.2x10.4 - EXISTING T SECTOR
(BC)/850/AWS FRAME PIPE
1) SHARED 4478 B14 RRUS
UMTS ( - (E) (2) 1-5/8"
C1 EXISTING HPA—65R—BUU—HB | 72.0X14.8X9.0 +157° 270° DBCT108F1V92-1 (GROUND MOUNTED) -= " /
850/700(B14)/PCS (GROUND) (P) (1) 8843 B2/B66A RRUS | 14-9X13.2X10.9 COAX CABLES EX‘ST‘NSQ”Zlé/N?; PC)\#DE
L
- - - - - - - - - - - 00
a
S
ox
< |
E) (2) DC - fe}
. . _ _ _ _ _ . _ _ L@oe | g2l ANTENNA & RRU MOUNTING DETAIL
FIBER o
+ N.T.S.
G
c4 PROPOSED LTE 700 DMP65R-BU6SDA | 71.2X20.7X7.7 ’ 270° (P) (1) 4449 B5/B12 RRUS 15%13.2x10.4 s
(BC)/850/AWS - . S7RY. 1157 - x13.2x10. - 2
3* GALVANIZED RICID PROPOSED LTE ANTENNA
DMPE5R-BUGDA
RRU CHART EXISTING ICE STEEL PIPE (TYP.) @ POSITION 4
QUANTITY MODEL L W D CANOPY 30" (1 PER SECTOR)
3(P) |4449 B5/B12 » ” ” . —
(®) / 1507 1327 | 10.4 £ g8 1-5/8" UNISTRUT
2(P) |4478 B14 18.1”7 | 13.4” | 8.3 == B3 (TYP.) 12"
3(P) |8843 B2/BBGA | 14.9” | 13.2” | 10.9” I ! PROPOSED VN
[ |
% 4449 B5/B12 RRU
x =
EXISTING/PROPOSED /F IN_ propostD . > & POSITION 4
TRAPEZE KIT DIPLEXER (TYP < “E23 (1 PER SECTOR)
SITEPRO—1 P/N: A24K—3 [ L] % = aZEs
NOTE: ) OR EQUAL —1 28
MOUNT PER MANUFACTURER’S SPECIFICATIONS. N n zZg /
© ‘- = T T i
S AL | B
N.T.S. © L L
L =1 T
BUSS BAR [ #2 AWG STRANDED i =
NOTES: - [ g7 of - 1 COPPER GREEN et
——= J— - ] INSULATED GROUND oF
1.  REFERENCE STRUCTURAL ANALYSIS BY PROPOSED DUAL RRU =
OTHERS FOR FURTHER INFORMATION #2 TINNED SOLID ——| MOUNT {1 PER SECTOR)
REGARDING THE CAPACITY OF THE COPPER GROUND WIRE
EXISTING STRUCTURE TO SUPPORT
THIS EQUIPMENT UPGRADE. EXISTING T SECTOR
FRAME PIPE
2. REFER TO THE FINAL RF DATA SHEET 1/4 FINISH GRADE
FOR FINAL ANTENNA SETTINGS. ¢ x /
- jCB/}ﬁSUPPORT POST . N EXISTING 2-3/8” 0.D.
- — oL 72” LONG PIPE
o[ =] T—PL 1/2"x8™x8" W/ \ 4" (MIN.) I —
(4) 9/16" DIA. HOLES f—
‘ 5 ‘ FOR (4) 1/2" DIA. “
REFER TO THE FINAL RFDS AND TABLE ] HILTI HY150 (MIN 4
FOR THE PROPOSED RRUS MODEL, 8" EMBED. 4 1 2,.> ’ e s -
RRUS DETAIL QUANTITY, AND DIMENSIONS : / 1"=0
BASE DETAIL ON CONC. PAD (TYP.)
N.T.S. H—FRAME DETAIL ANTENNA & RRU MOUNTING DETAIL

N.T.S.

N.T.S.

b P
= atat
|

7~ét’&t MOBILITY CORP.

500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

750 W CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
PHONE: 781.713.4725

REVISIONS

N

03/15/21 CONSTRUCTION REVISED
01/25/21I1SSUED FOR CONSTRUCTION

0 12/15/20 ISSUED FOR REVIEW

NO.| DATE DESCRIPTION

DESIGNED BY: APPROVED BY:
SS DC

IT IS A VIOLATION OF LAW FOR ANY PERSON UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING
UNDER THE DIRECTION OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER TO ALTER
THIS DOCUMENT. UNLESS EXPLICITLY AGREED TO BY THE ENGINEER IN
WRITING, THE ENGINEER DISCLAMS ALL LIABILITY ASSOCIATED WITH THE
REUSE, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF THE CONTENTS HEREIN

SITE NAME:
EAST HAVEN

SITE NUMBER:
CT5184

SITE ADDRESS:

108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471

PROJECT TYPE:
LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

SHEET TITLE:
DETAILS
DRAWING #A 5 REVISION:




STRUCTURAL NOTES:

1.

DESIGN REQUIREMENTS ARE PER STATE BUILDING CODE AND APPLICABLE SUPPLEMENTS,
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, EIA/TIA—222—G STRUCTURAL STANDARDS FOR STEEL ANTENNA,
TOWERS AND ANTENNA SUPPORTING STRUCTURES.

CONTRACTOR SHALL VERIFY ALL DIMENSIONS AND CONDITIONS IN THE FIELD PRIOR TO
FABRICATION AND ERECTION OF ANY MATERIAL. ANY UNUSUAL CONDITIONS SHALL BE
REPORTED TO THE ATTENTION OF THE CONSTRUCTION MANAGER AND ENGINEER OF RECORD.

DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION OF STRUCTURAL STEEL SHALL CONFORM TO THE AMERICAN
INSTITUTE OF STEEL CONSTRUCTION "SPECIFICATION FOR THE DESIGN, FABRICATION AND
ERECTION OF STRUCTURAL STEEL FOR BUILDINGS".

STRUCTURAL STEEL SHALL CONFORM TO ASTM A992 (Fy=50 ksi), MISCELLANEOUS STEEL
SHALL CONFORM TO ASTM A36 UNLESS OTHERWISE INDICATED.

STEEL PIPE SHALL CONFORM TO ASTM A500 "COLD—FORMED WELDED & SEAMLESS CARBON
STEEL STRUCTURAL TUBING", GRADE B, OR ASTM A53 PIPE STEEL BLACK AND HOT-DIPPED
ZINC—COATED WELDED AND SEAMLESS TYPE E OR S, GRADE B. PIPE SIZES INDICATED ARE
NOMINAL. ACTUAL OUTSIDE DIAMETER IS LARGER.

STRUCTURAL CONNECTION BOLTS SHALL BE HIGH STRENGTH BOLTS (BEARING TYPE) AND
CONFORM TO ASTM A325 TYPE—X "HIGH STRENGTH BOLTS FOR STRUCTURAL JOINTS,
INCLUDING SUITABLE NUTS AND PLAIN HARDENED WASHERS”. ALL BOLTS SHALL BE 3/4” DIA
UON.

ALL STEEL MATERIALS SHALL BE GALVANIZED AFTER FABRICATION IN ACCORDANCE WITH ASTM
A123 "ZINC (HOT—DIP GALVANIZED) COATINGS ON IRON AND STEEL PRODUCTS”, UNLESS
OTHERWISE NOTED.

ALL BOLTS, ANCHORS AND MISCELLANEOUS HARDWARE SHALL BE GALVANIZED IN ACCORDANCE
WITH ASTM A153 "ZINC—COATING (HOT—DIP) ON IRON AND STEEL HARDWARE”, UNLESS
OTHERWISE NOTED.

FIELD WELDS, DRILL HOLES, SAW CUTS AND ALL DAMAGED GALVANIZED SURFACES SHALL BE
REPAIRED WITH AN ORGANIC ZINC REPAIR PAINT COMPLYING WITH REQUIREMENTS OF ASTM
A780. GALVANIZING REPAIR PAINT SHALL HAVE 65 PERCENT ZINC BY WEIGHT, ZIRP BY
DUNCAN GALVANIZING, GALVA BRIGHT PREMIUM BY CROWN OR EQUAL. THICKNESS OF APPLIED
GALVANIZING REPAIR PAINT SHALL BE NOT NOT LESS THAN 4 COATS (ALLOW TIME TO DRY
BETWEEN COATS) WITH A RESULTING COATING THICKNESS REQUIRED BY ASTM A123 OR A153
AS APPLICABLE.

. CONTRACTOR SHALL COMPLY WITH AWS CODE FOR PROCEDURES, APPEARANCE AND QUALITY

OF WELDS, AND FOR METHODS USED IN CORRECTING WELDING. ALL WELDERS AND WELDING
PROCESSES SHALL BE QUALIFIED IN ACCORDANCE WITH AWS "STANDARD QUALIFICATION
PROCEDURES”. ALL WELDING SHALL BE DONE USING E70XX ELECTRODES AND WELDING SHALL
CONFORM TO AISC AND DII. WHERE FILLET WELD SIZES ARE NOT SHOWN, PROVIDE THE
MINIMUM SIZE PER TABLE J2.4 IN THE AISC "STEEL CONSTRUCTION MANUAL". 14TH EDITION.

. INCORRECTLY FABRICATED, DAMAGED OR OTHERWISE MISFITTING OR NON—-CONFORMING

MATERIALS OR CONDITIONS SHALL BE REPORTED TO THE CONSTRUCTION MANAGER PRIOR TO
REMEDIAL OR CORRECTIVE ACTION. ANY SUCH ACTION SHALL REQUIRE CONSTRUCTION MANAGER
APPROVAL.

. UNISTRUT SHALL BE FORMED STEEL CHANNEL STRUT FRAMING AS MANUFACTURED BY

UNISTRUT CORP., WAYNE, MI OR EQUAL. STRUT MEMBERS SHALL BE 1 5/8"x1 5/87"x12GA,
UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED, AND SHALL BE HOT-DIP GALVANIZED AFTER FABRICATION.

. EPOXY ANCHOR ASSEMBLY SHALL CONSIST OF STAINLESS STEEL ANCHOR ROD WITH NUTS &

WASHERS. AN INTERNALLY THREADED INSERT, A SCREEN TUBE AND A EPOXY ADHESIVE. THE
ANCHORING SYSTEM SHALL BE THE HILTI-HIT HY—270 AND OR HY—200 SYSTEMS (AS
SPECIFIED IN DWG.) OR ENGINEERS APPROVED EQUAL.

. EXPANSION BOLTS SHALL CONFORM TO FEDERAL SPECIFICATION FF—-S-325, GROUP I, TYPE 4,

CLASS I, HILTI KWIK BOLT Il OR APPROVED EQUAL. INSTALLATION SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE
WITH THE MANUFACTURER’S RECOMMENDATIONS.

. LUMBER SHALL COMPLY WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE AMERICAN INSTITUTE OF TIMBER

CONSTRUCTION AND THE NATIONAL FOREST PRODUCTS ASSOCIATION'S NATIONAL DESIGN
SPECIFICATION FOR WOOD CONSTRUCTION. ALL LUMBER SHALL BE PRESSURE TREATED AND
SHALL BE STRUCTURAL GRADE NO. 2 OR BETTER.

. WHERE ROOF PENETRATIONS ARE REQUIRED, THE CONTRACTOR SHALL CONTACT AND

COORDINATE RELATED WORK WITH THE BUILDING OWNER AND THE EXISTING ROOF INSTALLER.
WORK SHALL BE PERFORMED IN SUCH A MANNER AS TO NOT VOID THE EXISTING ROOF
WARRANTY. ROOF SHALL BE WATERTIGHT.

. ALL FIBERGLASS MEMBERS USED ARE AS MANUFACTURED BY STRONGWELL COMPANY OF

BRISTOL, VA 24203. ALL DESIGN CRITERIA FOR THESE MEMBERS IS BASED ON INFORMATION
PROVIDED IN THE DESIGN MANUAL. ALL REQUIREMENTS PUBLISHED IN SAID MANUAL MUST BE
STRICTLY ADHERED TO.

. NO MATERIALS TO BE ORDERED AND NO WORK TO BE COMPLETED UNTIL SHOP DRAWINGS

HAVE BEEN REVIEWED AND APPROVED IN WRITING.

. SUBCONTRACTOR SHALL FIREPROOF ALL STEEL TO PRE-EXISTING CONDITIONS.

SPECIAL INSPECTIONS (REFERENCE IBC CHAPTER 17):

GENERAL: WHERE APPLICATION IS MADE FOR CONSTRUCTION, THE OWNER OR THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL
IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE ACTING AS THE OWNER’S AGENT SHALL EMPLOY ONE OR MORE APPROVED AGENCIES TO
PERFORM INSPECTIONS DURING CONSTRUCTION ON THE TYPES OF WORK LISTED IN THE INSPECTION CHECKLIST ABOVE.

THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE AND ENGINEERS OF RECORD INVOLVED IN THE
DESIGN OF THE PROJECT ARE PERMITTED TO ACT AS THE APPROVED AGENCY AND THEIR PERSONNEL ARE PERMITTED
TO ACT AS THE SPECIAL INSPECTOR FOR THE WORK DESIGNED BY THEM, PROVIDED THOSE PERSONNEL MEET THE

QUALIFICATION REQUIREMENTS.

STATEMENT OF SPECIAL INSPECTIONS: THE APPLICANT SHALL SUBMIT A STATEMENT OF SPECIAL INSPECTIONS PREPARED
BY THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 107.1 AS A

CONDITION FOR ISSUANCE. THIS STATEMENT SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION

1705.

REPORT REQUIREMENT: SPECIAL INSPECTORS SHALL KEEP RECORDS OF INSPECTIONS. THE SPECIAL INSPECTOR SHALL
FURNISH INSPECTION REPORTS TO THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, AND TO THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN
RESPONSIBLE CHARGE. REPORTS SHALL INDICATE THAT WORK INSPECTED WAS OR WAS NOT COMPLETED IN
CONFORMANCE TO APPROVED CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS. DISCREPANCIES SHALL BE BROUGHT TO THE IMMEDIATE
ATTENTION OF THE CONTRACTOR FOR CORRECTION. IF THEY ARE NOT CORRECTED, THE DISCREPANCIES SHALL BE
BROUGHT TO THE ATTENTION OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL AND TO THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN
RESPONSIBLE CHARGE. A FINAL REPORT DOCUMENTING REQUIRED SPECIAL INSPECTIONS SHALL BE SUBMITTED.

SPECIAL INSPECTION CHECKLIST

BEFORE CONSTRUCTION
CONSTRUCTION /INSTALLATION
INSPECTIONS AND TESTING
REQUIRED (COMPLETED BY
ENGINEER OF RECORD)

REPORT ITEM

ENGINEER OF RECORD APPROVED

N/A SHOP DRAWINGS '

MATERIAL SPECIFICATIONS
N/A REPORT 2
N/A FABRICATOR NDE INSPECTION
N/A PACKING SLIPS 3

ADDITIONAL TESTING AND INSPECTIONS:

DURING CONSTRUCTION
CONSTRUCTION /INSTALLATION
INSPECTIONS AND TESTING
REQUIRED (COMPLETED BY
ENGINEER OF RECORD)

REPORT ITEM

REQUIRED STEEL INSPECTIONS

N/A HIGH STRENGTH BOLT
INSPECTIONS

N/A HIGH WIND ZONE INSPECTIONS *

N/A FOUNDATION INSPECTIONS

N/A CONCRETE COMP. STRENGTH,
SLUMP TESTS AND PLACEMENT

N/A POST INSTALLED ANCHOR
VERIFICATION

N/A GROUT VERIFICATION

N/A CERTIFIED WELD INSPECTION

N/A EARTHWORK: LIFT AND DENSITY

N/A ON SITE COLD GALVANIZING
VERIFICATION

N/A GUY WIRE TENSION REPORT

ADDITIONAL TESTING AND INSPECTIONS:
AFTER CONSTRUCTION

CONSTRUCTION /INSTALLATION

INSPECTIONS AND TESTING

REQUIRED (COMPLETED BY
ENGINEER OF RECORD)

REPORT ITEM

MODIFICATION INSPECTOR REDLINE

REQUIRED OR RECORD DRAWINGS °
N/A POST INSTALLED ANCHOR
PULL—QUT TESTING
REQUIRED PHOTOGRAPHS

ADDITIONAL TESTING AND INSPECTIONS:

3.
4.

NOTES:

1.
2.

REQUIRED FOR ANY NEW SHOP FABRICATED FRP OR STEEL.
PROVIDED BY MANUFACTURER, REQUIRED IF HIGH STRENGTH
BOLTS OR STEEL.

PROVIDED BY GENERAL CONTRACTOR; PROOF OF MATERIALS.
HIGH WIND ZONE INSPECTION CATB 120MPH OR CAT C,D
110MPH INSPECT FRAMING OF WALLS, ANCHORING,
FASTENING SCHEDULE.

ADHESIVE FOR REBAR AND ANCHORS SHALL HAVE BEEN
TESTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ACI 355.4 AND ICC—-ES
AC308 FOR CRACKED CONCRETE AND SEISMIC
APPLICATIONS. DESIGN ADHESIVE BOND STRENGTH HAS
BEEN BASED ON ACI 355.4 TEMPERATURE CATEGORY B
WITH INSTALLATIONS INTO DRY HOLES DRILLED USING A
CARBIDE BIT INTO CRACKED CONCRETE THAT HAS CURED
FOR AT LEAST 21 DAYS. ADHESIVE ANCHORS REQUIRING
CERTIFIED INSTALLATIONS SHALL BE INSTALLED BY A
CERTIFIED ADHESIVE ANCHOR INSTALLER PER ACI 318-11
D.9.2.2. INSTALLATIONS REQUIRING CERTIFIED INSTALLERS
SHALL BE INSPECTED PER ACI 318-11 D.8.2.4.

AS REQUIRED; FOR ANY FIELD CHANGES TO THE ITEMS IN
THIS TABLE.

2.

3.

NOTES:

1.

ALL CONNECTIONS TO BE SHOP WELDED & FIELD BOLTED

USING 3/47"¢ A325—X BOLTS, UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTIFIED.

SHOP DRAWING ENGINEER REVIEW & APPROVAL REQUIRED
BEFORE ORDERING MATERIAL.

SHOP DRAWING ENGINEER REVIEW & APPROVAL REQUIRED
PRIOR TO STEEL FABRICATION.

VERIFICATION OF EXISTING ROOF CONSTRUCTION IS
REQUIRED PRIOR TO THE INSTALLATION OF THE ROQOF
PLATFORM. ENGINEER OF RECORD IS TO APPROVE EXISTING
CONDITIONS IN ORDER TO MOVE FORWARD.

CENTERLINE OF PROPOSED STEEL PLATFORM SUPPORT
COLUMNS TO BE CENTRALLY LOCATED OVER THE EXISTING
BUILDING COLUMNS.

EXISTING BRICK MASONRY COLUMNS/BEARING TO BE
REPAIRED/REPLACED AT ALL PROPQOSED PLATFORM
SUPPORT POINTS. ENGINEER OF RECORD TO REVIEW AND
APPROVE.

= atat

at&t MOBILITY CORP.
500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

750 W CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
PHONE: 781.713.4725

REVISIONS

2 |03/15/21 CONSTRUCTION REVISED
1 |01/25/21|ISSUED FOR CONSTRUCTION
0 [12/15/2Q ISSUED FOR REVIEW
NO.| DATE DESCRIPTION
DESIGNED BY: APPROVED BY:

SS DC

IT IS A VIOLATION OF LAW FOR ANY PERSON UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING
UNDER THE DIRECTION OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER TO ALTER
IS DOCUMENT. UNLESS EXPLICITLY AGREED TO BY THE_ENGINEER IN
WRITING, THE ENGINEER DISCLAIMS ALL LIABILITY ASSOCIATED WITH THE
REUSE, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF THE CONTENTS HEREIN

SITE NAME:
EAST HAVEN

SITE NUMBER:
CT5184

SITE ADDRESS:

108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471

PROJECT TYPE:
LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

SHEET TITLE:
STRUCTURAL NOTES

DRAWING é /‘ REVISION:




Br

CT5184_ ABC_LTE Multi Carrier_BrStd_Rev2.vsd

PLUMBING DIAGRAM
N.T.S.

|

at&t MOBILITY CORP.

500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

750 W CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
PHONE: 781.713.4725

REVISIONS

2 [03/15/21 CONSTRUCTION REVISED
1 01,/25/21ISSUED FOR CONSTRUCTION
0 [12/15/2 ISSUED FOR REVIEW

NO.| DATE DESCRIPTION

DESIGNED BY: APPROVED BY:

ss DC
Wiy,
W 7
\\ CON ‘y
NNof Ng 7,
Q 'y
RS C/\/ 7

*x =
P2) <Z\ \
%o S
7 $ N
//,/§5§/ ONAL E“Q\\\\\\
AT

ITIS A VIOLATION OF LAW FOR ANY PERSON UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING
UNDER THE DIRECTION OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER TO ALTER
THIS DOCUMENT. UNLESS EXPLICITLY AGREED TO BY THE ENGINEER IN

WRITING, THE ENGINEER DISCLAIMS ALL LIABILITY ASSOCIATED WITH THE
REUSE, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF THE CONTENTS HEREIN.

SITE NAME:
EAST HAVEN

SITE NUMBER:
CT5184

SITE ADDRESS:

108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471

PROJECT TYPE:
LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

SHEET TITLE:

RF PLUMBING DIAGRAM

DRAWING #: REVISION:
RF—1




FROM ANTENNA

WEATHERPROOFING
KIT (TYP.)

JUMPER REQUIRED ONLY
WHEN 1—1/4"8 AND LARGER

STANDARD
(ave.) GROUND KIT (TYP.)
ANTENNA CABLE
CONNECTOR
WEATHERPROOFING TO CABLE TRAY (TYP.)
KIT (TYP.) FROM ANTENNA
FRAME SUPPORT
COAX GROUND KIT
COMMSCOPE KIT NO. GB—0414—IT
OR EQUAL
#2 AWG BCW #2 AWG BCW, BONDED
NGTE: TO GROUND WIRE ALONG
: CABLE TRAY TO CIGBE/MIGB
1. DO NOT INSTALL CABLE GROUND KIT AT A BEND AND ALWAYS
DIRECT GROUND WIRE DOWN TO CIGBE.
N.T.S.
EXISTING/PROPOSED EXISTING/PROPOSED
ANTENNA SUPPORT ANTENNA
PIPE
TMA, RRU,
A2 MODULE &
SURGE ARRESTOR
UMTS/GSM COAX
GROUND KITS
UPPER CIGBE
EXISTING #26
HOMERUN -
; POWER /FIBER
GROUND CABLE TRAY LOWER CIGBE JUNCTION BOX
& ICE BRIDGE, (AS APPLICABLE) .- (AS APPLICABLE)

JUMPER ALL SPLICES

EXISTING (2) #2 AWG

BCW TO EXISTING UMTS/GSM COAX

GROUND RING \ GROUND KITS
o~ ;
EXISTING #2G ‘
(ROOFTOP ONLNi
UMTS /GSM  COAX \
GROUND KITS :
GROUND ICE N
BRIDGE POSTS F ”””””””””””
METER AND /~—————#2 GROUND TO EXISTING
DISCONNECT L HALO OR MIGBE
D — A d
_200/@_ \EX\ST\NG GROUND [~———EQUIPMENT CABINET
‘ RING OR UTILITY OR RACK, RBS 6601,
\ GROUND & SURGE SUPPRESSOR
L #2 AWG SOLID
= TINNED COPPER (TYP)
TO EXISTING

SERVICE GROUND

GROUNDING RISER DIAGRAM
N.T.S.

EACH GROUND CONDUCTOR TERMINATING ON ANY GROUND BAR SHALL HAVE

AN_IDENTIFICATION TAG ATTACHED AT EACH END THAT WILL IDENTIFY ITS
ORIGIN AND DESTINATION.

SECTION "P” — SURGE PRODUCERS

CABLE ENTRY PORTS (HATCH PLATES) (#2)

GENERATOR FRAMEWORK (IF AVAILABLE) (#2)

TELCO GROUND BAR

COMMERCIAL POWER COMMON NEUTRAL/GROUND BOND (#2)
+24V POWER SUPPLY RETURN BAR (#2)

—48V POWER SUPPLY RETURN BAR (#2)

RECTIFIER FRAMES.

SECTION "A" — SURGE ABSORBERS

INTERIOR GROUND RING (#2)

EXTERNAL EARTH GROUND FIELD (BURIED GROUND RING) (#2)
METALLIC COLD WATER PIPE (IF AVAILABLE) (#2)

BUILDING STEEL (IF AVAILABLE) (#2)

GROUND BAR DETAIL
N.T.S.

STAINLESS %\'O

STEEL TWO HOLE COPPER
HARDWARE o COMPRESSION TERMINAL
GROUNDING CABLE
Y GROUND BAR
ELEVATION “
LOCK WASHER, FLAT WASHER, TYP.
TYP. . .
3/8"x1—1/4" HEX
BOLT
NUT, TYP. 4
FLAT WASHER, TYP.
GROUND BAR
EXPOSED BARE COPPER TO BE
GROUNDING CABLE KEPT TO ABSOLUTE MINIMUM, NO
oy INSULATION ALLOWED WITHIN THE
SECTION "A-A" COMPRESSION TERMINAL (TYPICAL)

NOTE:

1. "DOUBLING UP” OR "STACKING” OF CONNECTION IS NOT PERMITTED.
2. OXIDE INHIBITING COMPOUND TO BE USED AT ALL LOCATION.
5. CADWELD DOWNLEADS FROM UPPER EGB, LOWER EGB, AND MGB

CROUND BAR CONNECTION DETAIL
N.T.S.

= atat

\ -
-y
at&t MOBILITY CORP.
500 ENTERPRISE DRIVE
ROCKY HILL, CT 06067

750 W CENTER ST, SUITE 301
WEST BRIDGEWATER, MA 02379
PHONE: 781.713.4725

REVISIONS

N

03/15/21 CONSTRUCTION REVISED

01/25/21ISSUED FOR CONSTRUCTION

0 [12/15/20 ISSUED FOR REVIEW

NO.| DATE DESCRIPTION
DESIGNED BY: APPROVED BY:
SS DC
CONN
QF V) VINIVE
\Cf

IT IS A VIOLATION OF LAW FOR ANY PERSON UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING
UNDER THE DIRECTION OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER TO ALTER
THIS DOCUMENT. UNLESS EXPLICITLY AGREED TO BY THE ENGINEER IN
WRITING, THE ENGINEER DISCLAIMS ALL LIABILITY ASSOCIATED WITH THE
REUSE, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF THE CONTENTS HEREIN.

SITE NAME:
EAST HAVEN

SITE NUMBER:
CT5184

SITE ADDRESS:

108 FOXON ROAD
NORTH BRANDFORD, CT 06471

PROJECT TYPE:
LTE 3C, 4C, 5G NR & RETRO

SHEET TITLE:
GROUNDING DETAILS
DRAWING # REVISION:

G—1






