
Project Description for Project No 301-0124, NHRY, MOW & Employee Parking – 6/27/13: 
 
The Facilities Design Unit filed an Environmental Review Form for acquiring the 1 Brewery 
Street property, for use in the New Haven Rail Yard Facilities Improvements program.  The Env. 
Rev. Request was sent August 20, 2012, the review received October 23, 2012. 
 
The Department coordinated with the City of New Haven in March, 2013 regarding this 
acquisition and the proposed project.  A Report of the March 13, 2013 meeting held with the 
City and the follow-up correspondence is attached. 
 
The property is currently in the process of being acquired, with a completion anticipated by July 
31, 2013.  This follow-up Environmental Review Request is being filed currently in support of the 
proposed project to be constructed on the acquired property. 
 
The proposed project consists of demolishing the existing freezer warehouse and constructing 
an approximately 20,000 square foot Maintenance of Way (MOW) facility to house the Metro-
North Railroad (MNR) personnel who maintain the main line and rail yard infrastructure.  This 
includes the Track, Structures, Power, and Communication & Signals (C&S) Departments.  The 
remainder of the property will be graded and paved for employee parking.  There are two 
options for constructing the building:  One reuses the existing building’s piles and floor slab 
(“Option C”), the second installs a completely new foundation (“Option D”).  The resulting 
building will be the same size and basic configuration. 
 
An additional future option which is being explored is to relocate existing Brewery Street, so that 
it runs through the center of the 1 Brewery Street property (“Option E”).  Although Option E 
shows the MOW building being constructed on new foundations, the Brewery Street location 
would work with either foundation option. 
 
The proposed Project 301-0124 would not relocate Brewery Street, however, it would be 
designed to accommodate a future relocation with minimal disruption of features constructed in 
Project 301-0124. 
 
The proposed Brewery Street relocation would also require acquiring a partial take from the 
IKEA property just east of the 1 Brewery Street property.  This would provide better geometry 
for the relocation and it appears that this segment of property has no practical use to the current 
owner since it is on the opposite side of a utility easement and pole line from their current 
establishment. 
 
Purpose and Need: 
 
The purpose of the project is to provide sufficient support facilities for the overall New Haven 
Rail Yard, as a part of the NHRY Facilities Improvement program.  The original program 
developed in 2006 included an MOW building and an employee parking garage within the rail 
yard property.  Based on subsequent developments in the State’s rail system (including 
introduction of New Haven – Hartford – Springfield service and purchase of an all new M8 
electric car fleet), and cost saving measures that eliminated the employee parking garage, it 
became necessary to seek other options for these activities.  The 1 Brewery Street property 
became available for sale on the real estate market, so the Department decided to purchase it 
for these functions. 
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