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The following organizations have contributed to this document. 
 
Sponsoring Agency: University of Connecticut 
  
Implementing Agencies: University of Connecticut Office of Environmental Policy 

Town of Mansfield, Connecticut 
 

A brief description of authors and contributors follows. 
 
The primary author of this Environmental Impact Evaluation is the consulting firm of: 

 
MILONE & MACBROOM, INC. 
99 Realty Drive 
Cheshire, Connecticut 06410 
(203) 271-1773 
 
Milone and MacBroom, Inc. is a professional consulting firm comprised of engineers, planners, 
environmental scientists, landscape architects, and surveyors.  A brief description and list of 
Milone and MacBroom, Inc. staff involved with the preparation of this document follows: 
 
David Murphy, P.E., CFM, Associate – Mr. Murphy has served as the project manager of this 
Environmental Impact Evaluation (EIE) as well as a technical contributor.  Mr. Murphy holds a 
Bachelor of Science degree in Geological Sciences and a Masters of Science degree in hydrology.  
He is a licensed professional engineer in the State of Connecticut.  Mr. Murphy has conducted 
and managed many environmental impact evaluations in Connecticut pursuant to the Connecticut 
Environmental Policy Act (CEPA).  His project experience includes water supply planning, new 
source development, regulatory permitting, water resource protection, and water system 
emergency response planning. 

 
Jeanine Armstrong Gouin, P.E., Vice President – Ms. Gouin has served as the project 
administrator and editor of this EIE.  She holds a Bachelor of Science degree in civil engineering 
and is a professional engineer licensed to practice in the State of Connecticut.  Ms. Gouin has 
conducted and managed many environmental impact evaluations in Connecticut pursuant to 
CEPA.  Her technical background has focused on water resources, water supply, ecological 
resources, and environmental permitting. 

  
Scott J. Bighinatti, Senior Environmental Scientist – Mr. Bighinatti has served as a primary 
author of this EIE and technical contributor.  He holds Bachelor of Science and Master of Science 
degrees in Natural Resources.  Mr. Bighinatti has notable expertise in hydrogeology, water supply 
planning, numerical modeling, and geographic information systems. 
 
William A. Root, Senior Environmental Scientist – Mr. Root has provided technical expertise in 
the areas of wetland and wildlife biology.  Mr. Root holds a Bachelor of Arts degree in Biology, a 
Bachelor of Science degree in Environmental Science, and a Master of Science degree in Forestry 
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and Environmental Studies.  He is a certified professional soil scientist with specific expertise in 
wetland science and biological resources. 
 
Matthew J. Sanford, Associate – Mr. Sanford has provided technical expertise in the areas of 
wetland and wildlife biology.  Mr. Sanford holds a Bachelor of Science degree in Natural 
Resource Management and a Master of Science degree in Wetland Biology.  He is a certified 
professional soil scientist and professional wetland scientist with specific expertise in wetland 
science and biological resources. 
 
George G. Caughman, P.E., Water/Wastewater Engineer – Mr. Caughman provided technical 
expertise on water utility upgrade design and cost estimation.  He holds Bachelor of Science 
degrees in Psychology and Mechanical Engineering and is a licensed professional engineer with 
over 30 years of experience.  His background includes construction inspection and design of 
potable water systems, pumping stations, sewage treatment plants, force mains, and power plants. 
 
Alex M. Cosentino, P.E., BCEE, Water/Wastewater Engineer – Mr. Cosentino provided technical 
expertise for infrastructure design and cost estimation.  He holds a Bachelor of Science degree in 
Environmental Engineering and is a licensed professional engineer in the State of Connecticut.  
His background includes a wide range of design and construction experience in public sector 
development. 
 
Thomas Knowlton, P.E., BCEE, Water/Wastewater Engineer – Mr. Knowlton provided technical 
expertise for infrastructure design and cost estimation.  He holds a Bachelor of Science degree in 
Civil Engineering and is a licensed professional engineer in the State of Connecticut.  His 
background includes a wide range of design and construction experience in water and wastewater 
projects. 
 
Tracy Bloch, E.I.T., LEED, Civil / Structural Engineer – Ms. Bloch provided technical expertise 
related to infrastructure design and cost estimation.  She holds a Bachelor of Science degree in 
Civil Engineering and is an Engineer-In-Training in the State of Connecticut.  Her background 
includes a wide range of civil and structural projects. 
 
Michael Zuba, AICP, Senior Land Use Planner – Mr. Zuba has contributed to the analysis of land 
use, socioeconomics, and community facilities and services.  Mr. Zuba holds Bachelor of Science 
and Master of Science degrees in Environmental Science and is a certified land use planner. 
 
Additional technical support was provided by the following individuals: 

 
 Rebecca Augur, AICP, Land Use Planner 
 Becky Meyer, E.I.T., Water Resources Engineer 
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