From: Traverso. John

To: User, OHCA

Cc: Maloney, Paul; Foster, Tillman
Subject: Natchaug and Annual filing

Date: Thursday, July 06, 2017 11:47:38 AM

This is confirmation that Natchaug Hospital does not charge/bill any facility fees for outpatient
services at locations outside the campus.

This is consistent with prior year .
Let me know if you have questions.

Thank you

John Traverso

Director, Corporate Reimbursement
Hartford HealthCare

(860) 696 6246

John.Traverso@hhchealth.org

This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure, or distribution is prohibited. If you
are not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering the message to the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message, including any

attachments.
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