
From: Emily Gianquinto <emily@eaglawllc.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 2, 2020 1:13 PM 
To: Fontaine, Lisa <Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov> 
Cc: Bachman, Melanie <Melanie.Bachman@ct.gov> 
Subject: Re: Petition for declaratory ruling filed by FairWindCT, Inc., Julia and Jonathan Gold, and Grant 
Swamp Group 

 

Team, see below. It sounds like the fee associated with the petition will run higher than expected. 

I need to dig into the regs on this, but it’s a good thing we didn’t request a hearing I suppose. Yet 

another example of how this whole system is rigged.  

 

 

Emily A. Gianquinto, Esq. 
emily@eaglawllc.com 
P: 860.785.0545 
F: 860.838.9027 

21 Oak Street, Suite 601 
Hartford, CT 06106 

 

 

On Tue, Jun 2, 2020 at 12:40 PM Fontaine, Lisa <Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov> wrote: 

The Town of New Milford paid over $3000 inclusive of the filing fee. 

  

From: Emily Gianquinto <emily@eaglawllc.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 2, 2020 11:41 AM 
To: Fontaine, Lisa <Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov> 
Cc: Bachman, Melanie <Melanie.Bachman@ct.gov> 
Subject: Re: Petition for declaratory ruling filed by FairWindCT, Inc., Julia and Jonathan Gold, and Grant 
Swamp Group 

  

I see. Thank you. Is there any chance you could tell me what the Town of New Milford paid in 

association with Petition #1362? 

 

 

 

Emily A. Gianquinto, Esq. 
emily@eaglawllc.com 
P: 860.785.0545 
F: 860.838.9027 

21 Oak Street, Suite 601 
Hartford, CT 06106 
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On Tue, Jun 2, 2020 at 11:29 AM Fontaine, Lisa <Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov> wrote: 

The filing fee is applied to the direct costs.  For example, if $1,000 of staff hours accrued, the $625 filing 
fee (upfront payment) would first be applied, then the balance would be invoiced (in this case 
$375).  During the pandemic, instead of collecting the filing fee upfront, the Council is just direct 
charging. It amounts to the same cost which is the total direct charges associated with a petition. 

  

  

From: Emily Gianquinto <emily@eaglawllc.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 2, 2020 10:50 AM 
To: Fontaine, Lisa <Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov> 
Cc: Bachman, Melanie <Melanie.Bachman@ct.gov> 
Subject: Re: Petition for declaratory ruling filed by FairWindCT, Inc., Julia and Jonathan Gold, and Grant 
Swamp Group 

  

The filing fee is fixed though, isn't it? I was referring to the filing fee.  

 

 

 

Emily A. Gianquinto, Esq. 
emily@eaglawllc.com 
P: 860.785.0545 
F: 860.838.9027 

21 Oak Street, Suite 601 
Hartford, CT 06106 

  

  

On Tue, Jun 2, 2020 at 10:17 AM Fontaine, Lisa <Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov> wrote: 

Petitions are invoiced based on direct cost charges associated with the project; and you will be 

invoiced on the direct charges associated with this project.  

  

  

mailto:Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov
mailto:emily@eaglawllc.com
mailto:Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov
mailto:Melanie.Bachman@ct.gov
mailto:emily@eaglawllc.com
mailto:Lisa.Fontaine@ct.gov
http://eaglawllc.com/


From: Emily Gianquinto <emily@eaglawllc.com>  
Sent: Monday, June 1, 2020 2:53 PM 
To: Bachman, Melanie <Melanie.Bachman@ct.gov>; CSC-DL Siting Council <Siting.Council@ct.gov> 
Cc: Hoffman, Lee D. <lhoffman@pullcom.com>; Christopher R. Bernard <bernacr@nu.com>; Joaquina 
Borges King <borgej@nu.com>; Colebrook <tommckeon@colebrooktownhall.org>; David R. Lawrence, 
MD/Jeannie Lemelin, LPN <wnstddoc@yahoo.com>; Walter Zima/Brandy Grant 
<blkmgrant@yahoo.com>; Paul Corey <pcorey@bneenergy.com>; morisjr@nu.com; David Cusick 
<dmc@hlf.com>; Eva Villanova <evaraku@aol.com>; Benjamin and Kristin M. Mow <kmow@hcc-
global.com>; Sukey Wagner <sukeyonly@gmail.com>; casasomers@aol.com; Patrick Power 
<pep@hlf.com>; mayorwinsted@gmail.com; firstselectman@norfolkct.org; Keith Ainsworth 
<keithrainsworth@live.com>; jim@jasperdesign.com 
Subject: Petition for declaratory ruling filed by FairWindCT, Inc., Julia and Jonathan Gold, and Grant 
Swamp Group 

  

Melanie: 

  

My clients, FairWindCT, Inc., Jonathan and Julia Gold, and the Grant Swamp Group, hereby file 

the attached petition for declaratory ruling and exhibits file. A single hard copy is on its way for 

the Council's files per the current restrictions on hard copy filings.   

  

I understand that the Council is not currently accepting filing fees; if that has changed, please 

let me know and I will send in the fee. If not, I will send it as soon as the Council is able to 

process fees again.  

  

Please let me know if you have any questions.  

  

 

Emily A. Gianquinto, Esq. 
emily@eaglawllc.com 
P: 860.785.0545 
F: 860.838.9027 

21 Oak Street, Suite 601 
Hartford, CT 06106 
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